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. . ‘) US.DISTRICT COURT
RTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS -
FIL. -
UNITED STATES DISTRICT COU+T SEP - 8 2004
O R | A L NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION CL US. DISTRICT
)
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC. § Deputy —
§
Plaintiff, §
§ CIVIL ACTION NO.
§ 3-01-CV-0127-R
v. §
§
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO., §
§
Defendant. §

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

TO THE HONORABLE UNITED STATES JUDGE JERRY BUCHMEYER:

NOW COMES Piaintiff Golden Blount, Inc. (hereinafter “Golden Blount”) to file this its
Application for Attorneys’ Fees (hereinafter “the Application”) against Robert H. Peterson Co.
(heremafter “Robert H. Peterson”), and would show the Court as follows:

1. On August 9, 2002, the Court in the above-styled action issued its Final Judgment
and Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law, finding for Golden Blount on all issues. Among
other things, the Court determined that Robert H. Peterson willfully infringed the Blount Patent.
The Court further found that this was an “exccptional case,” warranting an award of attormeys’
fees to Golden Blount.

2. Pursuant to 35 U.S.C. § 285, the Court found an exceptional case at issue and
granted an award of reasonable attoneys’ fee$ to Golden Blount as the prevailing party. Golden
Blount is entitled to attorneys’ fees for hours spent litigating the infringement action,

3 However, after an appeal, and on April 19, 2004, the United States Court of

Appeals for the Federal Circuit found the patent not to be invalid, affirmed this Court’s claim

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS® FEES —
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construction, found that Robert H. Peterson had waived the issue of inequitable conduct, and
remanded the case back to this Court to issue more specific findings regarding infringement,
willfulness, exceptional nature of the case, and the damage amount.

4. Thereafter, on May 11, 2004, this Court ordered all parties to submit proposed
findings of fact and conclusions of law on the issues of literal infringement, contributory
infringement, induced infringement, infringement under the doctrine of equivalents, willfulness,
the exceptional nature of the case, and damages.

5. On June 22, 2004, this Court adopted Robert H. Peterson’s Findings of Fact and
Conclusions of Law.

6. On August 18, 2004, after an hour and forty minute oral hearing, this Court
vacated Robert H. Peterson’s Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law previously adopted on
June 22, 2004, and adopted Golden Blount’s Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law. The
Court then requested that Golden Blount submit updated Findings of Fact and Conclusions of
Law, of which were submitted on August 31, 2004.

7. On September 2, 2004, this Court adopted the Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law submitted on August 31, 2004. In the Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law adopted
on September 2, 2004, this Court found that this was an “exceptional case” warranting an award
of attorneys’ fees to Golden Blount pursuant to 35 U.S.C. § 285.

8. Golden Blount now seeks to recover attorneys’ fees in the amount of
$622,015.00. The Affidavits of Charles W. Gaines, William D. Harris, Jr. and Roy W. Hardin
(which are a part of the Appendix being filed simultaneously herewith) support this figure.
These Affidavits address the reasonableness and necessity of attorneys’ fees sought by Golden

Blount in this case, the prevailing hourly rates in the Dallas legal community for such services,

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS® FEES -
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and certain costs of this litigation. For the Court’s convenience, summary charts, by law firm,
detailing the lawyers and paralegals, their rates, hours, and totals, are attached to this
Application. Furthermore, the 2001 American Intellectual Property Law Association (AIPLA)
Report of Economic Survey, providing average billing rates by location of practice and years of
experience, is further evidence of the reasonablencss of attorneys’ fees in this case.

9. Golden Blount has not included in this Application and is not currently secking
recovery of the fees incurred in preparing and submitting this request for an award of attorneys’
fees and costs. However, Golden Blount respectfully reserves the right to seek leave of court to
amend this Application in order to claim such fees in the event this proceeding becomes
unnecessarily adversarial. Furthermore, Golden Blount specifically reserves the right to request
attorneys’ fees for motions on which the Court has yet to issue a ruling, as well as any motions
filed in the future, including any motion for alteration of judgment and motion for new trial.

10. Additionally, Golden Blount requests that this Court award Golden Blount post
judgment interest on such attorneys” fees and costs in an amount allowed by law from August 9,
2002, to April 19, 2004, and resuming on September 2, 2004,

li.  Golden Blount’s Memorandum in Support of Golden Blount, Inc.’s Application
for Attorneys’ Fees in being filed simultaneously with this Application, and is incorporated
herein for all purposes. Golden Blount simultaneously with the filing of this Application is also
submitting its Bill of Costs seeking the recovery of taxable costs in this matter.

WHEREFORE, PREMISES CONSIDERED, Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc. requests
that this Court grant its Application for Attorneys’ Fees, and award them, as against Robert H.

Peterson, Co., reasonable attorneys’ fees in the amount of $622,015.00, plus post judgment

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES -
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interest at the highest lawful rate from August 9, 2002, to Apnl 19, 2004, and resurning on
September 2, 2004, and such other relief as the Court deems just and proper.
DATE: September &, 2004.
Respectfully submitted,

For Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc.

William D. Harris, Jr.
State Bar No. 09109000 _
SCHULTZ & ASSOCIATES, P.C.
5400 LBJ Freeway

One Lincoln Center, Suite 525
Dallas, Texas 75240
214/210-5940 (Telephone)
214/210-5941 (Facsimile)

Charles W. Gaines

State Bar No. 07570580
Greg H. Parker

State Bar No. 24011301
Hritr GAINES, P.C.

2435 North Central Plaza
Suite 1300

Richardson, Texas 75080
972/480-8800 (Telephone)
972/480-8865 (Facsimile)

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES —
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CERTIFICATE OF CONFERENCE

I hereby certify that on or about September 2, 2004, a conference was held with counsel
for Defendant, to determine whether agreement could be reached with regard to the relief sought
herein. As a result of such conference, agreement could not be reached: accordingly, the matter

is presented to the Court for determination.

William D. Harris, Jr. !

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that true and correct copies of Golden Blount, Inc.’s Application for
Attorneys’ Fees was each served upon the following counsel of record, via first class mail on

September 8, 2004.

Jerry R. Selinger

Jenkens & Gilchrist

1445 Ross Avenue, Suite 3200
Dallas, Texas 75202

(214) 855-4500

(214) 855-4300 (Facsimile)
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SUMMARY OF LOCKE, LIDDELL, & SAPP, LLP BILLING
(From January, 2000 to July, 2001)

FEE EARNER TOTAL HOURS BILLING RATE
L. Dan Tucker 1.90 $325.00

Monty L. Ross 1.50 $335.00

Roy W. Hardin 2275 $350.00 - $375.00
Michael W. Dubner 20.00 $135.00

Charles Phipps 34.00 $130.00

Total: 80.15 hours $18,967.50

SUMMARY OF HITT GAINES, P.C. BILLING
(From August, 2001 to June 10, 2004)

¥EE EARNER TOTAL HOURS BILLING RATE
William D. Harris, Jr. | 641.20 $350.00
Charles W. Gaines 202.80 $290.00
Charles W. Gaines 137.60 $£300.00
Greg H. Parker 965.10 $175.00
Greg H. Parker 170.90 $225.00
James Ortega 67.50 $175.00
Carol Garland 21.60 $75.00
(Paralegal)

Carol Garland 8.8 $90.00
(Paralegal)

Trudy McGruder 36.10 $65.00
(Paralegal)

Total: 2251.60 hours $548,428.00

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES —
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SUMMARY OF SCHULTZ & ASSOCIATES, P.C. BILLING
(From September, 2003 to June 10, 2004)

FEE EARNER TOTAL HOURS BILLING RATE
William D. Harnis, Jr. | 162.6 $325.00

John Pemberton 9.1 $195.00

Total: 171.7 hours $54,619.50

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES —
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William D. Hauris, Jr.
State Bar No. 09109000
SCHULTZ & ASSOCIATES, P.C.
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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALLAS DIVISION
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC. §
§ b
Plaintiff, §
§ CIVIL ACTION NO. 3-01-CV-0127-R
V. §
§
ROBERT H. PETERSON, 8§
§
Defendant. §

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S
APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEY’S FEES

L BACKGROUND

1. On August 9, 2002, the Court in the above-styled action issued its Final
Judgment and Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law, finding for Golden Blount, Inc.
(“Golden Blount”) on all issues. Among other things, the Court determined that Robert
H. Peterson Co. (“Robert H. Peterson™) wilfully infringed the Blount Patent. As such, the
court awarded Golden Blount treble damages based on Robert H. Peterson’s conduct
under the authority of 35 U.5.C. 284.

2. Pursuant to 35 U.S.C. § 285, the Court found an exceptional case at issue
and granted an award of reasonable attomeys’ fees to Golden Blount as the prevailing
party.

3. However, after an appeal, and on April 19, 2004, the United States Court
of Appeals for the Federal Circuit found the patent not to be invalid, affirmed this Court’s

claim construction, found that Robert H. Peterson had waived the issue of inequitable

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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conduct, and remanded the case back to this Court to issue more specific findings
regarding infringement, willfulness, exceptional nature of the case, and the damage
amount.

4, Thereafter, on May 11, 2004, this Court ordered all parties to submit
proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law on the issues of literal infringement,
contributory infringement, induced infringement, infringement under the doctrine of
equivalents, willfulness, the exceptional nature of the case, and damages.

5. On June 22, 2004, this Court adopted Robert H. Peterson’s Findings of
Fact and Conclusions of Law.

6. On August 18, 2004, after an hour and forty minute oral hearing, this
Court vacated Robert H. Peterson’s Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law previously
adopted on June 22, 2004, and adopted Golden Blount’s Findings of Fact and
" Conclusions of Law. The Court then requested that Golden Blount submit updated
Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law, of which were submitted on August 31, 2004.

7. On September 2, 2004, this Court adopted the Findings of Fact and

Conclusions of Law submitted on August 31, 2004. In the Findings of Fact and

Conclusions of Law adopted on September 2, 2004, this Court found that this was an
“exceptional case” warranting an award of attorneys’ fees to Golden Blount pursuant to
35 U.S.C. § 285. Accordingly, Golden Blount is entitled to attorneys’ fees for hours
spent litigating the infringement action consistent with the appropriate lodestar. See

Pennsylvania v. Delaware Valley Citizens Counsel for Clean Air, 478 U.S. 546, 564

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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(1986), on remand, 826 F.2d 238 (3™ Cir. 1987). See also Johnson v. Mississippi, 606
F.2d 635, 638-39 (5™ Cir. 1979).!

8. Additionally, in the Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law adopted on
September 2, 2004, this Court awarded Golden Blount post judgment interest on such
aftorneys’ fees and costs at the highest rate allowed by the law from August 9, 2002, to
April 19, 2004, and resuming on September 2, 2004. A district court has authority to
award post judgment interest on the unliquidated sum of an award made pursuant to 35
U.S.C. § 285. See 28 U.S.C. § 1961.

IL CALCULATION OF ATTORNEYS’ FEES

9. When a party to an infringement action prevails in an “exceptional case”
and has obtained excellent results, its attorneys’ fees recovery should be fully
compensatory. See generally Mathis v. Spears, 857 F.2d 749, 756 (Fed. Cir. 1988)
(quoting Hensley v. Eckerhart, 461 U.S. 424, 435 (1983)). See also Norris v. Hartmarx
Specialty Stores, Inc. 913 F.2d 253, 257 (5" Cir. 1990) (observing that the trial court did
not abuse its direction when it awarded fees for issues not tried). The party awarded fees
bears the bur_dcn of establishing entitlement to an award of attomeys’ fees, and also -
providing appropriate documentation of the hours expended and hourly rates. Louisiana
Power & Light Co. v. Kellstrom, 50 F.3d 319, 324 (5th Cir, 1995), cert. denied, 516 U.S.

862 (1995). The prevailing party must also show that billing judgment was exercised to

! Golden Blount has not included in this Application, and is not currently seeking recovery of the fees
incurred in preparing anrd submitting this request for an award of attomeys’ fees and costs, However,
Golden Blount respectfully reserves the right to seek leave of court to amend this Application in order to
claim such fees in the event this Application becomes unnecessarily adversarial. Furthermore, Golden
Blount specifically reserves the right to request attorneys’ fees for Motions on which the Court has yet to
issue 2 ruling, as well as any motions filed in the future, including any motion for alteration of judgment
and motion for new trial.

MEMORANDUM IN SUPFORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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assess the reasonable number of hours expended on a case. Green v. Administrators of
the Tulane Educational Fund, 284 F.3d 642, 662 (5™ Cir. 2002).
10.  The calculation of attorneys’ fees under 35 U.S.C. § 285 is govemned by
the precedent of the Federal Circuit. Pharmacia & Upjohn Co. v. Mylan Pharm., Inc.,
182 F.3d 1356, 1359 (Fed. Cir. 1999). The Federal Circuit has approved use of a lodestar
analysis in the calculation of reasonable attorneys’ fees. See Lam, Inc. v. Johns- Manville
Corp., 718 F.2d 1056, 1068 (Fed. Cir. 1983).2 The lodestar is the number of hours
reasonably expended multiplied by a reasonable hourly rate, and usually supplies an
objective basis on which to make an initial estimate of the value of the lawyer’s service.
Hensley, 461 U.S. at 433. “In determining the reasonableness of the award, there must be
.some evidence to support the reasonableness of, inter alia, the billing rate charged and the
number of hours expended.” Lam, 718 F.2d at 1068.
11.  Once determined, depending on the particular circumstances in the case
and the factors set forth in Johnson v. Georgia Highway Express, Inc., 488 F.2d 714,
717-19 (5™ Cir. 1974), the lodestar may be adjusted upward or downward. Delaware
Valley, 478 U.S. at 564. Because the lodestar is presumptively reasonable, it should be
| modified only in exceptional cases. Watkins v. Fordice, 7 F.3d 453, 457 (5™ Cir. 1993),
on remand, 852 F.Supp. 542 (S.D. Miss 1994), aff"d, 49 F.3d 728 (5™ Cir. 1995) (citing
City of Burlington v. Dague, 505 U.S. 557 (1992), on remand, 976 F.2d 801 (2™ Cir.

1991)).

? The Fifth Circuit also utilizes the lodestar method in calculating reasonable attorneys’ fees. Louisiana
Power & Light Co., 50 F.3d at 324.

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.S APPLICATION FOR
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12. The Johnson factors to be considered in reviewing the reasonableness of
the fee award are as follows:

(1) the time and labor required;

(2)  the novelty and difficulty of the questions;

(3)  the skill required to perform the legal service
properly;

) the preclusion of other employment by the attorney
due to acceptance of the case;

(5)  the customary fee;

6) whether the fee is fixed or contingent;

(7)  time limitations imposed by the client or the
circumnstances;

(8)  the amount involved and the results obtained;

€)) the experience, reputation and ability of the
attorneys;

(10)  the undesirability of the case;

(i1) the nature and length of the professional
relationship with the client; and

(12) awards in similar cases.

Johnson, 488 F.2d at 717-19. To the extent that any Joknson factors are subsumed in the
lodestar, they should not be reconsidered in determining whether an adjustment to the
lodestar is required. Delaware Valley, 478 U.S. at 564; Green, 284 F.3d 661.

13.  Here, based on the loadstar approach set forth in Hensley and Delaware
Valley, Golden Blount is entitled to its reasonable and necessary attorneys’ fees in the
amount of $622,015.00. Appendix (“App.”) at p. 2, 77, 87, 112-113. Based on the time
records of Locke, Liddell & Sapp, LLP, Hitt Gaines, P.C., and Schultz & Associates,
P.C, as well as the Affidavits of Roy W. Hardin, Charles W. Gaines, and William D
Hams, Jr., approximately 2500 hours is reasonable for the man power expended in
protecting and litigating Golden Blount’s patent rights. App. 2, 77, 87, 112-113.
Furthermore, attorneys’ fees and paralegal hourly rates, ranging from $65.00 to $375.00

are fair and reasonable in Texas. App. 2, 77, 87, 112-113. Based on the Affidavits of

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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Roy Hardin, Charles W. Gaines, William D. Harris, _Jr‘, and the American Intellectual
Property Law Association (AIPLA) 2001 Report of Economic Survey, these rates are
reasonable in Texas. Marhis, 857 ¥.2d at 755. App. 2, 59, 77, 87, 112-113.
Accordingly, the loadstar approach yields Golden Blount’s reasonable attorneys’ fees in
the amount of $622,015.00.

1. JOHNSON FACTORS AS APPLIED TO THIS CASE

(A) Time and Labor Required

14, “Although hours claimed or spent on a case should not be the sole basis
for determining a fee, they are a necessary ingredient to be considered.” Johnson, 488
F.2d at 717 (citation omitted.) “If more than one attomey is invelved, the possibility of
duplication of effort along with the proper utilization of time should be scrutinized.” Id.
“The trial judge should wetgh the hours claimed against his own knowledge, experience,
and expertise of the time required to complete similar activities.” Id.

15. Golden Blount’s counsel has, on a daily basis, maintained specific and
thorough time entries detailing the work performed, the particular attormey or paralegal
involved, and the hours devoted to a specific project. Since the filing of the Original
Complaint on January 18, 2001, approximately 2500 hours have been expended by
attorneys and paralegals to protect and enforce Golden Blount’s patent rights. App. 2, 77,
87, 112-113. Not only did counsel thoroughly brief the claim construction of the Blount
Patent for the Markman hearing, there was discovery exchanged and the taking of three
depositions due to the vast array of patent law issues involved in the case. Two
thoroughly briefed hearings were held before the Magistrate Judge. Case preparation for

Golden Blount included extensive work on demonstrative exhibits, as well as substantial

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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study and marshalling of the evidence. The Case additionally included, trial, post
Judgment motions, a full appeal before the United States Court of Appeals for the Federal
Circuit, and remand back to this District Court. As indicated in the Affidavits of Charles
W. Gaines and William D. Harris, Jr., these hours were scrutinized and are not excessive
or duplicative hours. App. 2, 77, 87, 112-113. As established through such
documentation and the exercise of billing judgment, the hours submitted by Golden
Blount are reasonable and were necessarily incurred to effectively handle this mater on
behalf of Golden Blount. App. 2, 5-9, 77, 87, 112-113.

(B)  Novelty and Difficulty of the Questions

16.  Attomeys’ fees should be large enough to compensate for accepting a
challenging case because it requires more time and effort. See Johnson, 488 F.2d at 7i8.
As In most patent cases, the legal issues and facts in this case were complex, and required
extensive and sophisticated legal services in investigating, prosccuting, and defending the
various claims and affirmative defenses. First and foremost, this case involved intricate
patent issues. These included questions regarding claims interpretation, invalidity of the
invention, anticipation of the invention by prior art, obviousness of the imvention, and
infringement analysis of the claims vis-4-vis the accused Robert H. Peterson device,
including inducing infringement and contributory infringement, as well as questions
regarding willful infringement. The court also required Markman briefs. Moreover, in
this case, the issue of the nefarious conduct of the defendant had to be ferreted out and
then clearly presented to the court.

17.  Likewise, there were numerous unusual cvidentiary issues, such as the

application of the attorney-client privilege. As this Court is well aware, Robert H.

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S AFPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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Peterson, on numerous occasions, and on the eve of trial, offered and recanted its

decision to offer its alleged oral opinion of counsel. Only after the last change of its

position, did Robert H. Peterson produce its counsel for deposition pursuant to the order
of the Magistrate Judge.

| 18. The issues in this case were hard fought, further supporting the time and

reasonable hourly rate charged in this matter,

(C)  Skill Requisite to Perform the Legal Service Properly

19.  The trial judge’s responsibility is to closely observe the attorneys’ work
product, his preparation, and general ability before the court. Johnson, 488 F.2d at 718.
“The trial judge’s expertise gained from past experience as a lawyer and his observance
from the bench of lawyers at work becomes highly important to this consideration.” Id.
Counsel in this case were required to be broadly experienced in patent law. App. 1-3. 76-
78 and 86-87.

20.  In this case, counsel demonstrated adequate skill level to perform the
work. William D. Harris, Jr. is an attorney licensed to practice law in the State of Texas
for over 40 years. Moreover, Mr. Harris is extremely well versed in complex litigation,
with his primary emphasis in patent law issues. Mr. Harris has participated in numerous
trials with many of these before the Northern District of Texas.

1)) Preclusion of Other Employment by the Attorney Due to Acceptance
of the Case

21.  “This gutdeline involves the dual consideration of otherwise available
business which is foreclosed because of conflicts of interest which occur from the

representation, and the fact that once the employment is undertaken the attorney is not

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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free to use the time spent on the client’s behalf for other purposes.” Johnson, 488 F.2d at
718. This case involved a substantial expenditure of manpower and effort. During the
trial of the case, in addition to working during the business day, it was necessary for
counsel to work after hours and on weekends, especially during the weeks before trial.
As a result, counsel’s ability to take on new work and scrvice existing clients was
impaired.

(E) Customary Fees

22.  “The customary fee for similar work in the community should be
considered” when determining the reasonableness of the requested attorﬁey’é fees.
Johnson, 488 F.2d at 718. Reasonable hourly rates arc determined by looking to the
prevailing market rates in the relevant legal community. See Watkins, 7 F.3d at 458-59.
Rather than focusing on what amount the prevailing counsel is able to charge his clients,
the court should consider the prevailing rate in the relevant community. Blum v. Stenson,
465 U.S. 886, 896 (1984).

23.  Here, the reasonable hourly rates for legal work performed by attorneys
and paralegals in all stages of this litigation ranges from $65.00 to $375.00 an hour. App.
2,77, 87, 112-113.

24. Furthermore, the fee rates of Golden Blount’s counsel are reasonable in
relation to similar professional services performed at comparable levels of competence by
attorneys in Texas. App. 1-3, 76-78 and 86-87. Pursuant to Mathis, 857 F.2d at 755, the
Affidavits of Roy Hardin, Charfes W. Gaines and William D. Harris, Jr. as well as and
the ATPLA Survey constitute ample evidence to support the reasonableness of the fee

award.

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
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(¥) Whether the Fee is Fixed or Contingent

25.  “The fee quoted to the client or the percentage of the recovery agreed to is
helpful in demonstrating the attorneys’ fee expectations when he accepted the case.”
Johnson, 488 F.2d at 718. Locke, Liddell & Sapp, LLP, the first counsel of record for
Golden Blount submitted monthly invoices on their usual time/rate basis. App. at 86-
111. Hitt Gaines, P.C., and Schultz & Associates, P.C., the second and third counsel of
record for Golden Blount, agreed to a contingency fee agreement. As a Johnson factor,
this is either a positive or neutral. Although counsel handled this case on a,conﬁngent
basis, both Hitt Gaines, P.C., and Schultz & Associates, P.C. kept careful track of their
time with daily time entries. App. 1-85. Hitt Gaines, P.C. for Golden Blount, operating
in a firm with less than 11 attorneys, incurred signiﬁcaﬁt risk by electing to represent
Golden Blount on a contingent fee basis. App. 1-3. Schultz & Associates, P.C,, also a
relatively small firm, did the same. App. 76-78. However, adequate records were kept to
properly apply the lodestar method and the Johnson factors. App. 2,77, 87, 112-113.

(G) Time Limitations Imposed by the Client or the Circumstances

26.  “Prority work that delays the lawyer’s other legal work is entitled to some
premium.” Johnson, 488 F.2d at 718. “This factor is particularly important when a new
counsel is called in to prosecute the appeal or handle other matters at a late stage in the
proceedings.” I Here, William D. Harris, Jr. and the law firm of Hitt Gaines, P.C. were
hired to represent Golden Blount only three weeks before the close of discovery. Such a
limited investigation period clearly demonstrates strict time limitations as required by

Johnson.

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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27. Furthermore, Golden Blount’s counsel was also forced to prepare for this
litigation on two separate occasions. Specifically, when counsel for Defendant appeared
at the f{irst pretrial hearing, they announced to the Court, lacking adequate justification,
that they were not adequately prepared to proceed to trial. However, counsel for Golden
Blount, in accordance with this Court’s Order had expended numerous homs and
resources preparing for this initial trial setting trial. While the Couri granted the
Defendant a continuance, counsel for Golden Blount was forced to incur additional
expenses preparing for the second trial setting.

(H)  Amount Invelved and Result Obtained

28.  Furthermore, the degree of the plaintiffs overall success goes to the
reasonableness of a fee award. Johnson, 488 F.2d at 718; Farrar v. Hobby, 506 U.S. 103,
114 (1992). The amount of damages a plaintiff recovers is one of the many factors that a
court must consider when calculating an award of attorneys’ fees. See Green, 284 F.3d at
663.

29, In the case at hand, Golden Blount obtained favorable results. The Court
not only found for Golden Blount on all issues, it also found that Robert I. Peterson’s
conduct amounted to willful infringement and that this was an exceptional case. In fact,
the Court assessed damages in tile amount of $429,256, The Court further found that
damages should be trebled under 35 U.S.C. § 284.

30. It was important to Golden Blount that a permanent injunction be entered
against Robert H. Peterson and, as the prevailing party, plaintiff was afforded the
protection of injunction. Such an injunction has been entered. See In re Dahlgren Int’l,

Inc., 811 F.Supp. 1182, 1185 (N.D. Tex. 1992).

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
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@ Experience, Reputation, and Ability of the Attorneys

31. Attorneys specializing in complex litigation “may enjoy a higher rate for
his expertise than others....” Johnson, 488 F.2d at 719. Counsel for Golden Blount has
handled this rather complex patent case. As demonstrated above, counsel have practiced
for numerous years and have extensive experience in federal court.

(J)  Undesirability of the Case

32.  This case was undesirable because of the difficulty in, and burden inherent
in, protecting patent rights and establishing infringement against a larger well established
company with greater resources and doing so within a substantially reduced time frame.

(K)  Nature and Length of the Professional Relationship with the Client

33.  “A lawyer in private practice may vary his fee for similar work in light of
the professional relationship of the client with his office.” Johnson, 488 F.2d at 719.
However, this case is the first matter that Golden Blount’s counsel have handled for such
entities and so no standing relationship existed.

(L) Awards in Similar Cases

34.  “The reasonableness of a fee may also be considered in light of award§
made in similar litigation within and without the court’s circuit.” Johnson, 488 F.2d at
719. The fee tates of Golden Blount’s counsel are reasonable in relation to similar
professional services performed at comparable levels of competence by attorneys and
paralegals in the Northern District of Texas. App. 2, 77, 87, 112-113. As demonstrated
by the 2001 AIPLA Report of Economic Survey, where over one million is at stake, fee
awards ranging from $498,000.00 to $2,004,000.00 are appropriate in the State of Texas.
App. 5-9.

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
ATTORNEY’S FEES-
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IV. POST JUDGMENT INTEREST

35. A district court has authority to award post judgment intcrest on the
unliquidated sum (i.e., the award of attorneys” fees), of an award made under 35 U.S.C. §
285. 28 U.S.C. § 1961. Interest starts to run on the date establishing the right to an
award. fd. See also Louisiana Power & Light, 50 F.3d at 331-32. The Court’s Final
Judgment and Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law were issued on August 9, 2002,
awarding Golden Blount rcasonable attorneys’ fees and costs. Thereafter, the Court’s
Final Judgment was vacated by the United States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit
on April 19, 2004, thus tolling the time period for post judgment interest. Neverthéless,
this Court again found against Robert H. Peterson when it adopted the Findings of Fact
and Conclusions of Law submitted by Golden Blount on August 31, 2004, on September
2, 2004. Therefore, Golden Blount requests an award of post judgment interest, from
August 9, 2002, to April 19, 2004, and resuming on September 2, 2004, on the amount of
reasonable attorneys’ fees at the highest rate allowed by the law.

V. CONCLUSION

36. In this case, the Court made a determination that Golden Blount was

entitled to attorneys’ fees based on the “exceptional case” ruling under 35 U.S.C. § 285.
Moreover, Golden Blount haé provided to the Court copies of daily time entries as
adequate documentation to support its award of attorneys’ fees. As demonstrated by the
Affidavits of Roy Hardin, Charles W Gaines and William D. Harris, Jr. and the 2001
AILPA Report on Economic Survey, Golden Blount has also shown that these entries are
reasonable and necessary for this patent infringement action in the Northern District of

Texas. Golden Blount has considered and factored in all twelve Johnson criteria in

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR
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developing the Application for Aftorneys’ Fees. Golden Blount does not seek

enhancement of the lodestar amount, as the award of $622,015.00 in attorneys’ fees is

reasonable.

WHEREFORE, PREMISES CONSIDERED, Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc.

requests that this Court grant its Application for Attorneys’ Fees, and award it, as against

Robert H. Peterson Co.,- reasonable attorneys’ fees in the amount of $622,015.00, plus

post judgment interest on such fees at the highest lawful rate from August 9, 2002, to

April 19, 2004, and resuming on September 2, 2004, and such other relief as the Court

deems just and proper.

DATE: September 8, 2004

Respectfully submitted,

For Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc.

William D. Harris, Jr.
State Bar No. 09109000
SCHULTZ & ASSOCIATES, P.C.
5400 LBJ Freeway

One Lincoln Center, Suite 525
Dallas, Texas 75240
214/210-5940 (Telephone)
214/210-5941 (Facsimile)

Charles W. Gaines

State Bar No. 07570580
Greg H. Parker

State Bar No. 24011301
HrtT GARNES, P.C.

2435 North Central Plaza
Suite 1300

Richardson, Texas 75080
972/480-8800 (Telephone)
972/480-8865 (Facsimile)
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that true and correct copies of Golden Blount, Inc.’s
Memorandum in Support of Golden Blount, Inc.’s Application for Attorneys’ Fees was
served upon the following counsel of record, via first class mail on September 8, 2004.

Jerry R. Selinger

Jenkens & Gilchrist

1445 Ross Avenue, Suite 3200
Dallas, Texas 75202

(214) 855-4500

(214) 8554300 (Facsimile)

\
L (CL«:SO A W}f)’

William D. Hartls, Jr.
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that true and correct copies of Golden Blount, Inc.’s Appendix in
Support of Application for Attorneys’ Fees were each served upon the following counsel
of record, via first class mail on September 8, 2004.

Jerry R. Selinger

Jenkens & Gilchrist

1445 Ross Avenue, Suite 3200
Dallas, Texas 75202

(214) 855-4500

(214) 855-4300 (Facsimile)

APPENDIX IN SUPPORT OF GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEY’S
FEES - Page 2 of 2 -
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALLAS DIVISION
‘GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC., §
§
Plaintiff, §
§ Civil Action No.
v §
§ 3-01CV0127-R
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO., §
§
Defendant. §

DECLARATION OF CHARLES W. GAINES IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF, GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES -

. 1,Charles W. Gaines, am a partner with the firm of Hitt Gaines, P.C., and have since the
case was turned over to my firm by the firm of Locke, Liddell & Sapp, represented Golden Blount, Inc.
in the above referenced litigation.

2. My fimm served as trial qo—counsel for Golden Blount, Inc. and assisted in handling the initial
discovery process, pre-trial briefing, trial, post-trial motions, the appeal and the remand of the case.

3. This case is apatent infringement case that presents numerous substantial and complex
issues including, but not limited to, invalidity, actual infringemeat, contributory infringement, induced
infringement, infringement under the doctrine of equivalents, witfulness, measurement of: damages and the
award of attorneys’ fees.

4. Since the beginning of my involvement in the case,  and my colleagues have handled on
behalfof our client aspects of discovery, review and preparation of facts to be presented at trial, briefing

regarding claim interpretation and pre-trial issues, trial of the case and post-trial motions prior to the appeal

JT-APP 2947
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of the case, the appeal of the case, including oral arguments, and the remand of the case back to this Court.
5. Attached hereto are true and correct copies of the Hitt Gaines, P.C., invoices that represent
my firm’s attorneys’ fees for representation in this case,

6. Asthebills indicate, the vast majority c;f thisrepresentation by my finn was handled b;(
myself, Greg H. Parker (an assoctate with my firm }, and Williarme D. Haris, Jr. (of Counsel with my firm).
Ioriginally had a billing rate of $290 per hour through July 0of 2002, and after that, my billing rate was
increased to $300 per hour. Greg H. Parker originally had a billing rate of $175 per hour through
September 0f 2003, and after that, his billing rate was increased to $225 per hour. William D: Harris, Jr.,
onthe other hand, has had a consistent billing rate of $350 per hour the entire time he was with my firm,
which ended on about August31,2003. These rates are consistent with the rates charged by my firm to

other clients comparable to Golden Blount, Inc.

7. Intotal, my firm has expended $548,428 in attorneys” fees in this case, as shown below:
FEE EARNER TOTAL HOURS BILLING RATE
William D. Harris 641.20 $350.00
Charles W. Gaines 202.80 $290.00
Charles W. Gaines 137.60 $3060.00
Greg H. Parker 965.10 $175.00
Greg H. Parker 170.90 $225.00
James Ortega 67.50 $175.00
Carol Garland (Paralegal) | 21.60 $75.00
Carol Garland (Paralegal) | 8.8 $90.00
Trudy McGruder (Paralegal) 36.10 $65.00
Total: 2251.60 hours $548,428.00
2
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8. Iam familiar with the customary fees for this type oflitigation charged in large legal markets
suchas Dallas.' In my opinion, the hours billed by me and other members of my firm are reasonable in
relation to the quantity and substance of the representation in this case. 1 further understand the hourly rates
for the attomeys in my firm to be reasonable in relation to other similar attorneys in large markets such as
Dallas.

9. Thave reviewed the bills and do not believe that there were significant duplication of efforts
among the members of my firm or the other firms representing my client.

10. It 1s my opinion that the total value and effort by Hitt Gaines, P.C., was r'easo.nable and
necessary for the case at hand.

I1.  Intotal, my firm has disbursed $10,031.04 for postage, long distance calls, photocopying,
travel, air express delivery, local messenger delivery, paralegals, computerized legal research and facsimiles
forthe time period up and through July 31, 2002, which s being submitted to the Clerk of the Northern
Dis@ict concurrently herewith in a Bill of Cost.

12. In total Golden Blount, Inc. is seeking $548,428 in attorneys’ fees and $1 0,031.04 in
disbursement for Hitt Gaines, P.C..

Ideclare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the United States of America that the foregoing
1s true and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

Executed this September 8, 2004, at Dallas, Texas.

o ddld i

Charles W. Gaines
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 1
Selection Criteria

Client (hand select) Include: BLNT-0001LT

Slip.Classification  Open

Slip.Date Earliest - Latest

Slip.Transaction Ty 1-1

Rate Info - identifies rate source and level -

Sip ID Attormey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance .

77992 TIME WDH 250 350.00 875.00
816/01 Misc 0.00 T
wIiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Meeting with Mr. Golden Blount. Telecons 0.00
with Roy Hardin. Interoffice meeting.
Follow-up. Not to Elizabeth: Hold this
time.

- 77993 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00

B/7/01 Draft 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft contingency fee agreement. 0.00

77994 TIME wWDH 0.00 350.00 0.00
8/9/01 Draft 0.00 Tan
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft cover fetter and further work on 0.00
contingency agreement.

77995 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
8/13/01 Misc 0.00 T@t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Initial prepatory time by WOH. 0.00

77996 TIME WDH 1.75 350.00 612.50
8/14/01 Misc 0.00 Ta
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Initial survey of invention potential, 0.00
Negotiations with opposing counsel and
reviewing understanding for 30 day
extension on discovery issues.

77997 T TIME WODH 0.50 350.00 175.00
8/15/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wIp : BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further review on faxing the Golde 0.00
matter.

785056 TIME CWG 12,30 290.00 3567.00
8/15/01 8/31/01 Review 0.00 T@1
WIP . BLNT-0001LT - .00
Review files and pleadings; office 0.00
conference with client.



-

8122702 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing
Slip 1D Attornay Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Fite Variance
77908 TIME WDH - 0.75 350.00 26250
817101 Misc 0.00 Ta
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Finalize motion to extend time and 0.00
forwarding same to opposing counsel for
execution.
77999 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
8/21/01 Review 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review of papers and pleadings. 0.00
interoffice conference.
78000 TIME WDH 2.50 350,00 . 875.00
8/23/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Working on formulating Golden Blount 0.00
case. Entry of appearance.
78001 TIME WODH 3.50 350.00 1225.00
8/29/01 Misc 0.00 Tt
wirP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Planning and work on documents. 0.00
78002 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
8/30/01 Misc 0.00 Tat
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Planning discovery and document 0.00
responses.
77655 TIME CAG 1.00 75.00 75.00
B/30/01 Prepare 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare comrespondence to and telephone 0.00
. conference with Optipat requesting
cerlified file wrapper histories on three
Eatent applications; office conference with
Iz regarding same.
78003 TIME WDH 0.50 350.00 175.00
8/31/01 Misc 0.00 Tat
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Study of documents. 0.00
79834 TIME JHO - 7.70 175.00 1347.50
9/4/01 Misc 0.00 @t
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Determine prosecution history and clalm 0.00
Interpretation.
79473 TIME WOH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
9/4/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
“wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Study of case and preparation for 0.00 '

meeting. Meeting with client on

Page -2
JT-APP 2957
A-11



8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page
Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
“Westgrove Lane.
79835 TIME JHO 8.80 175.00 1540.00
9/5/01 Mis¢ 0.00 T@1
wirP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Determine prosecution history and claim 0.00
interpretation.
79474 TIME WDH 0.75 350.00 262.50
9/5/01 Misc 0.00 Ta1
‘WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Follow—ug work on damaies ﬁuestion, =y 0.00
79836 TIME JHO 8.90 175.00 1657.50
9/6/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Detenmine prosecution history and claim 0.00
Inferpretation.
79475 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
9/6/01 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on document production. 0.00
79615 TIME CAG 2.00 75.00 150.00
9f7lo1 Prepare 0.00 T@l
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare documents for production. 0.00
79838 TIME JHO 6.90 175.00 1207.50
9/7/01 Misc 0.00 Tat
Wi . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Determine prosecution history and claim 0.00
interpretation.
79476 TIME WDH 3.50 350.00 122500
9f7/01 Misc 0.00 Tt
wip ) BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on document review and 0.00
classification and «ilminRmianay
AR
79477 TIME WDH 5.50 350.00 1925.00
9/8/01 Misc 0.00 T@l
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on classifying documents and make 0.00
ready for delivery to opponents.
79840 TIME JHO 9.00 175.00 1575.00
9/10/01 Misc 0.00 Tt
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.60
Determine prosecution history and claim 0.00
inferpretation.

3

1 |
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 4
Slip ID Attomey * Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Aclivity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Fite Variance
79478 TIME WDOH 300 350.00 1050.00
9/10/01 Misc 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-00C1MLT 0.00
Document production. 0.00
79841 TIME JHO 6.60 175.00 1155.00
9/11/01 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wIpP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Determine prosecution history and clairm 0.00
interpretation.
79479 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 '350.00
9/11/01 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Document exchange arrangements and © 0.00
telecon with Jerry Selinger.
79480 TIME WDH 0.50 350.00 175.00
9/12/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-Q0O1LT 0.00
Arrangements for discovery scheduling 0.00
and further document analysis.
79842 - TIME JHO 9.70 175.00 1697.50
9/12/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Determine prosecution history and claim : 0.00
interpretation. .
79622 TIME CAG 2.00 75.00 150.00
9/12/01 Prepare 0.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare index of and organize documents - 0.00
produced by BLNT.
79481 TIME wWDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
9/13/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Study of patent claims and infringement 0.00
problems.
79843 TIME JHO §.90 175.00 1732.50
9/13/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BULNT-0001LT 0.00
Determine prosecution history and claim 0.00
interpretation.
79482 TIME WOH 0.30 350.00 105.00
9/14/01 Review 0.00 Tal
WipP BLNT-0001LT Q.00
Revlew of copy of ‘as fited’ motion to 0.00
extend discovery date. )
JT-APP 2959



8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 5
Slip ID Attomey Units Rate Siip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Biil Status
"Description File Variance
79483 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
9/19/01 Misc ¢.00 Tot
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Study of record of proseculion and i 0.00
SRRy
79484 TIME WDH 0.75 350.00 262.50
9/20/01 Misc 0.00 T@l .
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Telecon with opposing counsel from 0.00
“Chicago in-an effort to produce logistic
concerning document production and
delivery. Follow-up call to defendant's
local counsel.
79643 TIME CAG 0.40 75.00 30.00
9/24/01 Revise 0.00 Ta1
wWiP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Revise pleadings index. 0.00
79485 TIME WDH 2.00 - 350.00 700.00
9/24/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preliminary review of Peterson documents 0.00
for eIy . FOrmalizing
court appearances.
79645 TIME CAG 0.50 75.00 37.50
9/25/01 Draft 0.00 T@1
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft letter to court filing Natice of 0.00
Appearances for Messrs. Harris and
Gaines.
79486 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
9/25101 Review 0.00 T T@t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review of certain of Peterson documents ) 0.00
and planning discovery.
79653 TIME CAG 0.20 75.00 15.00
9/26/01 Revise 0.00 T@t
wWiP BLNT-GOO1LT (.00
Revised pleadings index. 0.00
79487 TIME WDH 2.50 350.00 875.00
9/26/01 Misc 0.00 T
‘wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Conference with Charles and preparation 0.00
for depositions.
79658 TIME CAG 1.10 75.00 82.50
9/27/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Office conference with Charles W. Gaines 0.00
JT-APP 2960

A-14
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing
Slip 1D Attomey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Aclivity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
regarding preparation for depositions;
prepare documents for depositions.
79488 TIME WDH 4.00 © 350.00 1400.00
9/27/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on documents and preparation for 0.00
depositions.
. Telecon with Bill McLaughlin,
opposing counsel.
79666 TIME CAG 3.50 75,00 262:50
9/28/01 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Office conference with William D. Harris 0.00
regarding Notices of Deposition; draft
Notice of Rule 30(b)(6) Deposition for RH )
Peterson Co.; draft Notice of Deposition of
E. William McLaughlin; draft letter to
opposing counsel regarding Notices of
Deposition; &u
SRR R
RN
79855 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
9/28/01 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for deposition. Faxes back 0.00
and forth to opposing counsel, Deposition
notices.
81783 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
10/1/01 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare for deposition and calls from and 0.00
to opposing counsel In Chicago,
81784 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 £25.00
10/2/01 " Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Revislon of deposition notes and 0.00
arrangement of deposition reporting for
Friday, October 5, 2001,
81785 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
10/3/01 Review 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
arrangements for deposition in Chicago.
81710 TIME CAG .50 75.00 37.50
10/3/01 Revise ’ 0.0 T@t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Revise pleadings index and docket 0.00

Page 6
JT-APP 2961
A-15



8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 7
Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posling Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Descripfion File Variance
~ Nofices of Deposition. i
81786 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
10/4/01 Prepare 0.00 T@l
wWIP - BLNT-0001LT 0.60
Preparation for deposition. 0.00
81787 TIME WOH 12.00 350.00 4200.00
10/5/01 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip- BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for and travel to Chicago. 0.00
Taking of deposition. Retum to Dallas. _
81788 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
10/8/01 Misc 0.00 Tl
wip . BLNT-Q001LT 0.00
Study of documents. Letter to client. 0.00
Conferring with Mr. Gaines.
81789 TIME WDH 5.50 350.00 1925.00
10/9/01 Misc 0.00 Tt
WwiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Case preparation. Two telecons with Mr. - 0.00
Blount. Work on motion regarding
attorneys opinions. Study of claim
interpretation.
81596 - TIME GHP d 3.80 175.00 665.00
10/10/01 Misc . 0.00 Tt
WIp BLNT-CO01ILT 0.00
Mation in Limine. 0.00
81790 TIME ™~ WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
10/10/01 ’ Teleconference 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Telecon with opposing counsel regarding 0.00.
problem of use of epinions of counsel.
81600 TIME GHP 2.30 175.00 402.50
10/11/01 Misc 0.00 Ta
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Motion in Limine. 0.00
81598 TIME GHP 3.40 175.00 595.00
10/11/01 Misc 0.00 T@a
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Motion in Limine. 0.00 ~
81791 TIME WDH 3.80 350.00 1330.00
10/11/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on case preparation. Sllms . 0.00
= —————ey
JT-APP 2962

A-16



L]

8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C. ,
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 8
Slip 1D Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
Bi79z TIME WDH 250 350.00 875.00
10/12/01 Misg 0.00 T@1
wir BLNT-0001LT 0.00 .
Execution of Motion in Limine and filing 0.00
and serving of same.
81793 TIME WDH 200 35000 700.00
10/15/01 Review 0.00 T@1
wirP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review of certain drawings and 0.00
documents and preparing for meeting with
JGolden Blount.
81794 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
10/16/01 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wiP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for and conference with 0.00
Golden Blount at his offices and certain
follow-up thereafter.
81865 TIME CWG 4.50 290.00 1305.00
10/16/01 Meeting 0.00 T@1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Meeting at Golden Blount's office. 0.00
81795 TIME WDOH 1.00 350.00 350.00
10/19/01 Misc 0.00 Tal
wip BLNT-0001L.T 0.00
0.00
81759 TIME CAG 0.50 75.00 37.50
10/23/01 Revise 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Revise pleadings index. 0.00
81771 TIME CAG 0.50 75.00 37.50
10/26/01 Revise 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 ,
Revise pleadings index. 0.00
83972 TIME WDH 1.20 350.00 420.00
11/1/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wWIP ] BLNT-0001LT 0.00
St E—————— 0.00
b Y.
83735 TIME CWG 0.75 290.00 217.50
11/5/01 Review 0.00 T@1
wiP ) BLNT-0001LY 0.00
Review documents; office conference with 0.00
Bilt Harris regarding
JT-APP 2963
A-17
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM - Slip Listing Page
Slip ID Attorney ~ Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
835974 TIME WDH | 350.00 1050.00
11/5/01 Misc (.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further work and planning strategy. 0.00 )
83740 TIME CWG 0.75 290.00 217.50
11/6101 Misc 0.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Conference with Bilt Harris regarding 0.00
83973 TIME WDH 500 350.00 1750.00
11/6/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on - 0.00
apmuitnalliEiawy. Study of claims.
Meeting with-Charles Gaines fummme
1 e
Jpsssimmmam—— . Telocons with
opposing counsel and with Golden Blount.
83975 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00° 1050.00
11/7/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Attention to response to the oppaosition to 0.00
our motion in fimine.
83594 TIME GHP 2.80 175.00 490.00
11/9/01 . Draft 0.00 T@a
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft reply to defendants Response fo 0.00
Motion in Limine.
83977 TIME ‘WDH 200 350.00 700.00
11/9/01 Misc* 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further work on Reply. 0.00
83595 TIME GHP 1.60 175.00 280.00
11/11/01 Dratt 0.00 T@1
wWiP BLNT-0001LT c.00
Draft reply to defendants Response to 0.00
Motion in Limine.
83976 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
11/12/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on reply {o aur opposition to motion 0.00
inlimine.
83978 TIME WDH . 2.00 350.00 700.00
11/13/01 Misc - 0.00 T
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 '
Telecons with Judge's law coordinator. 0.00
JT-APP 2964
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8122102 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.

10:34 AM Stip Listing

Slip 1D Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
R
receiving continuance notice for Judge
Stickney's hearing.

83979 WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
11/15/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIrP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Attention to revised order for hearing by : 0.00 .

Magistrate. Conference with Charles
Gaines.

83512 CAG 0.50 75.00 . 37.50
11/16/01 Revise 0.00 T )
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Revise pteadings index. 0.00

83980 WDH 1.50 350.00 525.00
11/19/01 . Misc 0.00 Ta
WIP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial 4 0.00
3

83981 WDH 450 350.00 1575.00
11/26/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for an argument before 0.00
Magistrate Judge regarding
.

83982 WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
11127/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Follow-up on hearing of November 26 and 0.00
review of Magistrate Judge’s Crder.

83555 TAM 0.50 65.00 32.50
11/28/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BUNT-0GO1LT 0.00
Update pleadings index. 0.00

101323 WDH 0.50 350.00 175.00
12/3/01 Misc 0.00 T@l
wip . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparations for further depositions per 0.00
Judge's Order.

101324 WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
1214101 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparing for further depositions. 0.00

101325 WDH 0.60 350.00 210.00
12/5/a1 Misc 0.00 Tat
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Telecon with Bill McLaughlin in effotts to 0.00-

Page 10
JT-APP 2965
A-19



8/22/02 HIiTT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 11
Slip ID Altorney __ Units Rate  Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
" Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
work ou discovery issues and deposition
timing.
101326 TIME WDH 0.50 350.00 175.00
12/6/01 Misc . 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Telecons with opposing counsel (Bill 6.00
McLaughlin) concerning timing, and
particularly as relates to the McLaughlin
deposition and completion of Mr. Bortz's
deposition to be held in Dallas.
101327 TIME WDH 0.60 350.00 210.00
12/13/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-00G1LT 0.00
Telecon with opposing attorne 0.00
(McLaughlin) regarding deposition setting
and follow-up.
101328 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
12/14/01 Misc 0.00 T@t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Telecons with Bill McLaughlin in an effort 0.00
to finalize 30{b)(6) deposition.
101329 TIME WDH Q.60 350.00 210.00
12717101 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip ’ BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Notice letter faxed to Bill McLaughlin - 0.00
conceming deposition notice and request
for documents. Telecon with Bill
McLaughtin.
101331 TIME CWG 1.00 290.00 290.00
12/18/01 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LY 0.00
Prepare materials for McLaughlin's 0.00
deposition.
101330 TIME WOH 2.00 350.00 700.00
12/18/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparations for deposition of Bill 0.00
Mclaughlin and Mr. Bortz.
101333 TIME WOH 6.00 350.00° 2100.00
12/19/01 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip - BLNT-0001LY 0.00
Further preparation for and taking 0.00
-depositions of Mr. McLaughlin and Mr.
Bortz. ’
- 101332 TIME CWG 6.50 280.00 1885.00
12/19/01 - Attend - 0.00 T@
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
JT-APP 2966
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.

10:34 AM Slip Listing

Slip ID Aftorey Units
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time
Posting Status Client Est. Time
Description File Variance
Attend depositions of Mcl.aughiin and
Bortz.

101334 TIME WDH 0.50
12/20/01 Misc 0.00
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Conference with Charles Gaines 0.00
regarding qzotheedtstinmineniteg
lim—— .

101336 TIME WDH 0.80
12/21/01 Misc 0.00
WIP BLNT-Q001LT 0.00
Conslderation of presentation of evidence. 0.00
Telecon with Golden Blount.

101335 TIME GHpP 240
12/21/01 Prepare 0.00
wip . BLNT-0Q01ILT 0.00
Prepare Exhibits. 0.00

101337 TIME GHP 3.10
12/27/01 Misc 0.00
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Plaintiff's Reply to Defendant's 0.00
Counterclaim.

101338 TIME GHP 1.10
12127101 Prepare 0.00
Wwip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare Exhibits. 0.00

101339 TIME GHP 110
12/28/01 Misc 0.00
WIP . BLNT-0001L.T 0.00
Plaintiff's Reply to Defendant's 0.00
Counterclaim.

101340 TIME WDH 1.00
12/31/01 Misc 0.00
WIP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Response to Counterclaims. 0.00

87666 TIME GHP 2.10
1/2/02 Research 0.00
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Research for WDH. 0.00

88076 TIME WDH 1.00
1/7/02 : Misc 0.00
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preliminary review of depositions. ) 0.00

Page 12
Rate Slip Value
Rate Info
Bill Status
350.00 175.00
T@1
350.00 280.00
T@1
175.00 420.00
T
175.00 542 50
T@at
175.00 192.50
Ta!
175.00 192.50
T@1
350.00 350.00
T@1
175.00 367.50
T@1
350.00 350.00
T@1
JT- APP 2967
A2l



8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 13
Slip ID Altorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info -
Posfing Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File ~ Variance
87671 TIME GHP 2.30 17500 402.50
177102 Research 0.00 Tat
WIP BULNT-0001LT 0.00
Research Disclaimer. Q.00
87673 TiIME GHP 240 175.00 .420.00
1/8/02 Research 0.00 T@t
WIP BUNT-0001LT 0.00
Research Disclaimer. 0.00
88077 TIME WDH 0.60 350.00 210.00
1/8/02 Misc 0.00 Tt
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00
87674 TIME GHP 4.80 175.00 840.00
1/9/02 Prepare 0.00 Ta1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare Claim Chart Exhibit. 0.00
88078 TIME WDH 3.50 350.00 1225.00
1/10/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation and meeting. 0.00
87678 TIME GHP 2.10 175.00 367.50
1/10/02 Misc 0.00 Tal
wip ' BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Meetings with Golden & Family abiiium!. : 0.00
88025 TIME CWG 8.00 290.00 2320.00
1/10/02 Meeting 0.00 Tt
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Mesting with Golden Blount regarding 0.00
Wl ; preparation for meeting.
88028 TIME CWG 4.00 280.00 1160.00
1/13/02 Review 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review deposition. 0.00
88029 TIME CWG 3.00 290.00 870.00
1/14/02 Conference 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Conference with Bill Hairis reﬁarding 0.00
N
87682 TIME GHP 9.30 175.00 1627.50
1114102 Misc 0.00 Tal
wirP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discussions with Charles and Bilt ) 0.00
regarding (EG———————
JT-APP 2968
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88082

8122102
10:34 AM

Slip D
Dates and Time
Posting Status
Description
88079
1/14/02
WwipP

Work on case. Preparation primarily on
AL LR A ek A

with opposing counsel.

88041
1/15/02
wipP
Telephone conference with John Palaski
and follow up office conference with Bill

TIME

TIME

Harris regarding &Nty
-
88080 TIME
1/15/02
wip

Telecon from °

Zcnmhilenivenriminny t
dmmimn Mark-up of the Chicago segment

of the Bortz deposition. Conference with
co-counsel regarding wgin

87689
1/16/02
wiP )
Review Financial Daocuments and Other
exhibits.

88081
1/16/02
wipP

Work on preparation of required Pretrial
Disclosures.

TIME
TIME

TIME
1/17/02
wiP

Review of documents; cunislawmiowms
SRR, < xchange of faxes with
Bill McLaughlin (opposing counsel)

regarding pretrial disclosure schedule and

regarding preparation of pretriat arder.,
Initiation of efforts to obtain stipulations
from Bili McLaughlin. Conslderation of

88044
1/17/02
wip
Review and discuss documents and
exhibits for pretrial disclosure.

TIME

HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.

Siip Listing Page 14
- Aftorney Units Rate Slip Value
Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Client Est. Time  Bill Status
File Variance
550 350.00 192500
Misc 0.00 T@1
BLNT-C001LY 0.00
0.00
CWG 2.00 290.00 580.00
Telaconference 0.00 T@1
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
Misc 0.00 T@1
BLNT-0001LT G.00
0.00
GHP 170 175.00 297.50
Review 0.00 T@a1
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
WOH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
Misc 0.00 T@1
BLNT-0001LYT 0.00
0.00
WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
Review 0.00 T@1
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
CWG 5.50 290.00 1595.00
Review 0.00 Ta1
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
JT-APP 2969
A-23



8122102 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 15
Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description ~ File Variance
87690 TIME GHP 8.70 175.00 152250
1/17/02 Review 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review Financial Documents and Other 0.00
exhibits.
87691 TIME GHP 2.20 175.00 385.00
1/18/02 Draft ¢.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Oraft Pretriat Disclosure. 0.00
88083 TIME WOH 3.00 350.00 -1050.00
1/18/02 Review 0.00 T@t )
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further preparation for pretrial disclosures 0.00
and pretrial order.
88084 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
1/21/02 Review 0.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial including further . 0.00
preparation for pretrial disclosures.
88049 TIME . CWG 3.00 290.00 870.00
1/21/02 Misc 0.00 T@1 :
wiP - BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Mark depositions for pretrial materials. 0.00
87692 TIME GHP | 2.90 175.00 507.50
1/21/02 Draft 0.00 Tl
wiP BUNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft Pretrial Disclosure. . 0.00
87901 TIME Ly TAM 1.00 65.00 65.00
1122102 i . Prepare 6.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare log of privileged documents. 0.00
87693 TIME GHP 3.10 175.00 542.50
1/22/02 Draft 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft Pretrial Disclosure/Review 0.00
Interrogaftories.
88085 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
1/23/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-Q001LT 0.00
Preparation and study relating to pretrial 0.00
materials and pretrial order. Conference -
with Greg Parker and brief conference
with Charles Gaines.
JT-APP 2970
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8122102 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10-34 AM Slip Listing Page 16
Ship ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
- Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
87694 TIME GHFP 1.50 175.00 262.50
1/23/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Jury Instructions. 0.00
88086 TIME WDH 2.30 350.00 805.00
1/24/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.09
Trial instructions for jury. Preparation time 0.00
with Greg Parker. Telecons seeking to
find status of pretrial disclosures.
87698 TIME GHP 3.40 175.00 595.00
1725102 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Pretrial Order (including Jury Instructions : 0.00
& Voir Dire).
88087 TIME WOH 2.00 350.00 700.00
1125102 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Conferences with Charles Gaines and 0.00
Greg Parker regarding easishewili
. Telecon with Bill McLaughlin
88088 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
1/28/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00
87700 TIME GHP 4.10 175.00 717.50
1/28/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Pretrial Order & Exhibit List. 0.00
87902 TIME TAM 0.50 65.00 32.50
1/29/02 Misc 0.00 T@an
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Update pleadings index. .00
88089 TIME WODH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
1/29/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
"Preparation for frial. 0.00
88065 TIME CWG 2.00 290.00 580.00
1/30/02 Conference 0.00 T@1
WwiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Conferences with Bill Harris and Greg 0.00
Parker regarding oauiaiihs.
1
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8122/02
10:34 AM

Slip ID
Dates and Time
Posting Status
Description

88090
1/30/02
wip

TIME

Trial preparation; Meeting with Mr. Blount.

87705
1/31/02
wip
Review/Mark Deposition Designations &
Review 30)b)(6) motion.

88066 TIME .
1/3102
wip
Begin mark depositions for pretrial
deslgnations; conferences with Bill Harris

TIME

and Greg Parker regardingwsmae.
88091 TIME

1/31/02

wiP

Preparation for triaf.
89910 ' TIME

2/1/02

wip . )

Prepare/Review Portions of Pretrial Order.
89703 TIME

211102

WIP

Prepare pre-trial exhibits.
90409 TIME

2/1j02

wip

Work on various parts and subparts of
pretrial order and other pretrial materials
reﬁulred by Judge Buchmeyer. Sending
inltial drafts of foregoing to opposing
counsel, as per requirements by Coust,

89579 TIME
212102
wip )
Prepare pretrial order; interoffice
conference with Blll Harris and Greg
Parker regarding Wil -

89591 - TIME
2/4/02
wip
Prepare pretrial order and pretrial
disclosure materials.

HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.

Slip Listing Page
Aftorney Units Rate Slip Value
Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Client Est. Time  Bill Status
File Variance
WDH 550 -350.00 1925.00
Misc 0.00 TE1
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
GHP 470 176.00 822.50
Review 0.00 T@t
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
CWG 3.00 290.00 870.00
Misc 0.00 T@t T
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
Misc 0.00 @l
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
GHP 6.50 175.00 1137.50
Prepare 0.00 T@1 .
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
TAM 2.50 65.00 162.50
Prepare 0.00 T@1
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
Work on 0.00 Tal
BLNT-000{LT 0.00
0.00
CWG 7.00 290.00 2030.00
Prepare 0.00 T@1
BLNT-00G1LT 0.00
0.00
CWG 3.00 290.00 870.00
Prepare 0.00 T@1
BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
JT-APP 2972
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 18
Slip ID Attormey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Aclivity ) DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Ciient Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
90410 TIME WDH 500 ~350.00 1750.00
2/14]02 Work on 0.00 T@1
wip . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on jury charges and special - . 0.00
questions for jury. Further work on pretrial
order.
89914 TIME GHP 3.40 175.00 595.00
214102 Review 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review Documentation for Preliminary *~ 0.00
Jury Instructions with William D. Harris, Jr.
and Research and Drafting of Jury
Instructions.
89913 TIME GHP 2.60 175.00 455.00
2{A102 Prepare 0.00 Tat
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare/Review Remaining Portions of 0.0
Pretrial Order.
89580 TIME CWG 3.00 290.00 870.00
214102 ) Prepare 0.00 Tt
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare pretrial order; interoffice 0.00
conference with Greg Parker regarding
_—
90411 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
2/5102 Misc 0.00 Tt
wip BLNT-0001LT 000
L T S 0.00
s. Review of
MclLaughlin's letter pressing for pretrial
material drafts and redrafting of response.
89918 TIME GHP 2.30 175.00 402.50
2/5/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Objections to Defendants 0.00
Pretrial Disclosure.
89592 TIME CWG 5.00 290.00 1450.00
215102 Prepare 0.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare pretrial materials. 0.00
89706 -TIME TAM 0.20 65.00 13.00
2/6/02 Misc 0.00 T
wIP : BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Update pleadings index, 0.00
A-27
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C,

10:34 AM Slip Listing Page

Slip ID Attorney Units Rate  Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

.89593 TIME CWG .0 290.00 580.00
2/6102 Prepare 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare pretrial materials. 0.00

90412 TIME WDH 8.00 350.00 2800.00
2/6/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Numerous letters and prefrial materials to -0.00
‘and from opposing counsel, related
primary to scheduling order and Judge
‘Buchmeyer's pretrial requirement.

Preparation for trial. ST
Wﬂh Charles
Gaines and Greg Parker.

89922 TIME GHP 1.70 175.00 297.50
2/6/02 Draft - 0.00 T@

WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00

. Draft/Review Stipulations of Fact and 0.00
Explanation of Witnesses.

89921 TIME GHP 1.10 175.00° 192.50
2/6/02 Review 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review Defendant’s Interrogatories for 0.00
Completeness.

89920 TIME GHP 1.70 175.00 297.50
2/6/02 Misc 0.00 Tal
wip BLNT-00C1LT 0.00
Discussions with William D. Harris, Jr. 0.00
regarding exhibits, pretrial order, Golden
Blount, etc.

89602 TIME CWG 6.00 290.00 1740.00
217102 Misc 0.00 Tl
wip - BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Interoffice discussion with Bill Harrls 0.00
regarding e
Telephone conference with Golden
Blount; -

90413 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
2/7/02 Prepare | 0.00 Ta1t
wip BULNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for prefrial papers, pretrial 0.00
conference and for trial.

89925 TIME GHP 5.20 175.00 .
277102 Prepare 0.00 Tat 910.00
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Jury Instructions. 0.00

JT-APP 2974
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Bi22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 20
Slip ID Afttorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client .Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
89927 TIME GHP 1.90 175.00 33250
278102 Draft 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft/Review Letters to B, Mclaughilin. 0.00
89606 TIME CWG 4.00 290.00 1160.00
2/8/02 Prepare 6.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare lefter fo opposing counsel; 0.00
telephone conference with Mr. Blount
regarding SWWRWIR:; prepare letter to
Mr. Blount regarding g
lntemfﬁce conference with Bilt Harris.
89931 TIME © GHP 2.80 175.00 490.00
2/8/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wWiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Equivalence Chart. 0.00
89930 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 227.50
218102 Prepare 0.00 T@at
wip ' BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Jury Instructions. 0.00
89928 . TIME GHP 3.50 175.00 £12.50
2/8/02 Prepare 0.00 Tat :
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Jury Instructions. 0.00
90414 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
2/8/02 Prepare 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00
90415 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
2/111/02 Work on 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on pretrial order and work on volr 0.00
dire questions. Conferences with Charles
Gaines and Greg Parker. Letter to Bill
MeclLaughlin regarding follow-up request.
for privilege log. Review of
correspondence from Bilf Mclaughlin.
89932 TIME GHP 6.90 175.00 1207.50
2111102 Prepare 0.00 T@a1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Jury Instructions. 0.00
89937 TIME GHP 0.80 175.00 . 140.00 |
2/12/02 Misc 0.00 T@1 -
wip BLNT-0001LT ° 0.00
Strategy discussion with William D. Harris, 0.00
Jr. regarding Smiiiiihe
JT-APP 2975
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822102 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 21
Slip ID Atforney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Fiie Variance
89936 TIME GHP 3.0 175.00 547250
2/12/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Incorporate William D. Harris, Jr. changes 0.00
info Jury Instructions.
89935 TIME GHP 3.40 175.00 595.00
212102 Prepare 0.00 Tt
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Jury Charge . 0.00
90446 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750,00
2/12/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1l
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial; el 0.00
S —————————
e e
e . ]
.}
89933 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 22750
2/12/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wWIP - BLNT-Q001LT 0.00
Completion of First Draft of Jury . 0.00
Instructions.
89939 TIME GHP 210 175.00 367.50
2/13102 Misc 0.60 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT - 0.00
incorporate additional William D. Harris, 0.00
Jr. changes into Jury Instructions.
89940 TIME GHP 0.30 175.00 52.50
2/13/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Strategy discussion with ‘Mlliam D. Harrls, 0.00
Jr. regarding$
89938 TIME GHP 0.40 175.00 70.00
2/13/02 . Research 0.00 T@1
wip : BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Fepmmy R 0.00
D
89610 - TIME CWG 2.00 250.00 .
2{13/02 Misc 0.00 Tat 580.00
WiP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
“Interoffice conference with Bill Harrls 0.00
regarding )
JT-APP 2976
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8/22/02 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.

10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 22

Slip 1D Attorney Unils Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

BQETP_TH\E% CWG 2.00 230.00 580.00
2/14/02 Revise 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Revise Doctrine of Equivalents chart. 0.00

90417 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
2114102 Misc 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further preparation for trial. Preparation 0.00
conference with Charles Gaines.

90418 TIME WDH . 5.50 350.00 1925.00
2/15/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1 . :
wip . BLNT-0001LT ]

Preparation for trial and numerous 0.00
{elecons.

89619 TIME CWG 1.00 290.00 290.00
2145102 . Misc 0.0Q T@1
wipP BILNT-0001LT 0.00 ’

Interoffice discussion with Bill Harris 0.00
regarding

89635 TIME CWG 1.00 290.00 280.00
2/15/02 Misc 0.00 a1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Interoffice conference with Bill Hartis 0.00
regarding .

89642 TIME CWG 1.00 290.00 290.00
2118102 . . Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP ' BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Interoffice conference regardingunliiiie 0.00
LY

90419 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
2/18/02 . Continue 0.00 T@1
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Continued preparation for trial. 0.00

89648 TIME CWG 1.50 290.00 435.00
2/19/02 Review 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-C001LT 0.00
Review draft of Pre-triat Order; telephone 0.00
conference with opposing counsel;

Interoffice conference with Greg Parker
regarding PN .

89644 TIME CWG 1.00 290.00 290.00
218102 Review 0.00 T@1

WP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review draft of Jury instructions. 0.00

JT-APP 2977
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822002 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.
10:34 AM Slip Listing Page
' Slip 1D ) Aftorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
89961 TIME GHP 1.70 175.00 29750
2/19/02 Misc 0.00 T@1l
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
incorporate Charles W. Gaines changes 0.00
Info Jury Instructions. :
89962 TIME GHP 4.20 175.00 735.00
2/19/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WiP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft/Review Final Pretrial Order. 0.00
90420 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 -1050.00
2/20/02 Work on 0.00 T
WIP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
VR et . 0.00
89965 TIME GHP 8.30 175.00 1452.50
2/20/02 Misc . 0.00 T@1
wiP : BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Congwletioanﬂing of Pretrial Order and 0.00
Pretrial Materials. .
90421 TME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
2/21/02 Work on 0.00 Tt
wWiP | BLNT-00G1LT 0.00
Wal 0.00
. Conferences with Charles
Galnes and Greg Parker.
89667 TIME CWG 1.00 290.00 290.00
2/21102 Review 0.00 Tal
WIP BLNT-0001LT - 0.00
Review draft of Peterson's Jury Charge. 0.00
89970 TIME ' GHP 210 175.00 367.50
2022/02 Prepare 0.00 Tat
WP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Joint Agreed to Motion for 0.00
Trial by the Court Sitting Without a Jury.
89973 TIME GHP 3.40 175.00 595.00
2/25/02 Prepare 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Charts for BInt Trial. 0.00
89847 TIME GWB 1.00 275.00 275.00
2{25/02 Misc 1.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Do NotBIll
Intercffice conference regavding claims 0.00
Interpretation i -
89971 T TIME GHP 120 175.00 210.00
2125102 Misc . 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00

23
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Slip iD Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time ’ Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Varance
Stralegy discussion seeel SRl 0.00
AR
L ]
90422 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
2/25/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
WP BLNT-0001LT ¢.00
Further preparation for trial including 0.00
numerous telecons with Bill Mclaughlin
and Dean Monco. Follow-up question
posed by opposing counsel ikl
AR
A
89976 TIME GHP 210 175.00 367.50
2{26/02 Misc . 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Strategy discussion with Charles W. . 0.00
Gaines about
90423 TIME WOH 4.70 350.00 1645.00
212602 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further preparation for trial. S d 0.00
L ———— 2
m, Including numerous
te-wording transmission to opposing
counsel. s
W P!anning for pretrial conference.
89848 TIME GWB 1.0 275.00 275.00
2/26/02 Misc 1.00 T@t
WIP . - BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Da NolBill
Interoffice conference reﬂardingb 0.00
S : '
89974 TIME GHP % 5.30 175.00 927.50
2/26/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparing Charts for Bint Trial. e 0.00
89975 TIME GHP 1.50 175.00 262.50
2126402 Draft 0.00 T@
Wwip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft Motion/Brief for 60-Day 0.00
Continuance—Send to opposing counsel.
89677 TIME CWG 2.50 230.00 725.00
2/26/02 Review 0.00 T@
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review exhibit charts and interoffice 0.00
JT-APP 2979
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Slip ID ; Attorney Units Rate Stip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Infa
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Descriplion File - Variance
conference with Greg Parker regarding
89682 TIME CWG 7.50 290.00 2175.00
2127102 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip - BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare claim construction chart. 0.00
BOT14 . TIME TAM 0.50 65.00 3250
2127102 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Transmittal-of documents to co-counsel; 0.00
sarvice of pleading on opposing counsel.
89715 TIME . TAM 0.50 65.00 32.50
2027102 . Misc 0.00 T@1
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare documents for preduction. 0.00
§9978 TIME GHP 340 175.00 595.00
2127102 . Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip . - BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparing Claims interp. Chart. 0.00
89977 . TIME GHP 3.10 175.00 542 .50
2127102 . Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparing Charts for Bint Trial. 0.00
90424 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
2127102 . Work on 0.00 T@t :
wip - BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work.on 3 motions and numeragus calls to 0.00
council to court and to client.
8998G TIME GHP 1.70 175.00 29750
2{28/02 Misc 0.00 Tt
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Strategy Discusslons with William D. 0.00
Harris, Jr. regarding Gl -
i
90425 TIME WDH . 2.00 350.00 700.00
228102 Mise 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further work on 3 motions. 0.00
92050 TIME CAG 1.00 75.00 75.0
3M/02 Revise 0.00 T °
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 -
Revise pleadings index. 0.00
JT-APP 2980
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Motion in Limine,

8122102 HITT GAINES & BOISBRUN, P.C.

10:34 AM Slip Listing

Slip ID Attorney Units
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time
Posting Status Client Est. Time
Description File Variance

852492 TIME WODH .
3/4/02 Misc 0.00
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Follow-up on motion in limine made by G.00
opposing counsel.

92493 TIME WDH 0.30
3/5/02 Work on 0.00
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on pleadings. 0.00

92169 TIME TAM 0.20
3/5/02 Misc 0.00
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Update pleadings index. . 0.00

92494 TIME WDH 3.50
3/6/02 Review 0.00
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review of depositions to look for wamiliiy: 0.00
]

Simiemiemsewdeng Further work on our
responsive memo.

92495 TIME WDH 0.50
311/02 Misc 0.00
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Attention to Motion To Strike. 0.00

92013 TIME GHP 0.70
3/13/02 Misc 0.00
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Strategy discussions with WDH regarding 0.00
reply to Protective Order.

92496 TIME WDH 3.00
3/13/02 Draft 0.00
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft and revisions to draft to responsive 0.00
mema.

92016 TIME - GHP 4.80
3M14/02 Misc 0.00
wIP BLNT-Q0OHLT 0.00
Legal Research Regarding Oplnion of 0.00
Counsel Issue.

92018 TIME GHP 570
3/15/02 Draft 0.00
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Drafi/Review/File Response ta Def. 0.00

Page 26
Rate  Slip Value
Rate Info
Bill Status
. 175.00
T@t
350.00 105.00
T@1
65.00 13.00
Tt . -
350.00 1225.00
T@1
350.00 175.00
T@1
175.00 122.50
T@
350.00 1050.00
T@1
175.00 840.00
T@an
175.00 997.50
T@1
JT-APP 2081
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Slip ID Attomey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Descriplion File Variance
92497 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
3115/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Completion of response to motion for 0.00
protective order.
92172 TIME TAM 0.20 65.00 13.00
3/25/02 Misc 0.00 T@1t
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Update pleadings index. 0.00
92498 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 - 350.00
3127102 Misc 0.00 T@1 )
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Determining the changes needed for 0.00
meeting the new disclosure of pretrial
material (April 19, 2002} and pretrial
conference. i igwof
1T .,
Ry,
]
92499 TIME WDH 0.40 350.00 140.00
3128102 Misc 0.00 T T@t
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
0.00
94597 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
471102 Work on 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Working on findings of fact and review or 0.00
requirements by Court in the new
scheduling order.
94598 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400,00
4/2/02 Waork on 0.00 Ta1
WP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on Findings of fact. 0.00
84599 TIME WDH 2.50 350.00 875.00
4/15/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
94600 TIME WOH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
4/16/02 Work on 0.00 T@1i
wip . BLNT-0001LT 0.00 .
Work on additional findings of fact and first 0.00
draft of set of conclusions of faw.
JT-APP 2982
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10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 28
Slip 1D Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bl Status
Description File Variance
94273 TIME GHP 2. 175.00 490.00
4/16/02 Research 0.00 T@t
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Research damages issues for William D. 0.00
Harris.
94601 TIME WHBH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
417102 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trlal and preparation of 0.00
submission to court. Further work on
findings of fact and conclusions of law.
Study of Markman type for claim
Interpretation.
94275 TIME GHP .5.10 175.00 892 .50
4/17102 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 .
Formulate claim construction/findings of 0.00
fact and conclusions of law/researc
damages convoy issue,
94280 TIME GHP 4.30 175.00 752.50
4/18/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WiP - BLNT-0001LT 0.060
Trial brief. 0.00
94602 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
4/18/02 Work on . 0.00 T@1
wiP | BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on trial brief. 0.00
94281 TIME GHP 10.30 175.00 1802.50
4/19/02 Misc 0.00 T@t
wiP BULNT-0001LT 0.00
Complete/Review/File findings of factand 0.00
conclusions of law, pretrial order,
contested issues of fact and stipulated
facts. -
94603 TIME WDH 7.00 350.00 2450.00
4/19/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Brief and preparation time on trial brief 0.00
and on submission of pretrial material
including pretriat erder.
94604 . TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
4/22{02 Misc .00 T@t
wip . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Follow-up to pretrial filings and further 0.00
preparation. Telecon with Golden Blount.
JT-APP 2983
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Dates and Time Aclivity DNB Time Rate Info
Posling Status Client Est: Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance .
94605 “TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
4123102 Prepare 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00
94420 TIME CWG 2.00 290.00 580.00
4124102 Misc 0.00 Tt ;
Wip BLNT-Q001LT 0.00
Interoffice conference with Bill Harris and 0.00
Greg Parker regarding
84606 TIME WDH 300 350.00 1050.00
4124102 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001 LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00
94290 TIME GHP 4.10 175.00 717.50
4/25/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
‘wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of demonstrative evidence. 0.00
94020 TIME CAG 1.40 75.00 105.00
4/25/02 : Misc ) 0.00 T
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Obitain coples of cases cited in pre-trial 0.00
pleadings.
94291 TIME GHP 4.30 175.00 752.50
4/25/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial preparation with Charles Gaines and 0.00
Bill Harris
94292 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 22750
4125102 Misc 0.00 T
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Read/Review cases in defendant's 0.00
findings of fact and conclusions of law.
94423 TIME CWG 8.50 290.00 2465.00
4/25/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
WIP - BLNT-0001LY 0.00
Interoffice conference with Bill Harris and 0.00
Greg Parker regardtng—i.
e
T
-
94607 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
412502 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. . 0.00

JT-APP 2984
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Slip 1D Attomey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

94608 TIME WDH 6.00 ~ 350.00 2100.00
4/26/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further preparations for trial. 0.00

94295 TIME GHP 7.70 175.00 1347.50
4/26/02 Misc 0.00 T@i
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Continued preparation of demonstrative 0.00
evidence.

94426 TIME CWG .3.00 290.00 _B70.00
4/29/02 Misc 0.00 T@1 '
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Interoffice conference with Bill Harris and 0.00
Greg Parker regarding "l y .

94609 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
4/29/02 Prepare 0.00 Ta1 :
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00

94300 TIME GHP 6.20 175.00 1085.00
4/29/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wWiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial preparation with Charles Gaines and 0.00
Bill Harsis.

94431 TIME CWG 4.50 290.00 1305.00
4/30/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Meeting with Golden Blount regarding 0.00

AN interoffice conference with Biil
Harris regarding Jmisreview other
pretrial materials. ]

94301 TIME GHP 9.30 175.00 1627.50
4/30/02 Misc 0.00 T@1 :
wIp BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial preparation with Charles Galnes and .00
Bilt Harris.

94610 TIME WDH 6.00 350.00 2100.00
4/30/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 -

Preparation for trial. 0.00

96168 TIME CWG 450 290.00 1305.00
5/1/02 Prepare 0.00 T
wipP BUNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare trial exhibits and other materials. 0.00

JT-APP 2985
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Slip ID Altorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Flle Variance
95647 TIME GHP 10.70 175.00 187250
5/1/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 :
Trial preparation. C.00
98917 * TIME WDH 6.00 350.00 2100.00
5/1/02 Prepare 0.00 T@at
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00
95991 TIME CAG .3.00 75.00 225.00
512102 Misc 0.00 T )
wip BLNT-0001LT .00
Assist with preparation of trial notebooks. 0.00
96174 TIME CWG 6.00 290.00 1740.00
5/2/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare Golden Blount for trial. 0.00
96230 TIME TAM 5.50 65.00 357.50
5/2/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of exhibit notebooks for trial. 0.00
95649 TIME GHP 12.40 175.00 2170.00
5/2/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial preparation. 0.00
98918 TIME WDH 8.00 350.00 2800.00
512102 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-Q001LT €.00
Preparation for trial. Extended meeting 0.00
with Golden Blount and intense trial
‘preparation.
95992 TIME CAG 3.50 75.00 262.50
5/3/02 Misc 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
"Assist with preparation of &rial materials. 0.00
96175 TIME CWG 2.00 290.00 © 580.00
5/3/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Attend pre-trial conference. Q.00
95650 TIME GHP 2.20 175.00 385.00
5/3/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT - 0.00
Preparation for Pretrial Conference. 0.00
JT-APP 2955
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86231 TIME TAM .

513/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
Wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of exhibit notebooks. 0.00

95652 TIME GHP 3.10 175.00
513102 : Misc 0.00 Tt
wiF BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Begin preparation of Markman Brief. 0.00

95651 TIME GHP 210 175.00
513/02 Misc 0.00 Tan
WwIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Pretrial conference. 0.00

98919 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00
513/02 Prepare 0.00 Tal
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation and attendance at Pretrial 0.00
Conference. Preliminary considerations
on Markman brief.

95653 TIME GHP 270 175.00
5/16/02 Misc 0.00 Tl
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discusslons with William O. Harris, Jr. and 0.00
Charles W. Galnes regarding Jililimemy
iy

96479 TIME CWG 1.50 280.00
5/6/02 Misc 0.00 Tt

-WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Interoffice conference reﬂarding 0.00

95654 TIME GHP 410 175.00
87162 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip ) . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Begin preparation of Markman Brief. ) 0.00

98920 TIME WDH 0.80 350.00

- §/8/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
Wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Checking status of Markman brief and 0.00
Tnputs.

95655 TIME GHP 9.70 175.00
5/8/02 Misc 0.00 Tt
‘wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
‘Preparation of Markman Brief. ) .00

Slip Value

542.50
367.50

700.00

472.50

435.00

717.50

280.00

1697.50

Page 3z
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Slip ID Aftorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Status
Description File’ Variance
. 85657 TIME - GHP 4.30 175.00 752.50
5/9/02 - Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation of Markman Brief. 0.00
95659 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 227.50
5/9/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BUNT-0001LT 0.00
Discussions with William D. Harris, Jr. 0.00
regarding
98921 TIME WDH 0.00 350.00 0.00
5/9/02 Work on 0.00 T@1 )
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on Markman brief. 0.00
98922 TIME *- WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
5M10/02 Work on 0.00 T@1
wipP " BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on Markman brief. 0.00
95660 TIME GHP 1.10 175.00 192.50
5M10/02 Miso 0.00 T@1
WP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discussions with Chardes W. Gaines 0.00
regarding NS
95661 TIME GHP 1.80 175.00 315.00
5/10/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wWIP BLNT-C001LT 0.00
Incorporate William D. Harris, Jr.'s 0.00
Markman Brief suggestions of May 9,
2002,
95662 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 227.50
-5/10/02 Review 0.00 T@t
WIP BUNT-0001LT 0.00
r 0.00
95666 TIME GHP 2.40 175.00 420.00
513102 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discuss claim interpretation with William 0.00
D. Harris, Jr. and make changes.
98923 TIME WODH 1.00 350.00 350.00
5/15/02 Work on 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on Markman brief. 0.00
JT-APP 29838
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10:34 AM Slip Listing Page 34

Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Stalus Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance )

95672 TIME GHP 310 175.00 542 50
515102 Misc 0.00 T@a1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Work on claim interpretation. 0.00

96208 TIME - CWG 2.50 280.00 725.00
5/16/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Conference with Bill Harris and Greg 0.00
Parker regarding

95676 TIME GHP 8.30 175.00 1452.50
5/16/02 Misc 0.00 T@1t .
WipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discuss claim interpretation with William 0.00
D. Harris, Jr. and make changes.

96232 TIME TAM 2.00 65.00 130.00
5/17/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip : . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Assist In preparation and service gf 0.00
Markman Brief. -

95678 TIME GHP 9.10 175.00 1592 .50
517102 Misc 0.00 TE@1 '
wiP ) BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Finalize and file claim interpretation. 0.00

85679 TIME GHP 0.90 175.00 157.50
5/20/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discussions with Willlam D. Harris, Jr. 0.00
about finalized version of claim
interpretation.

95684 TIME GHP 0.80 175.00 140.00
5/21/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
WIP BLNT-0001LY 0.00
Varlous conversations biw myself, William 0.00
D. Harvis, Jr. and Charles W. Galnes
regarding the

96238 . TIME GHP 2.30 175.00 402.50
5128102 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LY 0.00
General discussions regarding the hearing - 0.00
before Maﬁistrate Stickne‘, as well as

SN,

96247 TIME GHP 6.10 175.00 1067.50
5128102 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP , BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discussions with William D. Harrls and 0.00
Chares W. Gaines regarding uxsliliimeny

JT-APP 2989
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Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Siip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
_Description File Variance
e
f iRy,
96224 TIME CWG 1.00 290.00 2980.00
5130102 Interoffice 0.00 Ta1
WIP BLNT-Q001LT 0.00
Interoffice conference with Bill Harris and 0.00
Greg Parker regarding onnlmesengys
O i
ke Y
96236 TIME TAM 0.50 65.00 - 32.50
5/30/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0004LT 0.00
Locate and obtain copies of case law. 0.00
96243, TIME GHP 5.20 175.00 810.00
5/30/02 Draft 0.00 T@1 .
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 -
Draft Markman Repty. 0.00
96244 TIME GHP 3.20 175.00 560.00
5/31/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for and hearing before Judge 0.00
Stickney regarding Bill McLaughlln asa
witness.
96245 TIME GHP 6.10 175.00 1067.50
5131/02 Draft 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft Markman Reply. - 0.00
98182 - TIME GHP 8.20 175.00 1435.00
6/3/02 Draft 0.00 T@1
wiP BUNT-0001LT 0.00
Draft/Formalize/File Markman Reply. 0.00
98940 TIME WDH 7.00 350.00 2450.00
6/3/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further work of WDH on Reply Brief and 0.00
filing of same,
98941 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
6126102 Prepare 0.00 Ta1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for and conference 0.00
conceming the start-up of an orderly trial
preparation for the trial setting of July 29,
30 and 31.
98212 TIME GHP 0.90 175.00 1567.50
6/26/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00

JT-APP 2990
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Slip ID Atorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File . Variance

100085 TIME GHP 13.70 175.00 239750
7/24/G2 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial Preparation. 0.00

99852 TIME CwWG 2.00 290.00 580.00
7125102 Prepare 0.00 T@1
Wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare for trial, 0.00

101147 TIME WDH 3.50 350.00 1225.00
7125102 Prepare 0.00 T@1 S
wip ) BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial including interview 0.00
with Mr. Blount.

100086 TIME GHP 13.90 175.00 2432.50
7/25/02 Mise 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-000$LT 0.00
Tral Preparation. 0.00

100087 TIME GHP 14.00 175.00 2450.00
7126/02 Misc 0.00. T@t
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial Preparation. 0.00

99856 TIME CWG 5.00 290.00 1450.00
7126102 Misc 0.00 . T@
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial preparation. G.00

101148 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
7/26/02 Prepare 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00

101149 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
7127102 Prepare 0.00 T@an
wip . BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial including interview 0.00
with Mr. Blount.

99996 TIME TAM 8.00 65.00 520.00
7127102 Misc - 0.00 T@1
wip BUNT-0001LT 0.00
Assistin preparation of trial, prepare 0.00
duplicates of defendant's exhibits.

99857 TIME CWG 11.00 290.00 3190.00 -
Ti27102 Misc . 6.00 Ta1l ’
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
“Trial preparation. 0.00

JT-APP 2991
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Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
100088 TIME GHP 12.00 175.00 2100.00
7127102, Misc 0.00 T@1
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial Preparation. 0.00
101150 TIME WODH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
7/28/02 Prepare .06 Tat
wip BILNT-C001LT 0.00
Preparation for trial. 0.00
99858 TIME CWG 6.00 290.00 1740.00
7728102 Prepare 0.00 Ta1
WipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Prepare withess materials, 0.00
99997 TIME TAM 4.00 65.00 260.00
7/28/02 Misc - 0.00 T@1
wiP BENT-0001LT 0.00 .
Assist in preparation for trial, prepare trial 0.00
notebooks.
100089 TIME GHpP 9.50 175.00 1662.50
7/28/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial Preparation. 0.00
99859 TIME CWG 13.00 2980.00 3770.00
7129/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Attend trlal and prepare materials for 0.00
following day.
100090 TIME GHP 15.50 175.00 2712.50
7/29/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial. 6.00
101151 TIME WDH 10.00 350.00 3500.00
7129102 Misc 0.00 T@i
WIR BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Further preparation for trial and 0.00
participation of first day at trial.
101152 TIME WDH 11.00 350.00 3850.00
7/130/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WP BLNT-00GILT 0.00
Further preparation for trial and 0.00
participation of second day at frial.
99860 TIME CWG 14.00 290.00 4060.00
7130102 . Misc 0.00 Ta1
wiP BLNT-GOO1ILT 0.00
Attend triat and prepare materials for 0.00
foliowing day.
JT-APP 2992
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Slip 1D Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info .
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
100091 TIME GHP 10 175.00 2992 50
7/30/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BINT-0001LT 0.00
Trial. 0.00 .
100092 TIME GHP 7.80 175.00 1365.00
7131102 Misc .0.00 Te1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Trial. 0.00
101153 TIME WDH 6.00 350.00 2100.00
7/31/02 Misc 0.00 T@1 :
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Early morning preparation for trial and 0.00
conclusicen of trial.
99861 TIME CWG 5.00 290.00 1450.00
7131102 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Attend trial. 0.00
Grand Total
Billable 1252.50 313381.50
Unbillable 2.00 550.00
Total 1254.60 313931.650
JT-APP 2993
A-47
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9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 1
Selection Crileria

Cilient (hand select) Include: BLNT-0001LT

Slip.Classification  Open

Slip.Date 8/1/02 - 6/10/04

Slip.Transaction Ty 1-1

Rate Info - identifies rate source and level

Slip 1D Attorney Unils Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description . File Variance

162080 TIME GHP 210 175.00 367.50
811102 Review 0.00 T@an : .
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of damages brief and discussions 0.060
with Bill Harris about filing damages brief.

103681 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
8/1102 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Further follow-up and analysis of whether .00
to file any subsequent documents.
Meeting with Greg Parker regarding same.

103682 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 525,00
8/12/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1l
wip : BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Initial study of Judge Buchmeyer's 0.00
opinion, conclusions, findings of fact nd
injunction.

103683 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
8/13/02 Misc 0.00 T@1

. WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Study of damage figures and initiation of 0.00
time spent by attomeys on case to go into .
damages.

102212 TIME CWG 0.50 300.00 1560.00
8/13/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wie BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Bill Harris regarding 0.00
settiement and Appeal.

102223 TIME CWG 2.50 300.00 750.00
8/14/02 Misc 0.00 Ta
wIpP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Telephone conference with client 0.00
regarding outcome of case; telephone
conference with judges' clerk regarding
findings of fact and conclusions of law;
interoffice conference with Bill Harris
regarding post trial strategy.

JT-APP 2994

A-48



-

.“\/"

8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC
9:40 AM Slip tisting Page 2
Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
103684 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
8/14/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Consideration of the accuracy of the 0.00
damage numbers raised by opposing
counsel. Conference with Charles Gaines.
103686 TIME WDH 0.70 350.00 245.00
8/15/02 Misc 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
- Completion of draft of motion for sealing 0.00
confidentiat files and arrangements for
review by local counsel.
102227 TIME CWG 1.00 300.00 300.00
8/15/02 Misc 0.00 Tt
WwiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Telephone conference with opposing 0.00
counsel regarding post trial matters;
interoffice conference with Bill Harris
regarding attorney's fee calculation.
103685 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
8/15/02 Review 0.00 T@1
WP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Reviewing follow-up subject matter on 0.00
questions on opinion. Conference with
Charles Gaines.
103687 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
8/19/02 Misc 0.00 T
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on motions and papers regarding 0.00
the attorney fee award and costs; work on
pre and post interest questions and
related papers.
103688 TIME WDH 5.00 ~ 350.00 1750.00
8/20/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Further work on attorney fees and costs; 0.00
work on related papers.
102110 TIME GHP 3.10 175.00 542.50
8/20/02 Research 0.00 Tal
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Research and gather data for fee petition 0.00
for award of attomey's fees.
102237 TIME CWG 1.50 300.00 450.00
8/20/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Bill Harris regarding filing 0.00
of postrial motions and response to
Peterson's Motion; legal research
JT-APP 2995
A-49



8127104 HITT GAINES, PC

9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 3

Slip 1D Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
regarding timing for filing support for
attorney's fees.

102109 TIME GHP 0.80 175.00 140.00
8/20/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Read Defendant's Qpposition to Plaintiff's 0.00
Motion to Disregard the Testimony of
John Palaski - Discuss with William D.

Haris, Jr. and Charles W. Gaines.

103689 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
8/21/02 Misc 0.00 T@1 :
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hald
Continued work on attorney fee award 0.00
and costs and related papers.

102112 TIME GHP 40 175.00 1645.00
8/21/02 Research 0.00 Ta1
WIP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Research and gather data for fee petition 0.00
for award of attorney's fees.

103690 TIME WDH 5.50 350.00 1925.00
8/22/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on application for attorneys fees; 0.00
motion {o include updated damages and
pre and post judgement interest; bill of
costs; and related papers.

102113 TIME GHP 8.70 175.00 1522.50
8/22/02 Research 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Research and gather data for fee petition 0.00
for award of atforney’s fees, bill of costs,
pre and post judgement interest, further
drafted letter to Dean Monco requesting
that Defendant update its sales, reviewed
affidavits of Bill Harris and Roy Hardin,

102248 TIME - CWG 225 300.00 675.00
8/22/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discuss pos-trial motions with Bifl Harris 0.00
and Kim Eikjer.

103691 TIME WDH 6.00 350.00 2100.00
8/23/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-QOO1LT 0.00 Hold

‘Preparation of motions and papers 0.00
required to enter the attorney fees award
and cover taxable costs; moreover, to
obtain pre and post interest.
JT-APP 2996
A-50
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Slip Value

~1.00 85.00 65.00

8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC

9:40 AM Slip Listing

Shp 1D Attorney Units Rate
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

101942 TIME TAM
8/23/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Assist in preparation of bill of costs. 0.00

102251 TIME CWG 0.50 300.00
8/23/02 Revise 0.00 Ta@1
wWiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Revise Memorandum and Affidavit of Bill 0.00
Harris.

102114 TIME GHP 8.20 175.00
-8/23/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Complete/Review/File Motions for 0.00

Attomney’s Fee, increased damages,
suppoiting affidavits and bill of costs.

102115 TIME GHP 2.20 175.00
8/25/02 Read 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Read and think about Defendant's 0.00
Moations filed on August 23, 2002,

102118 TIME GHP 1.10 175.00
8/26/02 Misc 0.00 Ta
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Phone conversation with Mr. Golden 0.00
Blount and Charles W. Galnes.

102116 TIME GHP 0.90 175.00
8/26/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discussions with William D. Harris, Jr. and 0.00
Charles W. Gaines regarding motions filed
by Defendant on August 23, 2002,

103692 TIME WODH 2.00 350.00
8/26/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Follow-up regarding documents filed with 0.00
the Court on 8/23/02,

103693 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00
8127/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review of court's entry regarding Bill of 0.00
Costs. Sending copy of same to Dean
Monco.

101943 TIME TAM 1.50 65.00
8/30/02 Misc .00 T@1

- WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Organize pleadings filed since trial, update 0.00

pleadings file.

Hold
150.00

Hold

1435.00
~ Hold

385.00
Hold

192.50
Hold

157.50
Hold

700.00
Hold

700.00
Hold

97.50
Hold

Page 4
JT-APP 2997
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8127104 HITT GAINES, PC

9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 5

Slip D Attormney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

103694 TIME WDH 2.00 X 700.00
8/30/02 Misc .00 Tt
wip - BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preliminary review of post trial mations 0.00
and consultation with Charles Gaines.

102125 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 227.50
8/31/02 Review 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review Defendant's Motions. 0.00

104246 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 525.00
9/3/02 Review 0.00 T@1 .
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of Peterson's effort to credit 0.00
Palaski's testimony, review of findings of
fact and conclusions of law as relates to
the Palaski question.

104248 TIME GHP 1.20 175.00 210.00
9/3/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
Wwip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Conversations with Bill Harris and Charles 0.00
W. Gaines regarding replies and
responses to Def. Motions, as well as time
frame for each.

104251 TIME GHP 2.70 175.00 472.50
9/4/02 Review 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review, prepare, and file Plaintiffs reply to 0.00
Defendants response to Palaski Motion.

104752 TIME WDH 4.50 350.00 1675.00
914102 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Further review of Peterson's paper as 0.00
relates to testimony of Palaski. A

104258 TIME GHP 1.90 175.00 332.50
9/9/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Conversations with Bill Harris and Charles 0.00
W. Gaines regarding replies and
responses to Def. Motions.

104758 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
9/8/02 Review 0.00 Tat
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of outstanding motions and 0.00
preparatory work on those for which
response is required.

JT-APP 2998
A-52
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8127104 HITT GAINES, PC
9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 6
Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
-Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
164760 TIME WDH 350 350.00 1225.60
9/10/02 Misc 0.00 T@t
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Analysis of second motion to amend 0.00 .
findings of fact, conclusions of law and
-consultation concerning method of
attaining a transcript.
104263 TIME GHP 210 175.00 367.50
9/11/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for filing and drafting motions. 0.00 )
104763 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
9/11/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Altention to requirement_ 0.00
ﬁ;ollew-up on status of
criptand jolnt motion to postpone.
104409 TIME CWG 1.00 300.00 300.00
9/12/02 Misc 0.00 Tt
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Teleconferences with Bill McLaughlin, 0.00
Jerry Sellinger and Gloria Parker
regarding transcript.
104390 TIME TAM 1.00 65.00 65.00
912/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Prepare correspondence and documents 0.00
for transmittal to client.
104389 TIME TAM 0.30 65.00 19.50
9/12/02 Misc 0.00 Tat
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Update pleadings file. c.00 :
104265 TIME GHP 1.70 175.00 297 .50
8/12/02 Misc " 0.00 Tal
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Begin reading 600+ page trial transcript. 0.00
104267 TIME GHP 2.80 175.00 490.00
9/13/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continue reading 600+ page tria 0.00
transcript.
104268 TIME GHP 2.10 175.00 367.50
-9/14/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continue reading 600+ page trial 0.00
transcript.
JT-APP 2999
A-53
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8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC

9:.40 AM Slip Listing Page

Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rale Info -
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

104767 TIME WDH 450 350.00 1575. 06
9/16/02 Misc 0.00 T@t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 ’ Hold
Study of transcript 0.00

104269 TIME GHP 9.10 175.00 1592.50
9/16/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WP , BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continue reading 600+ page trial 0.00
transcript.

104770 TIME WDH . 5.00 350.00 1750.00
9/17/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Further review of transcript and 0.00
preparatxon for response to Plaintiff's
f)endmg rhotions.

- 104270 . TIME GHP 8.20 175.00 1435.00

9/17/02 Misc 0.00 T@t
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continue reading 600+ page trial 0.00
transcript; research issues for Motion;
multiple conversations with Bill Harris and
Charles W. Gaines.

104271 TIME GHP 9.40 175.00 1645.00
9/18/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Begin Motions. 0.00

104773 TIME WDH 6.00 350,00 2100.00
9/18/02 Misc 0.60 T@1
wip BLNT-00Q1LT 0.00 Hold
‘Further work on responses. 0.00

104430 TIME CWG 1.00 300.00 300.00
9/19/02 Misc 0.00 T@1t
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Interoffice conference with Greg Parker 0.00
and Bill Hamris regarding response brief;
review draft of response brief to
Peterson's request for a new trial.

104775 TIME WDH 8.00 350.00 2800.00
9/19/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Completion of brief in reply to Defendant's 0.00
Second Motion to Amend.

JT-APP 3000
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9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 8

Slip ID Attomey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

104276 TIME GHP 8.70 175.00 152250
9/19/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Complete and file motions. 0.00

104777 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 525.00
9/20/02 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0GO1LT 0.00 Hold
Planning responses to outstanding 0.00
motions and briefs of Peterson.

104278 TIME GHP 3.30 175.00 577.50
9/20/02 Review 0.00 T@1l S
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review and discuss Defendant's Motions 0.00
received on September 19, 2002.

104779 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
9/23/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Final review of first motion to amend 0.00
findings of fact and conclusions of law and
preparation of the draft of a response.

Follow-up to see response was being fited
and served/

104279 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 227.50
9/23/02 Review 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review and discuss Defendant's Motions 0.00
received on September 19, 2002.

104281 TIME GHP 3.10 175.00 542.50
9/24/02 Research 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Research and discuss Defendant's 0.00
‘Motions received on September 19, 2002.

104282 TIME GHP 5.50 175.00 962.50
9/25/02 Research 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hoid
Research and discuss Defendant's 0.00
Mations received on September 19, 2002.

104284 TIME GHP 6.70 175.00 1172.50
9/26/02 Research 0.00 Ta
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Research Case Law regarding 0.00
Defendant's Motions.

104286 TIME GHP 10.70 175.00 1872.50
9127102 Draft 0.00 T@1
wirP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Draft response to Defendant's Damage 0.00
Motion.

JT-APP 3001
A-55



8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC
9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 9
Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
104287 TIME GHP 3.10 17500 54250
09/28/02 Draft 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-C001LT 0.00 Hold
Draft response to Defendant’'s Damage 0.00
Motion.
104446 TIME CWG 3.00 300.00 900.00
9/29/02 Review 0.00 T@1
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review and revise draft of response to 0.00
Defendant's Motion ta reduce damages.
104288 TIME GHP 8.90 175.00 1557.50
9/29/02 Draft 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-C001LT 0.00 Hold
- Draft response to Defendant's Damage 0.00
Motion,
104289 TIME GHP 11.10 175.00 1942.50
9/30/02 Draft 0.00 a1
WIP BLNT-0001LT ¢.00 Hold
Draft response to Defendant's Damage 0.00
Moticn.
104786 TIME WDH 1.60 350.00 525.00
9/30/02 Review 0.00 T@t
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Reviewing draft of our reply to defendant's 0.00
opposition to our motion regarding
damages and conferring with Greg Parker
regarding my findings.
104447 TIME CWG 1.50 300.00 450.00
9/30/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hoid
Interoffice conference with Greg Parker 0.00
regarding revisions to response; revise
second draft with Greg Parker; search
case law regarding inducement.
106452 TIME GHP 9.50 175.00 1662.50
10/1/02 Draft 0.00 Tt
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Draft Plaintiff's reply to defendant's 0.00
objection application for aftomeys' fees.
108881 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
10/2/02 Misc 0.00 Ta1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hoid
Brainstorming conference with Greg 0.00
Parker and review of draft of Reply to
Defendant's objections to Blount's claim
for attorneys fees.
JT-APP 3002
A-56
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9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 10

Slip ID Attomey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

106453 TIME GHP 7.30 175.00 1277.50
10/2/02 Draft 0.00 T@1
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Draft Plaintiff's reply to defendant's 0.00
objection application for attorneys' fees.

106455 TIME GHP 6.20 175.00 1085.00
10/3/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
WiP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Complete Plaintiff's reply to defendant's 0.00
objection to application for attoreys' fees.

108882 TIME WOH 250 350.00 ‘875.00
10/3/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Further riview and revision of drafts for 0.00

108883 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
10/4/02 Prepare 0.00 T@t
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation of Proffer For In Camera 0.00
inspection, final inputs a ts
o s D

106460 TIME GHP 1.50 175.00 262.50
10/7/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Interoffice discussions with Charles W. 0.00
Gaines and Bill Harris.

106211 TIME TAM 0.30 65.00 19.50
10/7/02 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wipP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Prepare documents for transmittal to client. 0.00

108884 TIME WDH 0.90 350.00 315.00
1017102 Misc 0.00 T@t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Cursory review of defendant's reply to our 0.00
‘response to 2nd motion to amend findings
of fact and conclusions of law. Short
conference with Charles Gaines and Greg
Parker.

106212 TIME TAM Q.70 65.00 45.50
10/8/02 Misc 0.00 T@?
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Update pleadings file. 0.00

106461 TIME GHP 1.90 175.00 332.50
10/8/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wirP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Motion to amend the findings of fact and 0.00
conclusions of law.

JT-APP 3003
A-57
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Slip ID Attormey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
108885 TIME WDH 1.80 350.00 630.00
10/8/02 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Critical review of reply to our answer 0.00

regarding second motion for damages
findings and deciding how to proceed.

106311 TIME CWG 1.00 300.00 300.00
10/9/02 Review 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LY 0.00 Hold
Review Peterson's reply brief, interoffice 0.00

canference with Bill Harris and Greg
Parker regarding same.

114027 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 525.00
2/7/03 < Review 0.00 @l
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of Order from Judge Buchmeyer 0.00

ruiing on plaintiff and defendant's post-trial
motions. Conversations with Charles
Gaines and Greg Parker regarding court's

order.
113217 ° TIME GHP 5.30 175.00° 927.50
2/10/03 Review 0.00 Tat
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review Judge's Order and Notice of 0.00
Appeal Issues.
113220 TIME GHP 0.90 175.00 157.50
2/11/03 Misc 0.00 Tat
WIiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with WDH and Chatles W. 0.00
Gailnes and review files.
114028 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 525.00
2/17/03 Misc 0.00 T
-Wip ~ BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Attention to request for extension of time ¢.00

in order to provide sales from May 1, 2002
fo August 9, 2002. Review draft of same.
Telecons with opposing counsel's
assistant. Interoffice conference on

request.

115094 TIME WODH 1.00 350.00 350.00
2/18/03 Review 0.00 T@
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of sufficiency of injunction. 0.00

113229 TIME GHP 1.70 175.00 297.50
2/18/03 Misc 0.00 Tan
wip BLNT-0001LT .00 Hold
Discussions with WDH and Charles W. 0.00

Gaines; review files and review Docket.

JT-APP 3004
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9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 12
Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
113219 TIME GHP 320 175.00 560.00
2/19/03 Misc 0.00 Ta@1
WipP BLNT-00Q1LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with WDH and Charles W. 0.00
Gaines and review Injunction issues.
115085 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 525.00
2/19/03 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Meeting and review of Moore's treatise 0.00
plus cases located by Greg Parker.
114029 TiME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
2121103 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Consideration of request from opposing 0.00
counsel to agree that one supercedes
bond will be adequate fo cover damages
and attomeys fees and that the combined
bond could be posted at a shortly
extended time.
114030 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
2124103 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of draft letter from opposing 0.00
counsel regarding draft letter agreement
setting forth the terms discussed
regarding extension of time to execute the
Judge's Order.
113238 TIME GHP 210 175.00 367 50
2/24/03 Draft 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Draft reply letter to Defendant's Response 0.00
to Court's Order of February 6, 2003.
113244 TIME GHP 140 175.00 245.00
2128103 Draft 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Draft/finalize reply letter to Defendant's 0.00
Response to Court's Order of February 6,
2003.
114031 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
2/28/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions and inputs on a court paper 0.00-
we filed to combat opponent's effort to get
product retums subtracted.
114713 TIME GHP 2.20 175.00 385.00
3/10/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with WDH and Greg H. 0.00
JT-APP 3005
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Description File Variance .
Parker, review rules of appellate
procedure and fed. Cir. Rules.

114715 TIME GHP 1.40 17500 245.00
3/11/03 Review 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review Final Order, Review Fed. Cir. 0.00
Rules.

115109 TIME WDH 030 . 350.00 105.00
3/11/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Further study of Judge Buchmeyer's . 0.00 .
recent affirmation order.

114717 TIME GHP 6.80 175.00 140.00
3/13/03 Misc 0.00 Tai
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Calcuiate damage amount/speak with 0.00
WDH about Dist. Clerk error in sending
Appeal to 5th Cir.

114723 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 227.50
314/03 Misc 0.00 T@l
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with WDH and Greg H. 0.00
Parker research Fed. Cir. issue.

114726 TIME GHP 2.40 175.00 420.00
3/16/03 Misc 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Reading Entire Fed. Cir. Rules. .00

115110 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
3/17/03 ' Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Altention to amended points on appeal by 0.00
Peterson Study appellant rules.

114728 TIME GHP 0.70 175.00 122.50
3/17/03 Review 0.00 T@1
wWIP - ' BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review prejudgment interest issue. 0.00

114727 TIME GHP 040 175.00 70.00

3/17/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIiP A BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussion with Charles W. Gaines about 0.00
prejudgment interest.

114732 TIME GHP 280 175.00 490.00
3/18/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Chardes W. Gaines and 000
WDH regarding appeal, review ruies of

JT-APP 3006
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fed. ¢ir., contact clerk of fed. cir.

115111 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
3721103 Misc 0.00 T@1
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Conference with Charles Gaines 0.00
regarding supercedes versus escrow with
bank and examining the proper numbers
fo use for same.

114739 TIME GHP 1.80 175.00 315.00
3/24/03 Misc 0.00 T )
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 " Hold
Read Escrow Agreement, discussions 0.00
with WDH and Charles W. Gaines,
contact BOT to discuss local Escrow
Agreement.

114745 TIME GHP 1.30 175.00 227.50

- 3127103 Misc 0.00 T@1

wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with WDH and Charles W, 0.00
Gaines.

115112 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
3/27/03 Misc 0.00 T1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Further review of suggested escrow 0.00
agreement; interoffice conference
conceming whether to allow an extension
to defendant on supplying listing of
appendix contents; telecon with Jennifer
Fitzgerald {new litigation counsel for
defendant} concerning the extension and
an extension for plaintiff and follow-up
discussions.

115113 TIME WDH 1.50 350.00 525.00
3/28/03 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
‘Final review and markup of draft of 0.00
escrow agreement for forwarding to
defendant’s counsel.

114749 TIME GHP 0.80 175.00 140.00
3/31/03 Review 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review and finalize Notice of Appearance 0.00
and interested persons documents.

118327 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
4/1/03 Misc 0.00 Tal
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Details concerning review, execution and 0.00

filing Entry of Appearance and Certificate

Page 14
JT-APP 3007
A-61



8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC
9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 15
Slip 1D Attormey Units . Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
of Interest. E-mails to Jennifer Fitzgerald.
118328 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
4/2/03 Misc 0.00 Tal
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Final changes in escrow draft and email 0.00
transmission of same to opposing counsel.
118329 TIME WDH 1.00 350.00 350.00
4/8/03 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wipP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Interoffice meeting of WDH with Greg .00 .
Parker.
118330 TIME WOH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
4/21/03 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Matters having to do with designation of 0.00
record on appeal.
116257 TIME GHP 1.70 175,00 297.50
4/30/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0G01LT 0.00 Hold
Docketing updates; conversations wiht 0.00
Charles W. Gaines and Lee Hutchinson;
work on Escrow agreement.
117521 TIME GHP 1.60 175.00 280.00
5/1/03 Misc 0.00 T@1 -
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Charles W. Gaines and 0.00
calculation of superseadeas bond amount.
117523 TIME GHP 430 175.00 752.50
5/6/03 Prepare 0.00 Tat
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Prepare and review Appendix Documents. 0.00
120123 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
5120/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Cursory review of defendant Peterson’s 0.00
brief. Interoffice meeting with Greg Parker.
117548 TIME GHP 6.30 175.00 1102.50
5/21/03 Review 0.00 T@1
‘wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hoid
"Review Appellant's Brief. 0.00
120124 TIME WDH 5.50 350.00 1925.00
5/21/03 Review 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-Q001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of opposing brief and study of 0.00
certain portions of records. Extended
meeting with Greg Parker.
JT-APP 3008
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117550 TIME GHP .70 175.00 997 50
5122/03 Review 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review Appellant's Brief and discussions 0.00
with William D. Harris, Jr.

117553 TIME GHP 3.30 175.00 577.50
5123103 Review 0.00 T@1
Wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review Appellant's Brief and discussions 0.00
with William D. Harris, Jr.

120125 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
5/27/03 Misc 0.00 T@1t
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Consultation with Greg Parker on points in 0.00
defendant’s brief.

120126 TIME WDH 5.50 350.00 1925.00
5/28/03 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wWiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for and meeting of WDH with 0.00
Charles Gaines and Greg Parker
regarding preparation of our responsive
brief.

120127 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
5129/03 Work on 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on studylng Defendant's brief and 0.00
study of text in cases.

120128 TIME WDH 2.00 350.00 700.00
5/30/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Legal research. 0.00 '

117559 TIME GHP 6.60 175.00 1155.00
5/31/03 Review 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review Trial Transcript. 0.00

118233 TIME CWG 4.00 300.00 1200.00
6/1.03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Read trial transcript. 0.00

118771 TIME GHP 5.40 175.00 945.00
6/1/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
WiP BLNT-Q001LT 0.00 Hold
Reading transcript. 0.00

118772 TIME GHP 11.10 175.00 1942.50
6/2/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wWiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold

JT-APP 3009
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Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
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Reading transcriptoutlining argument with 0.00
Charles W. Gaines.

120136 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
6/2/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Study of transcript and exhibits in ) 0.00
preparation for our brief answering
appellant.

118234 TIME CWG B.00 300.00 2400.00
6/2/03 Prepare 0.00 T@1 .
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 "~ Hold
Prepare issues outline for brief. 0.00

118235 TIME CWG 8.50 300.00 2550.00
6/3/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continue preparation of outline. 0.00

120137 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00 -
6/3/03 Misc 0.00 Tt
wIiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Study of transcript and exhibits in 0.00
preparation for our biief. Conference with
Charles Gaines and Greg Parker
regarding our preparations.

118773 TIME GHP 9.70 175.00 1697.50
6/3/03 Misc 0.00 Tat
Wie BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Reading transcript/outlining argument with 0.00
Charles W. Gaines.

120138 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
6/4/03 Misc 0.00 Tt
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Study of apfpendix and work in preparation 0.00
for our brief answering appeilants.

118774 TIME GHP 10.70 175.00 1872.50
614103 Misc 0.00 T@
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Reading transcriptfoutiining argument with 0.00
Chadeg W. Gaines.

118236 TIME CWG 8.00 300.00 2400.00
6/4/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wWipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Finalize preparation of outline. 0.00

118237 TIME CWG 2.00 300.00 £00.00
6/5/03 Misc 0.00 Tat
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Office conference with Biit Harris and 0.00

JT-APP 3010
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Greg Parker regarding oulline.
118777 TIME GHP 9.70 175.00 1697.50
6/6/03 Work on 0.00 Tt
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00
118778 TIME GHP 9.30 175.00 1627.50
6/9/G3 Work on 0.00 Tat
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00
118779 TIME GHP 8.90 175.00 1657.50
6/10/03 Work on 0.00 T@1 :
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00
118780 TIME GHP 9.80 175.00 1715.00
6/11/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief, 0.00
118238 TIME CWG 2.00 300.00 600.00
6/11/03 Review 0.00 T@t
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review and revise statement of facts. 0.00
118239 TIME CWG 1.50 300.00 450.00
6/12/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0C01LT 0.00 Hold
Office conference with Bifl Harris and 0.00
Greg Parker regarding brief.
118781 TIME GHP 10.40 175.00 1820.00
6112/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
"Work on Appeal Brief. - 0.00
118782 TIME GHP 9.00 175.00 1575.00
6/13/03 Work on 0.00 - TE
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00
118240 TIME CWG 4.00 300.00 1200.00
6/14/03 Review 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 6.00 Hold
Review case law for Standard review. 0.00
118783 TIME GHP 570 175.00 997.50
6/15/03 Work on 0.00 Tant
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00
JT-APP 3011
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118241 TIME CWG 3.00 300.00 800.00
6/15/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continue review of case law and prepare 0.00
draft of Stand of review.

120139 TIME WDH 7.00 350.00 2450.00
6/16/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0C01LT 0.60 Hold
Time for weekend and today on 0.00
preparation for brief on appeal. Review of
facts {transcript) etc.

118784 TIME GHP 12.10 175.00 2117.50

- 6/16/03 Work on 0.00 T@1

wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00. Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118242 TIME CWG 3.00 300.00 900.00
6/16/03 Review 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review and revise direction of ports 0.00
portion of brief.

118785 TIME GHP 12.50 175.00 2187.50
6/17/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
WIP . BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118786 TIME GHP 13.60 175.00 2380.00
6/18/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118787 TIME GHP 14.20 175.00 2485.00
6/19/03 Work on 0.00 T@al
WIP BLNT-0001LT .00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

120140 TIME WOH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
6/20/03 Work on 0.00 Tt
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on brief preparation. 0.00

118788 TIME GHP 13.20 175.00 2310.00
6/20/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0Q01LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118789 TIME GHP 4.00 175.00 700.00
6/21/03 Work on 0.00 T@t
wWIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work an Appeal Brief. 0.00

JT-APP 3012
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118790 TIME GHP 530 175.00 92750
6/22/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

120144 TiME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
6/23/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wiP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118791 TIME GHP 11.20 175.00 1960.00
6/23/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

120142 TIME WDH 4.00 350.00 1400.00
6/24/03 Work on 0.00 T@t
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118794 TIME GHP 10.60 175.00 1855.00
6/24/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118720 TIME CAG 1.00 90.00 90.00
6/25/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Shepardize cases cited in appeal brief. 0.00

120143 TIME WDH 6.00 350.00 2100.00
6/25/03 Work on 0.00 Tt
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118796 TIME GHP 8.30 175.00 1452.50
6/25/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118803 TIME GHP 11.30 175.00 1977.50
6/26/03 Work on 0.00 a1t
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeat Brief. 0.00

120144 TIME WDH 5.00 350.00 1750.00
'6/26/03 Work on 0.00 T
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118721 TIME CAG 0.80 90.00 72.00
6/26/03 Misc 0.00 Tt
wirP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Obtain parallel cites, Shepardize ) 0.00
additional cases, and review shert form
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citations.

120145 TiME WDH 8.00 350.00 2800.00
6/27/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118804 TIME GHP 10.90 175.00 1907.50
6/27/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.60

120146 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
6/28/03 Work on 0.00 Tat )
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

120147 TIME WDH 6.00 350.00 2100.00
6/28/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT -0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

118805 TIME GHP 4.20 175.00 735.00
6/29/03 Work on 0.00 T@1
wIP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Work on Appeal Brief. 0.00

120148 TIME WDH 3.00 350.00 1050.00
6/30/03 Misc 0.00 T@a1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Concluding work on brief. 0.00

118807 TIME GHP 9.50 175.00 1662.50
6/30/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BUNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Complete and File Appeal Brief. 0.00

118571 TIME CWG 17.50 300.00 5250.00
6/30/03 Prepare 0.00 T@1
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation of Appeal Brief. 0.00

119969 TIME GHP 440 175.00 770.00
7/21/03 Misc 0.60 T@1
wIP BULNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Read and Digest Def.'s Reply Brief. 0.00

122920 TIME CWG 2.00 300.00 600.00
10/13/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Conduct legal research regarding issues 0.00
relating-to percentage of damages;
interoffice conference with Greg Parker
regarding oral argument support strategy
for Bill Harris.

JT-APP 3014
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123209 TIME GHP 8.30 225.00 1867.50
10/13/03 Prepare 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-D001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.00

123210 TIME GHP 9.60 225.00 2160.00
10/14/03 Prepare 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.60

123214 TIME GHP 5.10 225.00 1147.50
10/17/03 Prepare 0.00 T :
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 "~ Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.00

123218 TIME GHP 2.10 225.00 472.50
10/22/03 Prepare 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.00

123219 TIME GHP 3.30 225.00 74250
10/23/03 Prepare 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.00

123223 TIME GHP 6.20 225.00 1395.00
10/29/03 Prepare 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.00

123236 TIME CAG 5.00 90.00 450.00
10/30/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Obtain copies of and Shephardize cases 0.00
cited in Defendant's two appeal briefs.

123224 TiME GHP 1.20 225.00 270.00
10/30/03 Prepare 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.00

123225 TIME GHP 4.40 225.00 990.00
10/31/03 Prepare 0.00 T
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Preparation for Oral Arguments. 0.00

123238 TIME CAG 2.00 90.00 180.00
10/31/03 Misc 0.00 T@1
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Obtain copies of and Shephardize cases 0.00
cited in Plaintiff's appeal brief.
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124090 TIME GHP 3.10 225.00 697.50
11/1/03 Prepare 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Prepare for Oral Arguments. 0.00

124091 TIME GHP 1.10 225.00 247.50
11/2/03 Prepare 0.00 T
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Prepare for Oral Arguments. 0.00

124092 TIME GHP 2.80 225.00 630.00
A41/3/03 Prepare 0.00 T
WiP - BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Prepare for Oral Arguments. 0.00

124093 TIME GHP 4.30 225.00 967.50
11/4/03 Prepare .00 T
wiP BLNT-0CG01LT 0.00 Hold
Orat Arguments. 0.00

124094 TIME GHP 1.30 225.00 292.50
11/5/03 Misc 0.00 T
wip BULNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discuss options with Chares W. Gaines 0.00
regarding Oral Arguments.

124096 TIME GHP 0.50 225.00 112.50
11/6/03 Misc 0.00 T
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discuss options with WDH regarding Oral 0.00
Arguments.

124098 TIME GHP 2.40 225.00 540.00
11/7/03 Research 0.00 T.
wiFp BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Research regarding Oral Arguments. 0.00

129346 TIME CWG 2.00 300.00 600.00
4/19/04 Review 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review Opinion from the Federal Circuit; 0.00
discuss decision with Greg Parker:;
telephone conference with Bill Harris
regarding same.

128954 TIME GHP 3.50 225.00 787.50
4/19/04 Misc 0.00 T
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Read Federal Circuit Opinion, discussions 0.00
with Charles W. Gaines and phone
conversation with Bill Harris.

128959 TIME GHP 2.50 225.00 562.50
4/22/04 Research 0.00 T
WIP BLNT-0001LT 6.00 Hold

JT-APP 3016
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Research regarding Federal Circuit 0.00
Opinion.
128960 TIME GHP 1.30 22500 292.50
4/23/04 Review 0.00 T
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review cases found in research. 0.00
128966 TIME GHP 0.40 225.00 90.00
4/28/04 Misc 6.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 6.00 Hold
Discussions with Charles W. Gaines, 0.00 o
128967 TIME GHP 0.50 225.00 112.50
4/29/04 Misc 0.00 T i
wiP BLNT-C0O1LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Charles W. Gaines. 0.00
129347 TIME CWG 2.50 300.00 750.00
5/7/04 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discuss possible trial strategy regarding 0.00
remand and preparation of findings of fact
and conclusions of law with Greq Parker;
follow-up telephone conversation with Bill
Harris regarding same.
129348 TIME CWG 425 300.00 1275.00
5/9/04 Review 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-GOO1LT 0.00 Hold
Review trial transcript and deposition of 0.00
Leslie Bortz.
130130 TIME GHP 4.20 225.00 945.00
5/9/04 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Read Transcript. 0.00
129345 TIME CWG 3.00 300.00 800.00
5/10/04 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Interoffice conference with Greg regarding 0.00
damages argument in brief, meeting with
Bill Harris and Greg Parker regarding
strategy for moving forward with new
conclusions of law and findings of fact.
130131 TIME GHP 1.10 225.00 247.50
5/10/04 Misc 0.00 } T
“WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Read Transcript and Appeal Brief. 0.00
130132 TIME GHP 2.00 225.00 450.00
5/10/04 Misc 0.00 )
WwWIP BLNT-000tLT 0.00 Hold
JT-APP 3017
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8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC
9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 25
Slip ID Attormey Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance
Discussions with Charles W. Gaines and 0.00
Bilt Harris regarding proceeding.
130134 TIME GHP 3.70 225.00 832.50
5/12/04 Misc 0.00 T
WiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Legal Research. X 0.00
130136 TIME GHP 210 225.00 472.50
5/13/04 Misc 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001L.T 0.00 - Hold
Review Case Law and discussions with 0.00 L
Charles W. Gaines and Bill Harris.
130138 TIME GHP 330 225.00 742.50
5114104 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Search for Findings of Fact and 0.00
Conclusions of Law and various
discussions with Bill, Charles W. Gaines
and a phone call with Bill and MclLaughlin.
130142 TIME GHP 6.70 225.00 1507.50
5/17/04 Misc 0.00 T
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Multiple discussions between myself and 0.00
Charles W. Gaines as well as Bill Harris,
review findings of fact and conclusions of
law drafted by other attorneys.
130143 TIME GHP 3.10 225.00 697.50
5/18/04 Misc - 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LY 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Charles W. Gaines and 0.00
Biill Harris regarding how fo proceed about
FOF and COL as welt as begin outline of
the same.
130373 TIME CWG 2.00 300.00 600.00
6/18/04 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
interoffice conference with Greg H. Parker 0.00
regarding general outline for Findings of
Fact and Conclusions of Law.
130144 TIME GHP 6.40 225,00 1440.00
5/19/04 Misc 0.00 T
‘WiP BLNT-00C1LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Charles W. Gaines and 0.00
Bill Harris regarding opposition to
Peterson's request for return of monies
from the court, and research case la
about the same. -
JT-APP 3018
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Slip Value

300.00 600.00:

8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC

9:40 AM Slip Listing

Slip 1D Attorney Units Rate
Dates and Time Activity ONB Time Rate info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

130372 TIME CWG 2.00
5/19/04 Misc 0.00 T@1
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Telephone conference with Bill Harsis 0.00
regarding Peterson's Motion for
reimbursement of funds in registry of the
court; interoffice conference with Greg H.

Parker regarding case law cited in
Peterson's Mntion; review of opposing
case law regarding remaining liability of
Appellant after remand.

130147 TIME GHP 1.10 225.00
5/20/04 Misc 0.00 T
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Discussions with Charles W. Gaines 0.00
about motion to oppose retum of cash
security.

130148 TIME GHP 1.50 225.00
5121104 Misc 0.00 T
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Review and discussed Charles' motion fo 0.00
oppose and forwarded on to Bill Harris.

130152 TIME GHP 710 225.00
5124104 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Begin drafting findings of fact and 0.00
conclusions of law.

130153 TIME GHP 210 225.00
5125104 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Continue drafting findings of fact and 0.00
conclusions of law.

130154 TIME GHP 8 22500
526104 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Continue drafting findings of fact and 0.00
conclusions of law.

130155 TIME GHP 8.70 225.00
5127104 : Misc 0.60 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00
Continue drafting findings of fact and 0.00
conclusions of law,

130156 TIME GHP 3.10 225.00
528/04 Misc 0.00 T
WIP BULNT-0001LT 0.00
Continue drafting findings of fact and 0.00

conclusions of law.

Hold

24750
Hold

337.50
Hold

1597.50
Hold

472.50
Hald

1867.50
Hold

1957.50
Hold

697.50
Hold

Page 26
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8/27/04 HITT GAINES, PC

9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 27

SlipID Attomey Units Rafte Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Varlance

131490 TIME GHP 3.80 225.00 85500
6/1/04 Misc 0.00 T
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continued working on FIF and COL., 0.00

132002 TIME CWG 1.90 300.00 570.00
6/1/04 Misc 0.00 Ta1
wip BLNT-0001LY 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Greg H. Parker on FIF 0.00
and COL.

132003 TIME CWG - 430 300.00 1290.00
6/2/04 Misc 0.00 T@1 '
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Discussions with Greg H. Parker on FIF 0.00
and COL.

131491 TIME GHP 7.90 225,00 1777.50
6/2/04 Misc 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continued working on FIF and COL. 0.00

132004 TIME CWG 8.10 300.00 2430.00
6/3/04 Misc 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of FIF and COL. 0.00

131493 TIME GHP 910 225.00 2047.50
6/3/04 Misc 0.00 T
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Coniinued working on FIF and COL. 0.00

130512 TIME CWG 12.00 300.00 3600.00
6/4/04 6/8/04 Prepare 0.00 T@1
WIiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Prepare Memorandum in Opposition to 0.00
Detendant's motion for return of security
cash.

131495 TIME GHP 5.20 225.00 1170.00
6/4/04 ] Meeting 0.00 T
wiP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Meeting with WOH and continued working 0.00
on FIF and COL.

130513 TIME CWG 460 300.00 1380.00
6/7/04 Review 0.00 T@1
wipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review and revise draft of Conclusions of 0.00
Law and Findings of Fact with Greg

"Parker. ’
JT-APP 3020
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8127104 HITT GAINES, PC

9:40 AM Slip Listing Page 28

Slip ID Attorney Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity ONB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description File Variance

131498 TIME GHP 4.60 225.00 1035.00
67104 Misc 0.00 T
wip BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continued working on FIF and COL. 0.00

131501 TIME GHP 340 225.00 765.00
6/8/04 Misc 0.00 T
wIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Continued working on FIF and COL. 0.00

130514 TIME CWG 3.40 300.00 1020.00
6/8/04 Misc 0.00 T@1 )
WipP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Make additional changes to Conciusions 0.00
and Findings.

130515 TIME CWG 2.00 300.00 600.00
6/9/04 Misc 0.00 T@1
wiIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Telephone conference with Bill Harris 0.00

regarding Conclusions and Findings;
make additional Conclusions pursuant to
discussions with Bill Harris.

131508 TIME GHP 8.50 225.00 1912.50
6/10/04 Misc 0.00 T
WIP BLNT-0001LY 0.00 Hold
Finish and File FIF and COL. 0.00
132005 TIME CWG 6.30 300.00 1890.00
6/10/04 Misc 0.00 T
WIP BLNT-0001LT 0.00 Hold
Review of FIF and COL. 0.00
Grand Total
Billable 999.10 235046.50
Unbillable 0.00 0.00
Total 999.10 235046.50

JT-APP 3021
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALLAS DIVISION
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC,, §
§
Plaintiff, §
§ Civil Action No.
v. §
§ 3-01CV0127-R
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO., §
§
Defendant. §

DECLARATION OF WILLIAM D. HARRIS, JR., IN SUPPORT OF .
PLAINTIFF, GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

1. I, William D. Harris, Jr., am currently of Counsel with the firm of Schultz & Associates,
P.C., and have since the case was turned over to me by the firm of Locke, Liddell & Sapp, rcp;csented
Golden Blount, Inc. in the above referenced litigation. |

2. From the beginning of my involvement with the case through about Augunst 31,2003, Iwas
of Counsel with the firm of Hitt Gaines, P.C.. Thereafter, and to the present time, Thave been of Cqunsel
with the firm of Schultz & Associates, P.C..

3. Junderstand ﬁat Charles W. Gaines is attesting to the attorneys’ fees and expenses
expended on the part of Hitt Gaines, P.C., including the time I was of Counsel with Hitt Gaines, P.C..
Therefore, this declaration is made withrespect to the attorneys’ fees and expenses expended on the part
of Schultz & Associates, P.C..

4. Thiscase is a patent infringement case that presents numerous substantial and complex

issues including, butnot limited to, invalidity, actual infringement, contributory infringement, induced

JT-APP 3022
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mfringement, infringement under the doctrine of equivalents, wilfulness, measurement of darages and the
award of attorneys’ fees.

5. My current firm served as co-counsel for Golden Blount, Inc. and assisted in the appeal
of the' case, includjng'.oral arguments, and the remand of the case back to this Court.

6. Attached hereto are true and correct copies of tﬂe Schultz & Associates, P.C., invoices
that represent my current firm’s attorneys’ fees for representation in this case.

7. Asthebills indicate, the vast majority of the representation by my current firm was handled
by myself, William D. Harris, Jr.. Since moving to Schultz & Associates, P.C., Thave had abilbng rate of
$325 perhour. A small amount of attorneys’ time was spent on the case by an associate of my current
firm, John Pemberton, whom had a billing rate of $195 per hour. These rates are consistent with the rates
charged by my current firm to other clients comparable to Golden Blount, Inc.

8. Intotal, my current firm has expended $54,619.50 in attomeys’ fees in this case, as shown

below:
YEE EARNER TOTAL HOURS BILLING RATE
William D. Harris, Jr | 162.6 $325.00
John Pemberton 9.1 $195.00
Total: 171.7 hours $54,619.50

Yam familiar with the customary fees for this type of litigation charged in large legal markets

suchas Dallas. Inmy opinion, the hours billed by me and other members of: my current firm are reasonable

inrelation to the quantity and substance ofthe representation in this case. I further understand the hourly

JT-APP 3023
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rates for the attorneys in my current firm to be reasonable in relation to other similar attorneys in large
markets such as Dallas.

10.  Ihavereviewed the bills and do notbelieve that there were significant duplication of efforts
among the members of my current firm or the other firms representing my client,

11. It is my opinicn that the total value and effort by Schultz & Associates, P.C., was
reasonable and necessaﬁ for the case at hand.

12. Intotai GoldenBlount, Inc. is secking $54,619.50 in fees for Schultz & Associates, P.C..

Ideclare under penalty of perjury under the taws of the United States of America that the foregoing
is true and cotrect to the best of my knowledge and belief.

Executed this September 8, 2004, at Dallas, Texas.

William D. Harns, Jr.

3 JT-APP 3024
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08/25/2004 Schuitz & Associates, P.C.
9:24 AM Slip Listing Page i
Selection Criteria
Siip.Ciaggification  Open
Client (hand select)  Include: golden; golden-101 miscellaneous; golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Activily (hand selec  Includs: Sendce
Slip.Dats 08/25/2001 - 068/10/2004
Rete Info - identifies mte source and level
SlipID Timskesper Units Rate Slip Valua
Oates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Bill Status
Description Referance Variance ’
11016 TIME Bill 1.00 325.00 325.00
09/18/2003 Senice 1.00 Tan
Billed G:13508 golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Revew of portions of appendix. 0.00
11018 TIME Bill 2.50 325.00 812.50
09/22/2003 Sandce 2.50 T&1
Billed G:13508 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Further revew of appendix with attention to 0.00
transeript.
11023 TIME Bill 1.00 325.00 325,00
09/26/2003 Sendce 1.00 T@1
Billed G:13608 golden~102 gbi v. rhpe
Consideration of schedule for arqument and 0.00
planning for preparation of oral argument.
11655 TIME John 0.40 195.00 78.00
10/15/2000 Senice 0.40 Té1
Billed G:13770 golden-102 ghi v. thpe
-Research casea citas, determine proper cite 0.00
and sheperdlze cases
11894 TIME John 2.90 195.00 565.50
10/30/2003 Serice 2.90 T1
Bitled G:13770 golden-102 gbi v. thpa
Research cases cited in defendant's brief; 0.00
draR, teview, revise memo re ¢ited cases
11699 TIME John 5.80 195.00 1131.00
10/31/2003 Sendce 5.80 T@1
Biiled G:13770 golden-102 gbi v. hpe
Research cases cited in defendant's brief: 0.00
draft, roview, revise memo re cited ¢ases
11708 TME Bilf 6.00 325.00 1625.00
10/18/2003 1:12 AM Senica 5.00 &1
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
JT-APP 3025
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08/25/2004 Schultz & Associates, P.C,
9:24 AM Slip Listing Page
Sip ID Timskeeper - - Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rats Info
Posting Status Client . Bill Status
Description Reaference Variance
Emphasis case law citsed in Peterson's 0.00
principal brief.
11707 TIME Bill 5,00 325.00 1625.00
10/19/2003 Sanice 5.00 T@1
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Emphasis on ¢ase law cited in Peterson's 0.00
reply brief.
11710 TIME Bill 2.00 325.00 650.00
10/20/2003 Senice 2.00 T&1
Billed (G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Further study on case law and factual 0.00
application.
IRFAYS TIME Bill 1.00 325.00 325.00
10/24/2003 Sendce 1.00 Té@1
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Preparation for argument. 0.00
11720 TME Bill 2.90 325.00 942.50
10/27/2003 Senice 2.80 T@1
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpc
Preparation for argument. 0.00
11725 TIME Bill 2.50 325.00 812.50
10/26/2003 Senice 250 T@&1
Bllled G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Prepatation for argumant. 0.00
11728 T™E Bl 200 325.00 850.00
10/02/2003 Senice 2.00 T@i
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Preparation for argument i appeals coun, 0.00
11730 TIME ail Q.80 325.00 260.00
10/03/2003 Senice 0.80 Ten
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 ghi v. rhpe
Handling detaiis in connection with planned 0.00
for hearing in the Federal Circuit on 11/4/03.
11732 TIME Bill ' 0.60 325.00 195.00
10/06/2003 Senice 0.60 Tan
_Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 gelden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Telephone confarence with Grag Parker. Q.00

Lettar and pink shest to Federal Gircuit.

2
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0B8f25/2004 Schultz B Associates, P.C.
9:24 AM Slip Listing Page 3
Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate  Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Bill Status
Description - Refarence Varlance
11733 TIME Bilt 4.00 325.00 1300.00
10/07/2003 Sendce 4.00 T@1
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Preparation for argument. 0.00
11734 TME Bitl 3.00 325.C0 975.00
10/08/2003 Senics 3.00 T
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 ghi v. rhpc
Study of case law in preparation for 0.00
argument.
11743 TME Bili 4.00 325.00 1300.00
10/13/2003 Senice 4.00 Tan
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 goldon-102 gbi v. rhpc
Study of case law relating to argument Q.00
before the Federal Circuit.
11747 TIME Bill 4.00 325.00 1300.00
10/15/2003 Sendce 4.00 Té1
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpc
Study ceses in preparation for oral argument. 0.00
11748 TIME Bill 4.00 325.00 1300.00
10/16/2003 Senvice 4.00 T&1
Billed G:13770 11/01/2003 golden-102 ghi v. thpc
Legal research for oral argument. 0.00
11749 TME Bilf 5.00 325.00 1625.00
10/17/2003 Senice 5.00 T@1
Bilted G3770 11/01/2003 goiden-102 gbi v. rhpc
l.egal research for preparation regarding oml 0.00
argument.
12286 TIME Blil 12.00 325.00 3900.00
11/03/2003 2:00 AM Senice 12.00 T@1
Billed G:13897 12/01/2003 golden-102 ghi v. thpc
Wortk argument and travel to Washington, 0.00
DC.
12287 TIME Bili 10.00 325.00 3250.00
11/04/2003 Senice 10.00 T@1
Billed G:13897 12/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Further work on presentation and late retum 0.00
1o Dallas.
12288 TIME C Bill 3.00 - 325.00 975.00
11/05/2003 Sendce 3.00 Ten
Bitled G:13897 12/01/2003 goiden-102 gbi v. thpe
JT-APP 3027
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08/25/2004 Schultz & Associates, P.C.

9:24 AM Slip Listing Page 4
SlipiD Timekeeper Unlis Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Acthdty DNB Time Rate Infa
Posting Status Client Bili Status
Deascription Reference ~ Variance
Follow-up considerations of argumsot on 0.00
Nowember 4, 2003.
12301 TIME Bill 1.00 325.00 825.00
11/11/2003 Senice 1.00 Te1
Billed G:13897 12/01/2003 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Follow-up inquiries concaming appesal. 0.00
15426 TIME Bl 0.80 325.00 260.00
04/21/2004 Senice 0.80 CoTen
Billed G:14620 05/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Telephohe confarence with Charles Gaines 0.00
and Greg Parker on opinion from Federal
Clrcult.
15429 TIME B 1.00 325.0¢ 325.00
04/22/2004 Senice 1.00 T@1
Billed G:14620 05/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Review of opinion from Fedaral Circuit, 0.00
15431 TME Bill 1.50 325.00 487.50
04/26/2004 Senice 1.50 T@1
Bilted Gi: 14620 05/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Further raview of the opinion of the Federal 0.00
Circuit. Telephone conference with Charles
Gaines and Greg Parker reganding
interpretation of the opinion and centain case
law.
16272 TIME Bill 2.00 325.00 650.00
05/11/2004 Sendce 2.00 Té1
“Billed G:14781 06/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Search to locate the pertinant material for 0.00
preparirg findings and conclusions;
Teleptione calt from Ardy DeCaster (Judge
Buchmayer's Clerk) conceming scheduling;
Telephone confarence with co-coungel in an
effort Yo obtain daposition copies.
18274 TIME Bill 2.50 325.00 812,50
05/12/2004 Ssenice 2.50 T&1
-Blllad G:14781 06/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Study and preliminary analysis of Judge 0.00
Buchmeyer's Order for findings of fact and
conclusion of law. Telephana conferences
with Greg Parker and separate conference
cafl with Golden Blount.
JT-APP 3024
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08/25/2004 Schultz & Associates, P.C.
'g:24 AM Shp Listing Page 5
Slip 1D Timekeepear Units Rate S8lip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
16282 TIME Bill 5.00 325.00 1625.00
05/19/2004 Senice 5.00 Ta1
Billed G:14781 06/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Work on background for findings of fact and .00
concluslons of law.
16284 TIME Bill 5.00 325.00 1625.00
05/20/2004 Senice 5.00 T@1
Billed Gi:14781 08/01/2004 goldan-102 gbi v. thpe
Work on background for findings and 0.00
conclusions.
16286 TIME Bt 3.00 325.00 975.00
05/21/2004 Sendce 3.00 Ta
Billed G:14781 06/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Further wark on findings and conclusions. 0.00
Study of depositions.
16287 TIME Bill 2.00 325.00 850.00
05/22/2004 Sanice 2.00 T@1
Bilied G:14781 06/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. thpe
Work on strategy to take regarding in 0.00
response to findings and conclusions.
Interoffice meeting.
16288 TME Bill 1.80 325.00 487.50
05/24/2004 Senvce 1.50 TO1
Blited Gi14781 06/01/2004 goldan-102 gbi v. rhpe
Made changes and comments to Chares 0.00
.Gaines and Greg Parker's motion and
-memorandum in support. Email to
co-counsel. Telephone conference with
Charles Gaines and Greg Parker,
16292 TIME Bill 1.00 325.00 325.00
05/26/2004 Sendice 1.00 Ta
Billad G:14781 06/01/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Review of evidence. 0.00
16301 TIME Bill 2.00 326.00 650.00
08/27/2004 Senice 2.00 Te1
Bitled G:1a781 06/01/2004 gotden-102 ghi v. rhpe
Further review of evidence 0.00
JT-APP 3029
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08/25/2004 Schultz & Asaociates, P.C.

9:24 AM Slip Uisting Page 6

ShpiD Timekeseper Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Cliert Bill Status
Degcription Reference Variance

17253 TIME Bill 4.00 326.00 1300.00
06/02/2004 Sanice 4.00 T&1
Billed G:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rthpc
Work on new findings and conclusions. 0.00

17256 TIME Bill 3.00 325.00 975.00
06/03/2004 Senvice 3.00 Tal
Billed G:15328 08/07/2004 golden-102 ghi v. thpe
Aeview of Chatles Gaines and Greg Parker's 0.00
draft of opposition of motion to retain the
funds out of the courl’s registry. Telephone
conierence regarding same. Work on
findings and conclusions.

17257 TME Biti 6.00 325,00 1950.00
05/20/2004 Sendce 6.00 Te
Billed G:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Study of record and listing pertinent facts 0.60
from record.

17258 TIME Bill 4.00 325.00 1300.00
05/30/2004 Seandica 4.00 Ta1 '
Billed G:16323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. thpc
Further study of record and fisting pertinent 0.00
facts from record.

17259 TIME gill 3.00 325.00 975.00
05/31/2004 Senice 3.00 T@1
Billed (G:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Work on findings and conclusions. 0.00

17262 TME Bill 3.00 325.00 975.00
06/01/2004 Senice 3.00 Té1
Billed . G:15323 08/07/2004 goldan-102 ghi v. rhpc
Rough drafting on findings and conclusions. 0.00

17283 TIME Bill 6.50 325.00  2112.50
08/03/2004 Sendce 6.50 T@1t
Billed Gi:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rthpe
Work on aspects of finding of fact and 0.00
conclugions of law,

17285 TIME 8ill 3.50 325.00 1137.50
06/04/2004 ~ Sendce 3.50 T@1

Billed G:16323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. thpc
Preparation for and meeting with Charles 0.00
Galnes and Greg Parker and follow-up
attention to review of cases and telephone
JT-APP 3030
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08/25/2004 Schultz & Associates, P.C.
9:24 AM Siip Listing Page 7
Slip'ID Timekeeper Units Rate  Slip Value
Dates and Tima Acthity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Clignt Bill Status
Description Reference Vadance
conferencs with Greg Parker.
17266 TIME Bill 4.00 325.00 1300.00
(6/08/2004 ’ Sendce 4.00 T@1
Billad G:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Wark on briet. 0.00
17267 TME Bill 2.00 325.00 850.00
06/05/2004 Senice 2.00 Tat
Billed G:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. hpe :
Work on brief. 0.00
17268 TME Bill 4.50 325.00 1462.50
06/07/2004 Senice 4.50 Tt
Billed G:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 ghi v. thpc
Further work on findings and conclugiong 0.06
with attention to tha recard and draft
revsions.
17271 TIME Bill 4.50 325.00 1462.50
06/08/2004 Sendce 4.50 T
Billed G:15323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Work on revising and finalizing findings and 0.00
conclusions. Telephons conterences with
Grag Parker and reading certaln cases.
17273 TIME Bill 6.00 325.00 1950.00
06/09/2004 Senice £.00 T
Billed G:15323 Q/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpe
Work on revising and finalizing findings and 0.00
conclusions of law.
17276 TIME Bill 5.00 325.00 1625.00
06/10/2004 Senice 5.00 T@1
Billed G:16323 08/07/2004 golden-102 gbi v. rhpc
Waerk on findings and conclusions. 0.00
Grand Total
Billabls 0.00 0.00
Unbillahle 171.70 54819.50
Total 171.70 54618.50
JT-APP 3031
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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALYLAS DIVISION
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC. §
§
Plaintiff, 8§
§ CIVIL ACTION NO.
8 3-01-CV-0127-R.
Y. §
§
ROBERT H. PETERSON CQ,, §
§
Defendant. §

AFFIDAVIT OF ROY W. HARDIN IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFE’S
APPLICATION FOR ATFTORNEYS’ FEES PURSUANT TO 35 U.S.C. § 285

BEFORE ME, the unders.igned authority, on this day personally appeared Roy
W. Hardin; who being duly sWorn according to law, did upon his oath depose and say:

1. “My name is Roy W. Hardin. I am over the age of twenty-one (21) years,
am of sound mind, have never been convicted of a crime, and am fully competent in all
respects to make this Affidavit. I bave personal Jmowledge of the facts stated in this
Affidavit. .

2. “] am an attorpey licensed to practice law in the State of Texas. I have
been licensed to practice law in the State of Texas for over 25 years. I am familiar with
the time and expenses involved in prosecuting and defending patent infringement actions

in Dallas, Dallas County, Texas. I am a partner in the law firm of Locke, Liddell & Sapp,
L.L.P., which was counsel of record for Golden Blount, Inc. (“Golden Blount”) in the
above-styled and numbered cause of actiox:-l.
3. Attached hqreto is a genuine, true and correct copy of the time records of

the law firm of Locke, Liddell & Sapp, L.L.P. from January 2000 through July 2001 with

JT-APP 3032
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regard to the case at hand. Locke, Liddeli & Sapp, L.L.P. has maintained true and correct
copies of these documents in its files since they were generated by our office. Members
of the Locke, Liddell & Sapp, L.L.P. firm billed the hours to the case. The numbers of

hours billed and their hourly rates is listed below:

Name Hours " Hourly Rate

L. Dan Tucker 1.90 $325.00

Monty L. Ross 1.50 $335.00

Roy W. Hardin 22.75 $350.00 - $375.00

Charles Phipps 34.00 $230.00 ‘

Michael W. Dubner 20.00 $135.00

4. “In my opinion, the hours billed by myself and the other members of my

firm listed above were reasonable and necessary for proper prosecution of the case. I
further believe that the hourly rates for the members of the firm are réasonablc in relation
to similar services performed at comparable levels of competence by attomeys and
paralegals in the Northern District of Texas.

5. “Therefore, in my opinion, the total value of time and effort expended by
the law firm of Locke, Liddell & Sapp, L.L.P. of $18,967.50 was reasonable and

necessary for proper prosecution of this case.”

FURTHER AFFIANT SAITH NOT. .

Roy W{Hardin’

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO BEFORE ME by the said Roy W. Hardin on
this, the .3 day of August, 2002, to certify which witness my qfficial hand and seal

of office. ‘ % 1/;,/
ity Public in andfor the

Notary Puldic, State of Taxas

P Y

5\ Mary Janloe Schigut
My Commission Expires: o

e/ My Gomm. Explies 11720002 | JT-APP 3033
AFFIDAVIT OF ROY W. HARDIN IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF’S APPLICATION FOR
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P.0O. Box 911541

1OCKE LIDDELL & SAPP e | DALLAS. DEXAS 753911541

AYTORNEYS & COUNSELORS

i February 18, 2000
Golden Blount
4200 West Grove
Dallasg, TK 75248 .
As of Janmary 31. 2000

File No.: 09842/60434

Re: Gan-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner Assembly

DATE SERVICES ATTY  HOURS VALUE

12/10/99 Preparation of cease and desist letters. LDT 1.00 325.00
TOTAL HOURS. 1.00

TOTAL SERVICES ... . . <« . + + « « - . $32s8.00

DATE CHARGES : L VALUE

Facsimiles @ 1.00 per page . 2.00

TOTAL CHARGES . . « « v o o v « o o . $2.00

TOTAL SERVICES AND CHARGES . . . . . .. $327.00

TOTAL DUE THIS-STATEMENT . . . . . . . - $327.00

Please remit payment to:

. Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP
_P. O, Box 911541
Dallas, Texas 75391-1541

Tax D 74-1164324

JT-APP 3034
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February 18, 2000

Golden Blount
Page 2

as of January 31, 2000

¥ile MNo.: 09842/60434

Re: Cag-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner Assembly

This statement ig due upon xeceipt., Please call Roy W. Haxdin

(214) 740-8000 of thie firm if you have gquestions concerning
legal services covered by it oxr if you dispute the amount of the
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accounting Department

(214) 740-8347 can answer questions concerning payments on your account.

any payment for less than the full amount of thig statement tendered
in full satisfaction of this statement (or any portion of it} should

be sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: Accounts Receivable,

2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 220Q, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776

PRIVRCY NOTICE
- Locke Liddell & Sapp may acquire and collect nonpubllc personal
information about clients and former clients in the course of
providing legal services. Such information may be obtained from
the client; may be generated as.a result of the services provided;
or may be received from third partles involved in, or affiliated
with, the services provided.

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp reserve the right to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation about clients or former clients, except as pexmitted by law.’

Locke Liddell & Sapp restricts access to nonpublic personal inform-
ation to those employees who need to know that information to
provide the applicable services. Locke Liddell- & Sapp maintains
physical, electronic and procedural safeguards that comply with
federal regulations to guard the nonpublic personal information

of clients and former clients.

JT-APP 3035
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LOCKE LIDDELL & SAPP 1 | D e 18391-1561

ATTORNEYS & COUNSELORS Tax D 74-1164324
R ! .

Mav 12, 2000

Golden Blount
4200 West Grove

pallas, TX 75248 ) .
.Ag of Apxil 30, 2000

_File No.: 09842760434

Re: Gas-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burmer Assembly

DATE SERVICES ' ATTY  HOURS VALUE
03/21/00 Conference with Mr. Blount regarding LDT .50 175.00
04/26/00 Telephohne conference with Mr. Blount - LDT .40 140.00

and preparation of demand letter to
Robert H. Peterson Co. . . -
TOTAL HOURS .5¢C
TOTAL SERVICES . - - 4 « « .+ o = « + & $315.00

TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMENT . . . . . .. . $315.00

Please yemit payment to:
Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP
P. 0. Box 911541

Dallas, Texas 75391-1541

R A . A-90
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. May 12, 20040
Golden Blount
Page 2

As of April 30, 2000
. File No.: 09842/60434

Re: Gas-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner Assembly

This etatement is due upon receipt. FPlease tall Roy W. Hardin

{(214) 740-8000 of this firm if you have questions concerning

legal services covered by it or if you dispute the amount of the
statement. Ws, Emily Teague in our Accounting Department -
(214) 740-8347 can angwer questions concerming payments on your account.

Any payment for less than the full amount of thig statement tendered
in Full satisfaction of this statement {or any portion of it} should
be sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: Accounts Receivable,
2200 Rosg Avenue, Suite 2200, Dallas, Texag 75201-6776

PRIVACY NOTICE ' i
Locke Liddell & Sapp may acquire and collect nonpuhlic personal
information about client$ and former clients in the course of
providing. legal services.. Such information may be obtained from
the client; may be generated as a result of the services provided;
or may be received from thixd partles involved in, or affiliated
with, the services provided.

" Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp reserve the right to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation sbout clients or former clients, except ag permitted by law.

Locke Liddell & Sapp reestricts access to nonpublic personal inform-
‘ation to thoae employees who need to know that information to
provide the applicable services. Iocke Liddell & Sapp mainrains
physical, electromnic and procedural safequards that comply with

" federal regulations to guard the nonpublic personal information

" of clients and former clients.

JT-APP 3037
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. : ‘ P. 0.Box 911541
LOCKE LIDDELL & SAPP ur DALLAS, TEXAS 753911541
" ATTORNEYS & COUNSELORS : - TaxID 741164324

. October 23, 2000
Golden Blount : .

4200 West Grove
Dallas, TX 75248

As of Octopexr 18, 2000
File No.: 098&2/60434

Re: Gas-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner Assembly

- DATE SERVICES ATTY  HOURS VALUE

07/14/00 Sketch views of patent drawings; MIR  1.50 502.50
congultation with patent draftsman, i

10/11/00 Review of file and RGN _ Rwi 1.00 350.00
sl R -
oA R

10/11/00 Regin research Eor case law to MD _ 4-00 540.00

|

10/12/00 Continue. research oncmw MD 8§.25 1,113.75

rm

'10/18/00 Prepare Complaint for ‘Patent D 3.25 438.73
Infringement--Golden Blount, Inc. v. -
Robert H, Peterson Company

TOTAL HOURS 18.00 °

TOTAL SERVICES . .. . . . . . . . . .

. $2,945.00
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October 23, 2000

Golden Blount
Page 2 . i

As of October 18, 2000

"¥File No.: 09842/60434

Re: Gas-Fired artifl Logs & Coals-Burnexr Assembly

DATE 7 CHARGES : VALUE
Photocopies @.20 per page 8.40

TOTAL CHARGES . . . + « « « v « o o . . $8.40

- TOTAL, SERVICES AND CHARGES . . . . . . $2,953.40

TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMENT . . . © . . . $2,953.40

Please remit payment to:

Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP

P. O. Box 911541

Pallas, Texas 75391-1541

This statement is due upon receipt. Please call Roy W. Hardin

{214) 740-8000 of thisg firm if you have questions concerning

legal services covered by it or if you dispute the amount of the
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accocunting Department

(214) 740-8347 caglanswer questions concerning payments on your account.

Any payment for less than the full amount of this statement tendered
in full satisfaction of this statement (or any portion of it) should
be sent to: Locke Liddell & Bapp LLP, Attention: RAccounts Receivable,
2200 Ross Avenue, Suite "2200, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776

PRIVACY NOTXCR
Locke Liddell & Sapp may acquire and collect nonpublic personal
information about clients and forxmer clients in the course of
providing legal services. Such information may be obtained from
the client; may be generated as a result of the services provided;
or may be received from third parties involved in, or affiliated

A-93
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Octobexr 23, 2000

Golden Blount
Page 3

as of Octoberx 13} 2000
File No.: 09842/6043¢

Re: Gas-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner Assembly

with, the services provided.

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not éisclose, nor doea Locke Liddell &
Sapp reserve the xight to discloge, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation about clients or former clients, except as permitted by law.

Locke Liddell & Sapp restricts access to nonpublic personal inform-
ation to those employees who need to know that information to
provide the applicable services. Locke Liddell & Sapp maintains
physi.cal. electronic and procedural safequards that comply with’
federal regulations to guard the nonpublic persconal information

of clients and former c¢lients.
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P. O. Box 9115414

JLOCKE LIDDELL & SAPP e DALIAS, TEXAS T5391-1541

ATYO! S & COUNSBLORS TAX 1D 74-1164324
ATITORNEYS & !

February 21, 2001
Golden Blount
Golden Blount, Inc.
4301 Westgrove
Addison, TX 75001 As of January 31, 2001

File No.: 09842/60434

Re: Gas-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner Assembly

DATE X SERVICES - ATTY  HOURS VALUE

10/17/00 Telecon with Mr. Blount and review of RWH - .50 175.00
information necessary £or =R ' :
A ——— . .

11/06/00 Telecon with Goldén sl RWH .75 262,50

11/06/00 Prepare patent assignment forxrm for VD 2.00 . 276.00

assignment of '159 Patent to Golden

Blount, Inc.; draft letter teo Mr.

Blount et amtont -

" R - . . .
11/07/00 Complete assignment of patent MD 2.50 337.50

application and draft of letter to Mr. -7

A : Blount concerning “mitrumeSnim—m )

01/08/01 Prepare letter and complaint and send RWH 3.50 1,312.50
to client for approval. '

01/09/01 Review of file histories and : RWH 3.50  1,312.50
conaidering -
al

TOTAL HOURS 12.75

TOTAL SERVICES . . . . . . . . . . . . $3,670.00

JT-APP 3041
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February 21, 2001

Golden Blount -
Page 2 - .

As of January 31, 2001

File No.: 09842/60434

Re: Gas-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner.Asgembly

LESS DISCOUNT ) {$1.,170.00)
TOTAL SERVICES BILLED . . . .- - + . - $2,500.00
DATE CHARGES VALUE
nir Freight Shipments 19.66
Megsenger Services o 13.00°
Photocopies @.20 per page 9.80
12/22/00 Comm. of Patents & Trademarks - Recordal of - 40.00
. Assignment .
01/18/01 'Clerk, U.S. District Court - Filing fee forx 150.00
Complaint : )
TOTAL CHARGES . « + = o =« « o = « « « = $232.46
ToTAL SERVICES AND CHRRGES . . . . . . - §2,732.46
TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMENT '+ . ... « - - $2,732.46 .

Please_remit‘pay@ent to:
Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP
P. O. Box 911541

Dallap, Texas 75391-1541

This statement is due upon receipt. Please call Roy W. Hardin

(214) 740-8000 of this firm if you have questions concermning

legal servicea covered by it or if you dispute the amount of the
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accounting Department

{214} 740-8347 can answer questions concerning paymwents on youxr account.

Any payment for less than the full amount of. this statement tendered
in full satisfaction of this statement (or any portion of it) should

‘be sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: Accounts Receivable,
2200 Rogas Avenue, Suite 2200, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776

JT-APP 3042
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FPebruary 21, 2001
Golden Blount
Page 3

As of January 31, 2001
. File Wo.: 09842/60434

Re: Gag-Fired Artifl Logs & Coals-Burner Assembly

. PRIVACY NOTICE .
Locke Liddell & Sapp may acquire and collect nonpublic personal
information about c¢lients and former clients in the course of
providing legal services. Such information may be cbtained from
the client; may be generated as a result of the services provided;
or may be received from third parties involved in, or affiliated
with, the services provided.

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp reserve the right to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation about clients or former clients, except as permitted by law.

‘Locke Liddell & Sapp restricts access to nonpublic personal inform-
ation to those employees who meed to know that information to
provide the applicable services. Locke Liddell & Sapp maintains
physical, electronic and procedural safeguards that comply with
federal regulations to guard the nonpublic personal information

of clients and former c<lients.
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LOCKE LIDDELL & SAPP ur ' DALY As, TEXAS 753911541

ATTORMEYS & COUNSELORS Tax ID 74-1164324
T 7O S

i March 13, -2001

Golden Blount .

Golden Blount, Inc.

4301 Westgrove ) .

addison, TX 75001 - | - As of Pebruary 28, 2001

File Ro.: 09842/79075

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H, Peterson Co,

DATE CHARGES ' - - VALUE
Messenger Services ) 26.00
TOTAL: CHARGES - . . . - < .« « « 4+ « < . . $26.00

TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMBNT . . . . . . . $26.00

Please remit payment to:
Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP
P. 0. Box 911541

Dallas, Texas 7533%1-1541

This statement is due upon receipt. Please call Roy W. Hardin
(214} 740-8000 of this firm if you have gquestions concerning
" legal services covered by it or if you dispute the amount of the -
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accounting Department ;
{214) 740-8347 can answer questions concerning payments on your account,

any payment for less than the full “amount of this statement tendered
in full satisfaction of this statement {or any portion ¢of it) should

be sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: Rccounts Receivable,
2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 2200, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776

JT-APP 3044
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. March 13, 2001
Golden Blount

Page 2 B . )
As of Februvary 28, 2001

File No.: 09842/7907s

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H. Peterson Co.

PRIVACY NOTICE .
Locke Liddell & Sapp may acquire and collect nonpublic personal
information about clients and former clients in the course of
providing legal services. Such information may be cbtained from
the ¢lient; may be génerated as a result of the services provided;
or may be received from third parties involved in, or affiliated
with, the services provided. ;

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp resexve the right to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation about clients or former clients, except as permitted by law.

Locke Liddell & Sapp restricts access to nonpublic personal infoxrm-
ation to those employees who need to know that information to
provide the applicable services. Locke Liddell & Sapp maintains
physical, electronic and procedural aafeguards that comply with

‘federal regulations to guard the nonpublic rexsonal information
of clients and former clients.
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LOCKE LIDDELL & SAPP Lip

ATTORNEYS & COUNSELORS

Golden Blount
Golden Blount, Ina,
4301 Westgrove
Addison, TX 75001

May

File No.:

15, 2001

Re: Golden Blount, Inc¢. v. Robert H. Peterson Co.

DATE

03/28/01

04/08/01

0o4/10/01

04/11/01
04/11/01

04/12/01

04/17/02

SERVICES

Review of Judge's Scheduling Order and
conference regarding
Snmlaesenemenst ek R
Py —y- .
Review files and corxrespondence
concerning the present action; discuss
YRR RY i th Roy
Haxdin; draft discovery requests..
Review pleadinga and correspondence
concerning the present action; review
United State patent 5,988,159; draft
discovery requests including document
requests and interrogatories. .

Review of proposed discovery xrequests
Revise drafte of Golden Blount's
document requests and interrogatories
to Robert Peterson Co.

Revise Golden Blount's document
requests and interrogatories to Robert
Peterson Co. in view of s
snsngunUENERNEE ..

Letter to client and gexrvice of first
wave of discovery.

TOTAL HOURS'

ATTY HOURS

RWH

CEP

CEP

RWH

. CEP

CEP

RWH

5.00

12.50

P.O. BOX 911541

DALLAS, TEXAS 75391-154]

TAXID 74-1164324

09842/79075

VALUE

750.00

460.00

1,150.00

375.00
23G6.00

. 230.00

187.50

JT-APP 3046
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May 15, 2001
Golden Blount
Page 2

File Ro.: 09842/72075

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Raobert H. Peterson Co.

TOTAL SERVICES . . . . . . « o & « . . $3,382.50

DATE CHRRGES C VALUE
Photocopies @.20 per page ) . 8.60
Facsimiles @ 1.00 pexr page . 24.00

TOTAL CHARGES . . . . . . « . . . . . $33.60

TOTAL SERVICES AND CHARGES . . . . . . . $3,416.20

»
. TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMENT . ... . . . . $3,416:10

Please remit payment.to:: -
Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP

P. 0. Box 911541

Dallas, Texas 75391-1641

This statement is due upon receipt. Please call Roy W. Hardin -

(214) 740-8000 of this firm if you have questions concerning

legal services covered by it or if you dispute the amount of the
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accounting Department

(214) 740-8347 can answer gquestions: concerning payments on your account.

Any payment for less than the full amount of this statement tendered
in full satisfaction of this statement (or any portion of it) ahould
be sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: Accounts Receivable,
220Q Ross Avenue, Suite 42200, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776

. PRIVACY NOTICE
Locke Liddell & Sapp may zcquiré and collect nonpublic personal
information about clients and former clients in the course of

' © providing legal services. Such information may be obtained from
the client; may be generated as a result of the services provided;
.or may be received from third parties involved in, or affiliated

A-101



May 15, 2001
Golden Blount
Page 3

File No.: 09842/78Q75

Re: Golden Blount, In¢. v. Robert H. peterson Co.

‘with, the services provided.

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp reserve the right to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation about clients or former clients, except as permitted by law.

tocke Liddell & Sapp restricts access to nonpublic personal inform-
ation to those emplovees who need to krnow that information to
provide the applicable services. Locke Liddell & Sapp maintains
physical, electronic and procedural safeguards that comply with
federal regulations to guard the nonpublic pexsonal information

of clients and former clients.

JT-APP 3048
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LLOCKE LIDDELL & SAPP u»

ATTORNEYS & COUNSELORS .

June 19, 2001

Golden Blount
Golden Blount, Inc.
4301 Westgrove

Addison, TX 75001

As of May 31,

P. Q. Box 911541

DALUAS, TEXAS 75391-1541

Tax1D 74-1164324

2001

File No.: 09842/79075

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H. Peterson Co.

DATE

0s/17/01

05/18/01
0s5/22/01

0s5/23/01

05/29/01

05/30/01

SERVICES ' ATTY  HOURS

Attention to Scheduling Order and RWH 2,00
considering iSRRI
TR : ccparing and
transmitting propoged form of Joint
Status Conference paper to opposing

counsel .

Attention to corrected joint report; RWH | .75
telecon with opposing counsel. . :
lI---IIllllIlI.n.ﬂlII.l.l;.ll.. CEP .50
i ) ’ .
Review discovery responses of Defepndant CEP 1,00

Robert H. Peterson Co.; draft

correspondence concerning same.

Review discovery requests of Defendant CEP - 4.00
Robert Peterson to Plaintiff Golden

Blount; draft written discovery

responses of Plaintiff Golden Blount:

Revise written discovery responses of CEP 2.00
Plaintiff Golden Blount.

TOTAL HOURS 10.25

- 2 e e .

TOTAL SERVICES

VALUE

750.00

281.25
115.00

230,00

920.00

460.00

$2,756.25

JT-APP 3049
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June 19, 2001
Golden Blount
Page 2 )
As of May 31, 2001
File No.: 09842/79075

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H. Peterson Co. .

CHARGES ) VALUE
Messenger Services ’ 40,00
-Postage o 5.63
Photocopiea @.20 per.page . . 10.00
Facsimiles @ 1.00 per page 10.00

TOTAL CHARGES . . . + o « « « « « =« = . $65.63

TOTAL SERVICES AND CHARGES . . . . .+ - $2,821.88

TOTAL DOE THIS STATEMENT . . . . . . . $2,821.88

Pleage remit payment to:
Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP
P. -0, Box 911541
Dallas, Texas 75391-1541
X
Thigs statement is due upon receipt. Please call Roy W. Hardin
(214) 740-8B000 " of this firm if you have guestions concerning
legal services covered by it or if you dispute the amount of the
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accounting Depaxrtment
-(214) 740-8347 can answer questions concerning payments on your *account.

Any payment for less than the full amount of this statement tendered
in full satisfaction of this statement {oxr any portionm of it} should
bd sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: Accounts Receivable,
2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 2200, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776
PRIVACY NOTICE

Locke Liddell & Sapp may acquire and collect nonpublic personal -

information about clients and former c¢lients in the course of

providing legal agrvices. Such information may be obtained from

the clieant; may be generated as a result of the sexrvices provided;

or may be received from third parties involved in, or affiliated

JT-APP 3050
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June 12, 2001
Golden Blount
Page 3

As of May 31, 2001
File No.: 09842/79075

Re: Golden Blount, In¢. v. Robert H. Peterson Co.

with, the services provided.

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp reserve the right to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation about clients or former clients, except as permitted by law,

Locke Liddell & Sapp restricts access to nonpublic personal inform-
ation to those employees who need to know that information to
provide the applicable-gervices. Locke Liddell & Sapp maintains
physical, electronic and procedural safequards-that comply with
federal regulations to guard the nonpublic personal :Lnformatn.on

of clients and former clients.

JT-APP 3051
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1.OCKE LIDDELL & SAPP wir ) B L1561

s Tax ID 74-1164324
ATTORNEYS & COUNSELORS

July 17, 2001
Golden Blount
Golden Blount, Inc.
4301 Weatgrove
Addison, TX 75001 -
As of June 30, 2002

File No.: 09842/7907S

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H. Petexson Co.

DATE" SERVICES - - ATTY HOURS VALUE

06/01/01 m " CEP 3.00 690.00
) i . draft propoded Protective :
Order; revise draft of Golden Blount‘'sy
responee to RHP's discovery reguests. .
06/04/01 Attention to propesed Protective Order; RWH .50 187.50
’ - =

06/04/01 Draft Protective Order; NN C CEP 6.00 1,380.00

L3

draft joint motion for discovery of the

agreed protective order; draft -

correspondence concerning the present

action: revise draft of Golden Blownt's

response to RHP's document requests;

revise draft of Golden Blount's

response to RHP's Interroiatories;

06/06/01 Prepare for meeting with client RWH .50, 187.50
regarding ey,

-06/13/01 Review prosecution history of patent in CEP 5.00 1,150.00

suit; e
B ——— e e——
N
i -
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06/22/01

Golden Blount
Page 2

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H. Peterson Co.

P

DATE SERVICES

S

July 17, 2001

As of Jume 30, 2002

.File No.: 09842/79075

- ATTY

06/14/01 Review files oyt " CEP

R A e it e —
m;

review correspondence concerning "y

06/18/01 W " CEP

review prior art

in vi ew’of M
ogminmg; draft correspondence to client
concerning same; review prosecution
history of the patent in suit in view
of !!!ll"l.llllllllllllllllllllilbo

06/19/01 Review of prior art submitted by RWH

defendant; adding responses to

interrogatory answers; el o

Al

Attention to service of discovery ~ RWH

responses and correction of document

responses.

06/29/01 Preparing for and conferring with *  RWH

opposing counsel to deliver offer to’
drop past infringement damage charge if
attorney fees are paid and product
. removed from market - M=y
N

. TOTAL SERVICES

13 . -
DATE CHARGES

Air Freight Shipments
Messenger Services
Postage

TOTAL HOURS

ERY

- - - - . -

HOURS VALURE

2.00 460.00

1.50 345.00

2.50 837.50

.50 187.50

.50 187.50

22.00

. $5,712.50 -

VALUE

11.12
20.00
24.50

J1.hPP 3092
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Golden Blount

July 17, zool

.Page 3 i ._ ’ . oo -

- Ags of ﬁune 30, 2002

File No.: 09842/79075

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. wv. Robert H. Petefson Co.

DATE CHRARGES - . . VALUE
Photocopies ®.20 per pagé . a- 158.80

Facsimiles @ 1.00 per- page ) o 46.00

‘06/27/01  Computerized Research - Dialog (05/0%) ) 24,21
TOTAL CHARGES . . . . . « i =« « ' = $284.65

TQTAL SERVICES AND CHARGES . . . . . L $5,997.15

TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMENT . ." . o - $5,997.15

Please remit payments to:
Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP

P. O. Box 911541

Dallas, Texag 75391-1541

This statement is due upon receipt. Please call Roy W. Hardin
(214) 740-8000 of this firm if you have quesgtionsg concerning
legal services covered by it or if you dispute the ‘amcunt of the
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accounting Department

(214) 740-8347 can answer questions concerning payments on your account.

Any payment for less than the full amount of this statement tendered
in full savigfaction of this statement (or any portion of it) should
be sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: RAccounts Receivable,
2200 Ross Avenue, Sulte 2200, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776

PRIVACY NOTICE .
Locke Liddell & Sapp may acquire and collect nonpublic personal
information about clients and former clients in the course of
providing legal services. Such information may be obtained from
the client; may be generated as a result of the services provided;
or may be received from third parties ipvolved in, or affiliated

JT-APP 3054
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. - July 17, 2001
Golden Blount
Page 4

As of June 30, 2002

File No.: 09842/7907%

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Roberk H.. Peterson Co.

"with, the services provided.

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp reserve the right to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation about clients~or former clients, except as permitted by law.

Locke Liddell & Sapp restrlcts access to nonpublic perscobal inform-,
ation to thogse employeesn who need to know that information to
provide the applicable’ servxces. Locke Liddell & Sapp maintaing
physical, electronic and procedural safeguards that comply with

federal regulations to guard the nonpublic personal information
of clients and former clients.

A-10
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LOCKE L]DDELL & Sapp wel - DAvis, Dol 753911541

Tax 1D 74-1164324 -
Arromevs&comsmoks A . 1643

Rugust 14, 2001
Golden Blount . .

Golden Blount, Inc.
4301 Westgrove ]
addison, TX 75001 : . “Tas of July 21, 2001

_File No.: 09842/79075

Re: Golden Blount, ‘Inc. v. Robert H. Peterson Co.

o

DATE " SERVICES : T : : ATTY HOURS VALUE

07/19/01 W’a *© RWH " .25  © 93.75
v call to oppoding - -

counsel regarding discovery matters.

07/24/01 Review of Peterson claims regarding RWRH 1.50 562,50
SRR ¢ . . . _
077/24/01 Telecon with opposing counse.l to RWH - .50 187.50

infuire whether Peterson to take

product off market; SRy .

1)

E N el s S 5 D e N B O m  m e

07/31/01 Telecon w:,t:h opposlng counsel regarding RWH : .50 ° 187.50
positzlon of defendants on :analld.x,ty. -
TOTAL HOURS 2.75-
TOTAL SERVICES . . « - « + « + « « o« '$1,031.25
- - TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMENT . . . . . ... - §31,031.25

e .

o SURTOE JT-APP 3056
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.- hugust 14, 2001
Golden Blount -

Page 2

As of July 31, 2001
File No.: 09842/79075

Re: Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H._Péterson Co.

Please remit payment to:

Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP

P. O. Box 911541

Dallag, Texas 753%1-1541 )

This statement is due upon receipt. Please call Roy W. Hardin

(214) 740-8000 of this firm if you have questions concerning ]

legal services covered by it or if you dispute the amount of the
statement. Ms. Emily Teague in our Accounting Department

“{214) 740-8247 can answer questions concerning payments on your account,

Any payment for less than the full amount of this statement tendered
in full satisfaction of this statement (or any portion of it) should-
be sent to: Locke Liddell & Sapp LLP, Attention: Accounts Receivable,
2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 2200, Dallas, Texas 75201-6776

) PRIVACY NOTICE
Locke Liddell & S4pp. may acquire and collect noupubllc peérsonal
information about clients and former clients in the course of
providing legal services. Such information may be obtained from
- tHe client; may be generated as a result of the services provided;

Or may be received from third parties involved in, or affiliated
with, the services provided.

Locke Liddell & Sapp does not disclose, nor does Locke Liddell &
Sapp xesexrve the wight to disclose, any nonpublic personal inform-
ation zbout clients or former clLents, except as permltted by law.

Locke DLiddell & Sapp restricts accesa to nonpubllc personal inform-
ation to those employees who need to know that information to
provide the applicable sexrvices. Locke Liddell & Sapp maintains
physical, electronic and procedural’ safegquards that comply with

federal regulations to guard the noppublic personal 1nformat10n
of clients and former clients.

AT



SUMMARY OF LOCKE, LIDDELL, & SAPP, LLP BILLING
(From January, 2000 to July, 2001)

FEE EARNER TOTAL HOURS - BILLING RATE
L. Dan Tucker 1.90 $325.00

Monty L. Ross 1.50 $335.00

Roy W. Hardin 2215 $350.00 - $375.00
Michael W. Dubner 20.00 $135.00

Charles Phipps 34.00 $130.00

Total: 80.15 hours $18,967.50

SUMMARY OX HITT GAINES, .C. BILLING
(From August, 2001 to June 10, 2004)

FEE EARNER TOTAL BOURS BILLING RATE
William D. Harris, Jr. | 437.00 $350.00
1 Charles W. Gaines 202.80 $290.00

Charles W. Gaines 137.60 $300.00
Greg H. Parker 965.10 $175.00
Greg H. Parker 170.90 $225.00
James Ortega 67.50 $175.00
Carol Garland 21.60 $75.00
(Paralegal)

Caro! Garland 8.8 $90.00
(Paralegal)

Trudy McGruder 36.10 $65.00
(Paralegal)

Total: 2251.60 hours $548,428.00

JT-APP 3058
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SUMMARY OF SCHULTZ & ASSOCIATES, P.C. BILLING
(From September, 2003 to June 10, 2004)

FEE EARNER TOTAL HOURS BILLING RATE
: William D. Harris, Jr. | 162.6 $325.00

John Pemberton | 9.1 $195.00

Total: 171.7 hours $54,619.50

JT-APP 3059
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Q/ P [‘\\’ ‘ .U.S. DISTRICT COU= i
?\G Y NORTHERN DISTRICT OF 1£Ax5
o%

FILED

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COYURT -9 04
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TENAS &P
DALLAS DIVISION

CLERK, U.S.]P&S/TRICT COURT

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC. By

Deputy

Plaintiff,
CIVIL ACTION NO.

3-01-CV-0127-R
v.

ROBERT H. PETERSON CO.,

Defendant.

AN LT U U O T L N L U

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.’S APPLICATION FOR COSTS

TO THE HONORABLE UNITED STATES JUDGE JERRY BUCIIMEYER:

NOW COMES Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc. (hercinafter “Golden Blount™) to file this its
Application for Costs (hereinafter “the Application”) against Robert H. Peterson Co. (hereinafier
“Robert H. Pcterson™), and would show the Court as follows:

1. On September 2, 2004, the Court in the above-styled action adopted the Findings
of Fact and Conclusions of Law submitted by Golden Blount on August 31, 2004, finding for
Golden Blount on all issues. Among other things, the Court determined that Robert H. Peterson
willfully infringed the Blount Patent. The Court further found that this was an “exceptional

case,” warranting an award of attorneys’ fces to Golden Blount.

2. Golden Blount has expended approximately $10,031.04 in Costs related to Robert
H. Peterson’s infringement of the ‘159 Patent.
3. Golden Blount now seeks to recover the Costs in the amount of $10,031.04,

which are clearly set forth and supported in the Bill of Costs filed with the Court on September

&, 2004.

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR COSTS —
Page 1 of 3

. o ) ‘ JT-APP 3060



WHEREFORE, PREMISES CONSIDERED, Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc. requests

that this Court grant Golden Blount’s Costs, and award them against Robert H. Peterson.

DATE: September 9, 2004.

Respectfully submitted,

For Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc.

Charles W. Gaines

State Bar No. 07570580
Greg H. Parker

State Bar No. 24011301
HITT GAINES, P.C.

2435 North Central Plaza
Suite 1300

Richardson, Texas 75080
972/480-8800 (Telephone)
972/480-8865 (Facsimile)

William D. Harms, Jr.

State Bar No. 09109000
ScHULTZ & ASSOCIATES, P.C.
5400 LBJ Freceway

One Lincoln Center, Suite 525
Dallas, Texas 75240
214/210-5940 (Telephone)
214/210-5941 (Facsimile)

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR COSTS -

Pagelof3

JT-APP 3061
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CERTIFICATE OF CONFERENCE

I hereby certify that on or about September 9, 2004, a conference was held with counsel
for Defendant, to determine whether agreement could be reached with regard to the relief sought

hercin. As a result of such conference, agrecment could not be reached; accordingly, the matter

is presented to the Court for determination.

arles W. Gaines

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that true and correct copics of Golden Blount, Inc.’s Application for

Costs was served upon the following counsel of record, via first class mail on September 9,

2004.

Jerry R. Selinger

Jenkens & Gilchrist

1445 Ross Avenue, Sulte 3200
Dallas, Texas 75202

(214) 855-4500

(214) 855-4300 (Facsimile)

Sl Fo

Charles W. Gaines '

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC’S APPLICATION FOR COSTS -
Page 3 of 3
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALLAS DIVISION
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC,, §
§
Plaintiff, §
§ Civil Action No.
v. §
) § 3-01CV0127-R
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO,, §
§
Defendant. §

ORDER

This Court, consistent with the Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law adopted on September
2,2004, in which Golden Blount was awarded treble damages and attorneys’ fees, is of the opinion that
Golden Blount Costs shall be taxed against Defendant.

IT IS SO ORDERED. L

ENTERED: this day of , 2004,

JERRY BUCHMEYER
SENIOR UNITED STATES DISTRICT JUDGE
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

JT-APP 3063
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ORIGINAL o

IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COQHTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS FILED
DALLAS DIVISION

SEP 16 2004
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.,

Plaintiff, CLERK, !‘@.—gsmcr COURT

Deputy J

VS, CA 3:01-CV-0127-R

ROBERT H. PETERSON CO.,

LT UG R U S O U WO o

Defendant.

ORDER OF REFERENCE

Plaintiff’s APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEY FEES (filed September 8, 2004) and
Plaintiff’s APPLICATION FOR COSTS (filed September 9, 2004) are referred to United States
Magistrate Judge Paul D. Stickney for hearing, if necessary, and recommendations or determination,
to this Court. See 28 U.S.C.A. § 636(b) (1993).

Future pleadings concerning these motions shall be filed with a transmittal letter addressed

to Magistrate Judge Stickney so copies can be sent directly to him without delay.
It is so ORDERED.,

SIGNED this é day of September, 2004.

%QM

MEYER
TED STATES DISTRICT JUDGE

DISTRICT OF TEXAS

JT-APP 3064



IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
NORFHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISIQN N \

J\"’

\

€LDEN BLOUNT, INC.

Plaintiff,
Civil Action No. 3-01CV0127-R
V.
(JURY TRIAL DEMANDED)
ROBERT H. PETERSON €CO.

L LD L U L S O O L

Defendant.

NOTICE OF APPEAL

Notice 1s hereby given that the Robert H. Peterson Co., Defendant in the above-identified
action, hereby appeals to the United States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit from this
Court’s August 18, 2004 Order, vacating Defendants findings of fact and conclusions of law and
adopting Plamntff’s findings of fact and conclusions of law (attached hereto as Exhibit A).
In the alternative, Defendant Robert H. Peterson Co. appeals from the following:
1} Order entered September 2, 2004, vacating Defendant Robert H. Peterson’s
Application for Attorneys’ Fees previously adopted on August 11, 2004 {attached
hereto as Exhibit B);

2) Order entercd September 2, 2004, vacating Defendant’s Findings of Fact and
Conclusions of Law previously adopted on June 22, 2004 and adopting Plaintiff's
Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law submitted on August 31, 2004 (attached

hereto as Exhibit C}; and

JT-APP 3065



3) Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law dated September 2, 2004 (attached

hereto as Exhibit D).

Dated: September /7, 2004

OF COUNSEL:

Leland W. Hutchinson, Jr.
Jennifer L. Fitzgerald

David S. Becker

FREEBORN & PETERS, LLP
311 S. Wacker Dr., Suite 3000
Chicago, lllinois 60606
312/360-6000 (Telephone)
312/360-6572 (Facsimile)

k631561

}

Respectfully submitted,

Qygrens [ .y
Je . Selipger

Sta®¢ Bar No. 18008250 l'}
JENKINS & GILCHRIST, .C.
1445 Ross Avenue, Suite 3200
Dallas, Texas 75202

214/855-4776 (Telephone)
214/855-4300 (Facsimile)

2 JT-APP 3066
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

This certifies that a copy of the foregoing document was served by first-class mail,
postage prepaid, to counsel for Plaintiff, William D. Harris, Jr., Schultz & Associates, P.C., 5400
LBJ Freeway, One Lincoln Center, Suite 525, Dallas, Texas 75240. and Charles Gaines, Hitt
Gaines, P.C., 2435 North Central Plaza, Suite 1300, Richardson, Texas 75080, this 17th day of

September, 2004. % P
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MINUTE ORDER

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

PLACE: Dallas JUDGE: Jerry Buchmeyer DATE: August 18, 2004

REPORTER: Joe Belton

COURTROOM DEPUTY : Tannica Stewart

INTERPRETER: CSO : Present ) COURT TIME: 2.0
CIVIL ACTION
TIME CASE NUMBER & STYLE TYPE OF HEARING ATTYS PRESENT
10:00 a.m. 3:01-CV-127-R Motion Hearing P - Charles Gaines

Golden Blount, v. Peterson

11:40 a.m.

D - Leland Hutchinson
Dft's findings of fact and conclusions of law
VACATED. ... Plaintiff's findings of fact and

conclusions of law adopted.

Court adjourned

US.DISTRICT COURT
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF
FILED

AJG | 8 2004

CLERK, U.S. DISTRICT COURT
By

Deputy S

JT-APP 3068
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IN THE UNITED STATES I Is‘Fﬁié*Hf%x .
FOR THE NORTHERN DISIRICT OF-TEXAS:-

DALLAS DIVISION SEP - 2 700z '
l

" CLERK,US.DISTRICT COURT

Tk il }L,AJ.b

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC,, §
§ By 7
PlaintifT, § ety 2
§ Civil Action No.
V. § :
§ 3-01CV0127-R
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO.,, §
§
Defendant. §
ORDER

This Court, consistent with its ruling at the conclusion of the Oral Hearing on August 18,
2004, hereby VACATES Defendant Robert H. Peterson’s Application for Attormmeys’ Fees
previously adopted on August {1, 2004.

IT IS SO ORDERED.
ENTERED: this Q. dayof S@T;# , 2004

Moy

JERRY IBU YER
SENJOR UN STATES DIST TJUDGE

NORYVYHERN TRICT OF TEXAS

JT-APP 3069
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IN THE UNITED STATES PISTRICT Cf URT .
FOR THE NORTHERN DI‘ETRICT FTEXAS
AL VISIK - . ,
DALLAS DI ON SEP -2 - :
e
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC,, § CLERK, US.DISTRICT COURT |
§ By % |
.. Deputy
Plaintiff, §
§ Civil Action No.
V. §
§ 3-01CVOI127-R
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO., §
§
Defendant. §
ORDER

This Court, consistent with its ruling at the conclusion of the Oral Hearing on August 18,

2004, hereby VACATES Defendant’s Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law previously adopted

onJune 22, 2004. The Court, also consistent with its ruling at the conclusion of the Oral Hearing on

August 18, 2004, is of the opinion that the Plaintiff’s Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law

submitted on August 31, 2004, are correct, and they are hereby ADOPTED as the Findings and

Conclustons of this Court.

IT IS SO ORDERED.

ENTERED: this % day of S{(\?‘\ , 2004,

Xw@u& Ly

JE

MEYER
TED STATES DISTRICT JUDGE

NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

JT-APP 3070
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT- I~~»*—'~’~’
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEKA!?E
P -2 204

DALLAS DIVISION

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC., CLERK, US. DISTRICT COURT

By
Deputy

Civil Action No.

PlaintifT,

v.
3-01CV0127-R
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO.,

O LD N L LN WO LN LN WO

Defendant.

FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUS[ONS OF LAW

This Court has conducted a bench trial on plaintiff Golden Blount Inc.’s claims against
defendant Robert H. Peterson for a finding of infringement of U.S. Patent No. 5,988,159 and
permanent injunction, and on Peterson’s counterclaims of invalidity and non-infringement. In
accordance with FED. R. Civ. P. 52(a) and consistent with the Court of Appeals for the Federal
Circuit’s Opinion' decided April 19, 2004, the Court enters the following findings of fact and

conclustons of law.?

FINDINGS OF FACT

1. Thisis an action for patent infringement. The Court has subject matter jurisdiction under 28
U.S.C. §§ 1331, 1338(a). The Court has personal jurisdiction over the parties. Venue in this judicial
district is proper under 28 U.S.C. § 1391.

' While the Appeliate Court held that the patent was not invalid, and that the defense of unenforceability
was waived, this Court includes general reference to these elcments for comp]ctcncss Golden Blount, inc. v.
Robert H. Peterson Co., 365 F.3d 1054 (Fed. Cir. 2004).

*This order contains both findings of fact ("Findings") and conclusions of law {"Conclusions”). To the

.extent that any Findings may be deemed conclusions of law, they shall also be considered Conclusions. To the

extent that any Conclusions may be deemed findings of fact, they shall also be considered Findings. See Miller v.
Fenton, 474 US. 104, 113-14, 88 L. Ed. 2d 405, 106 S. Ct. 445 (1985).

-1-
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2. Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc. (“Blount™) is a United States corporation having a principal

place of business in Addison, Texas.

3. Defendant Robert H. Peterson Co. (“Peterson’) is a United States corporation having a
pdqcipai place of business in City of Industry, California.

4. Blount is the owner by assignment of U.S. Patent No. 5,988,159 (“the ‘159 patent”), entitled
“Gas-Fired Artificial Logs and Coals-Burner Assembly,” which issued on November 23, 1999. The
‘159 patent expires on November 23, 2016.

5. Blount filed this suit for infringcmcﬁt of the “159 patent under 35 U.S.C. §§ 271(a) thru 271
(c) on January 18, 2001. '

6. On March 19, 2001, Peterson filed its Answer a_nd Counterclaim. Peterson denied
infringement and asserted counterclaims for noninfringement and invalidity of the * 15§ patent.

7. A bench trial, by agreement of the parties, commenced on July 29, 2002, and ended on July

31, 2002.
8. Claims 1, 2, 5, 7-9, 11-13 and 15-17 are at issue in this case. Claims | and 17 are

independent claims. All the other claims at issue are dependent on claim 1.
9. Claim 1 of the ‘159 patent reads as %ollows:
A gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly for fireplace comprising:
an elongated primary burner tube including a plurality of gas discharge ports;
a secondary coals burner elongated tube positioned forwardly of the primary
burner tube;
a support means for holding the elongated primary burner tube in a raised
level relative to the forwardly position secondary coals bumer elongated tube;
the secondary coals burner elongated tube including a plurality of gas
discharge ports;
the elongated primary bumer tube and the secondary coals burner elongated
tube communicating through tubular connection means wherein the gas flow to the
secondary elongated coals burner tube is fed through the primary bumner tube and the

tubular connection means;
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a valve for adjusting gas flow to the secondary coals burner elongated tube
positioned in the tubular gas connection means; and
the primary bummer tube being in communication with a gas source with a gas

flow control means therein for controlling gas flow into said primary burner tube.

10. Claim 2 of the ‘159 patent reads as follows:
The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly according to claim 1
wherein the support means for the primary burner tube is comprised of an open frame
pan for supporting the primary burner tube in an elevated position rclative to the

fireplace floor.

11. Claim 5 of the ‘159 patent reads as follows:

The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-bumner assembly according to claim 1
wherein the secondary coals burner elongated tube is substantially parallel to the
primary burner tube and has a smaller inside diameter than the primary burner tube
with the valve adjusting gas flow for coals burn and forwarding heat radiation from

the fireplace.

12. Claim 7 of the *159 patent reads as follows:
The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly according to claim I
wherein the elongated primary burner tube and the secondary coals bumner elongated

tube are spaced apart on different planes at from about four to about cight inches.

13. Claim 8 of the ‘159 patent reads as follows:
The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-bumer assembly according to claim 1
wherein the secondary coals bumer ¢longated tube is of a smaller diameter than the

primary burner tube which allows for a lower profile of coals and sand coverage.

14. Claim 9 of the *159 patent reads as follows:

-3
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15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

. .

The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly according to claim 1
wherein the secondary coals bumner elongated tube is adjustable in height relative to

the floor of the fireplace and the elevated primary burner tube.

Claim 11 of the 159 patent reads as follows:
The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly according to claim 1
wherein the primary and secondary burner tubes have apertures of from about 1/32

inch to about ¥ inch.

Claim 12 of the 159 patent reads as follows:

The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-bumer assembly according to clairh I

wherein the gas flow adjustment valve has a removable handle, the gas flow

adjustment allowing a variety of settings from full closed to full open.

Claim 13 of the ‘159 patent reads as follows:

The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly according to claim 1
wherein the connection means is comprised of a connector attached to the terminal
end of the primary burner tube at a first end of a connector and attached to the
secondary coals burner elongated tube to a connector second end with the valve

interposed between the primary burner tube and the secondary burner tube.

Claim 15 of the ‘159 patent reads as follows:
The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly according to claim 1
wherein the open frame pan and primary elongated bumer tube is positioned under

an artificial logs and grate support means.

Claim 16 of the ‘159 patent reads as follows:
The gas-fired artificial logs and coals-burner assembly according to claim 1

wherein the primary elongated burner tube is covered with sand and the secondary

4.
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20.

R

elongated burner tube is covered with sand, mica, and fibrous materials which

stmulate coals and ember burn.

Claim 17 of the 159 patent reads as follows:

A gas-fired artificial coals- and embers-burner apparatus suitable for attaching
to a gas-fired primary artificial log burner tube said primary artificial log bumer tube
having a terminal end comprising;:

a secondary coals buming elongated tube;

a connector means for connecting said terminal end in communication with
the secondary burner tube, the secondary burner tube positioned substantially
parallel, forward and below the primary burner tube, the connector means lmﬁﬁg
interposed between the primary and secondary bumer tubes a gas flow adjustment
valve, the primary and secondary burner tubes having a plurality of gas discharge
ports, the secondary burner tube being in gas flow communication with the primary
bumer tube being the connection means, a gas distribution poris of the secondary

burner tube directed away from the fireplace opening.

fulfills exactly the same purpose. (Tr. vol. 2, pg 175; Defendant’s Ex. No. D-33).

-5

21. At the time the patent issued, Blount’s commercial structure covered by the 159 patent had
been marketed for approximately six years. {Trial Transcript, hereafier referred to as "Tr.", vol. 1,
pg. 158). The invention covered by the ‘159 patent is a simple yet very useful device that is to be
used in artificial gas fireplaces. The general 1dea is that the device has two tubes, with the main or
primary burner tube being higher than the ember burner tube to allow for artificial embers and sand
to be fanned out over the tubes with a decreasing depth of materials to simulate a natural angle of
repose of coals in a real fireplace. A secondary valve controls the flow of gas from the primary
burner tube to the ember burner to allow for an adjustment of flame from the ember burner. Thus,
with the presence of the ember buner forward the primary burmner tube, more flame can be provided
out front of the gas logs to better simulate a real fireplace and thereby make the artificial fireplace

more aesthetically pleasing. Evidence presented at trial establishes that Peterson’s accused device
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22. Blount’s sales of its commercial structure grew significantly during the time spanning the
filing of the application that resulted in the “159 patent and the issuance of the *159 patent. (Tr., vol.
1, pg. 36-37). _

23, In late 1996 or early 1997, Peterson began manufacturing, advertising and selling a device
that was strikingly similar to, if not a virtual copy of, Blount’s commercial structure. (Tr., vol. 2,
pg. 76 and pg. 172).

' 24. Blount’s ‘159 patent issued on November 23, 1999. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 1).

25. Blount notified Peterson of the existence of the ‘159 patent and Peterson’s infringing
activities on December 16, 1999, using a certified letter postmarked December 10, 1999, from Mr.
Dan Tucker (attorney for Blount) to Peterson's president, Mr. Leslie Bortz. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 10).

26. This first certified letter included a copy of the 159 patent, and informed Pcterson that
Blount was prepared to take whatever steps were reasonable and necessary to prevent infringement.
Blount requested a response regarding this matter from Peterson by January 14, 2000. (Plaintiff’s
Ex. No. 10). '

27.OnDecember 17, 1999, Mr. Tod Corrin (Peterson’s Vice President) forwarded the December
10, 1999, certified letter onto Peterson’s patent counsel, Mr. William McLaughlin. Mr. Corrin
wrote, in a cover letter included with the copy of the first certified letter, "[e]nclosed is a patent
infringement letter we received from Golden Blount’s Attorney.” (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 17, emphasis
added). Given the letter from Blount’s attorney and this acknowledgment by Mr. Corrin, this Court

finds that Peterson had knowledge of its infringement of the 159 patent as of December 16, 1999.

28. On December 30, 1999, Peterson responded to Blount’s letter of December 10, 1999,
explaining that Peterson had forwarded the December 10, 1999, letter to its attorneys and that
Peterson would get back with Blount as soon as possible. Given the December Holidays, as well as
the New Year, Peterson informed Blount that Blount’s January 14, 2000, response date was
unreasonable. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 11). 7

29. After receiving no response from Peterson for more than four months, Blount sent a second
certified letter to Peterson on May 3, 2000, again informing Peterson of its patent infringement. The
May 3, 2000, letter advised Peterson that Blount "will take {the] necessary steps to stop any such
infringement." (Plaintiff's Ex. No. 12, emphasis added).
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30. Peterson responded to the May 3, 2000, letter on May 16, 2000, that it disagreed with
Blount's assertion that Peterson was marketing a device that was substantially similar to the burner

assembly claimed in the ‘159 patent. Peterson further asked that Blount explain to it, in detail, the

-basis upon which Blount believed that Peterson was infn'nginé the patent. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 13).

This Court finds that Peterson’s disagreement lacks any serious credibility, since a simple
comparison of the device as illustrated in the ‘159 patent with Peterson’s product would have
revealed to any reasonable person that infringement was highly likely. Moreover, the record before
this Court reveals that Peterson did not have any documents before it or its attorney at this time that
provides a reasonable basis for this statement. Even though Blount did not give any cxplanation to
Peterson, this did not relieve Peterson of its obligation to investigate in good faith whether it was in
fact infringing the 159 patent. This Court further finds that the May 3, 2000, letter was written
simply for the purpose of delay, or even with the hope that the infringement matter would go away.
This Court, therefore, concludes that the request was natAgcnuine,

31.0n January 18, 2001, overa year after Peterson received its first notice of infringement letter,
Blount filed suit. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 14). Blount’s initial notice letter of December 10, 1999, met
the notice requirements under 35 U.S.C. § 287(a), and thercfore, Peterson’s additional information
request did not relieve Peterson of its obligation to determine if it was infringing the ‘159 patent.

32. Blount sent a final letter on January 19, 2001, to Peterson advising Peterson that suit was
brought in view of its failure to respond or indicate in any manner its intcntions with respect to its
infringing product. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 14).

33. Peterson made no efforts to cease its infringing activities either in the time period spanning
the December 10, 1999, letter and the January 19, 2001, letter, or for that matter, up and until the
commencement of this trial. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 17 & Updated Sales Figures provided by Peterson
in response to this Court’s request).

34. During the period between December 16, 1999, and Septcmbcr 19,2002, Peterson sold 3,723
ember flame burner units ("ember bumers"). (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 181 and Peterson Company’s Objection
to Golden Blount’s Motion for Updated Damages filed on September 18, 2002).

35. Peterson’s ember burner is intended to be attached to its G-4 series burner system or G-5

series bumer system. (Joint Pretrial Order--Stipulations, pg. 6). In addition to selling the ember
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burner, Peterson also sells log sets that can be used with the ember burner and often uses the ember
burner to entice their customers to come back in and buy new log sets. (Tr. vol. 2, pg 178).

36. The G-4 and G-5 series bumner systems are substantially identical except that Peterson pre-
assembles the G-5 burner system according to certain Canadian Gas Association specifications. (Tr.,
vol. 2, pg. 179).

37. At least 10 of the 3,723 Ember burners sold by Peterson were included on the pre-assembled
G-S$ series burner systems. (Oct. 5, 2001, deposition of Mr. Leslie Bortz, pg. 154-53).

38. At trial, Blount introduced Plaintiff’s Exhibit No. 4A, which is one of Peterson’s
manufactured products including a Peterson G-4 burner pan with Peterson’s ember bumner attached
- to it. Blount properly laid foundation for this Plaintiff’s Exhibit No. 4A through the testimony of
one of Peterson’s own witnesses, Mr. Jankowski, who stated that he recognized Plaintiff's Exhibit
No. 4A as Peterson’s products. (Tr. vol. 2, pg. 145). Also, Mr. Blount, whose business competes
with Peterson’s, identified Plaintiff’s Exhibit No. 4A as being Peterson’s competing product. (Tr.
vol. 1, pg. 144). This Court also finds that foundation for this device is further established because
the Court finds it to be virtually identical to the picture on page 3 of Peterson’s own general
installation instructions (introduced at trial by Peterson as Defendant’s Ex. No. D-34), except for the

valve knob, which is not at issue.

LITERAL INFRINGEMENT -DIRECT

39. The construction of the claims appears under paragraphs 120 thru 123 of the Conclusions of
Law section. The determination of infringement based on the construed claims is factual and is
thereforc organized here under the Findings of Fact.

40. The analysis with respect to the literal infringement of claim 1 is as follows

The first element of claim 1 reads: "an elongated primary bumer tube including a plurality of gas
discharge ports.” Based upon the totality of the evidence, including unrebutted testimony of Mr.
Golden Blount and this Court’s own observations of the accused device, it is this Court’s finding that
the primary bumner tube is the fundamental burner tube used in a majority of all gas operated
fireplaces. Similarly, the plurality of gas discharge ports allow the flammable gas to escape from
the primary bumer tube and be ignited to provide a flame. Blount presented the unrebutted oral
testimony of Mr. Blount, who using an infringement chart (Plaiatiff’s Ex. No. 9) as a guide, testified

-8-
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that Peterson’s manufactured products include a primary burner tube hziving gas discharge ports
therein. (Tr., vol. I, pg. 45-50). In addition to this unrcbutted testimony, this Court had the
opportunity to closely observe an assembled version of Peterson’s manufactured product’, wherein
this Court observed Peterson’s manufactured product having the primary bumer tube including two
or more gas discharge ports. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 28). Peterson even admitted and stipulated to the
presence of this element in its device. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 173; Joint Pretrial Order--Stipulations, pg. 6).
Further, Peterson never presented any evidence that its manufactured products did not contain the
aforementioned claimed element. Thus, Peterson’s manufactured products meet the first limitation
of claim 1, which reads: "an elongated primary burmner tube inciuding a plurality of gas discharge
ports."”

41. The second element of claim 1 reads: "a secondary coals bumer clongated tube ‘positioned
forwardly of the primary bumner tube." Given the claim interpretation as set forth by the Court of
Appeals for the Federal Circuit and based upon the totality of the evidence, the secondary coals
bumer elongated tube is positioned toward the opening of the fireplace, at least as compared to the
primary burner tube, and is designed to provide a realistic flame, likened to a flame that might
emanate from burning coals. Blount again presented evidence in the form of oral testimony of Mr.
Blount, that Peterson’s manufactured products include a secondary coals burner elongated tube, and
that it is positioned forwardly of the primary burner tube. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 45-50). Bascd on this
Court’s close observation of Peterson’s manufactured product?, this Court finds that Peterson’s
manufactured products contain the claimed secondary coals bumer elongated tube, which in
Plaintiff’s Exhibit No. 4A is Peterson’s Ember Flame Booster (ember burner), and that it was
positioned forwardly the primary bumer tube. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 28). Peterson even admitted and
stipulated to the presence of this element in its device. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 173; Joint Pretrial Order--
Stipulations, pg. 6). Further, Peterson never presented evidence that conclusively established that
its manufactured products did not contain the aforementioned claimed element. Thus, Peterson’s
manufactured products meet the second limitation of claim 1, which reads: "a secondary coals burner

elongated tube positioned forwardly of the primary burner tube.”

3 See Finding of Fact No. 38, discussed above.
* See Finding of Fact No. 38, discussed above,
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42. The third element of claim 1 recads: "a support means for holding the elongated primary
burner tube in a raised level relative to the forwardly positionfed] secondary coals burner ¢longated
tube." The previous two paragraphs already demonstrate that Peterson’s manufactured products
include both the elongated primary bumner tube and the forwardly positioned secondary coals burner
clongated tube. The only additional limitation added by this element is that a support means holds
the elongated primary burner tube in a raised level relative to the secondary coals bumner elongated
tube. Peterson’s manufactured products include a support means that holds the primary burner tube.
Actually, Peterson’s support means, which is an industry standard pam, is substantially identical if
not completely identical, in shape and function to the support means illustrated in the ‘159 patent.
(Tr., vol. 1, pg. 47). The question for this Court to rule on is whether Peterson’s support means
holds Peterson’s elongated primary burner tube in a raised level relative to its secondary coals bumer
clongated tube. As affirned by the Court of Appeal for the Federal Circuit, this Court construes the
term "raised level” to mean that the top of the primary burner tube is at a raised level with respect
to the top of the secondary burner tube. Blount offered evidence at trial that the top of Peterson's
primary burmer tube was higher than the top of Peterson’s ember bumer tube, by demonstrating
before this Court, using a carpenter’s level laid across the tops of the tubes of Plaintiff’s Exhibit No.
4A, that Peterson’s primary burner tube was raised with respect to its secondary burner. (Tr., vol.
2, pg. 28). Even Peterson’s own patent attorney, Mr. McLaughlin, admitted during the
demonstration that “assuming the table is level, the top of thé_front burner is below the top of the
rear bumner.” (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 29). Also, Peterson’s executive Mr. Bortz admitted that the top of the
ember bumer was lower than the top of the primary bumer. (Tr,, vol. 2, pg. 42). Simuarly, Mr.
Corrin testified that the tube is below the top of the main bumner tube. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 173 and
Defendant’s Ex. No. 8). The above evidence was, for the most part, unrebutted because Peterson
based the majority of its case in chief on the argument that the relative height of the pdmary burner
tube with respect to the secondary coals bumer elongated tube should be measured from the bottoms
of the respective tubes, or the ports. This Court further observed a general set of instructions
included within the box of each ember burner, (Defendant’s Ex. No. D-34 at pg. 3), which instructs
the person assembling the device to tighten the Ember Flame Booster (ember burner) so that the

valve faces forward and flush with the burner pan. According to the testimony of Mr. Bortz, the

normal configuration is to have the valve resting on the fireplace floor because it serves as a support

-10-

JT-APP 3080




l
!

-0
-/

® e

for the ember burner. (Leslie Bortz Deposition, vol, 1, pg. 70-71). At tnal, and as observed by this
Court, when the valve was resting on the table flush with the pan, the top of the primary burner was

above the top of the ember bumer. Additionally, Peterson actually offered to this Court,

(Defendant’s Ex. No. D-30), which it stated was provided to customers and instailers to illustrate
how to properly install the assembly. (Tr. vol. 2, pg. 183). While Defendant’s Exhibit No. D-30 was
offered in an attempt to establish non-infringement based upon Peterson’s asserted bottoms test that
it was proposing, the instructions clearly illustrate that Pcterson’s preferred installation has the tops
of the primary burner tube being in a raised level with respect to the tops of the secondary coals
ﬁumer elongated tube. Thus, given the above discussed interpretation, and in view of the evidence
presented, Peterson’s manufactured products meet the third limitation of claim 1, which reads: "a
support means for holding the elongated primary burner tube in a raised level relative to the
forwardly position[ed] secondary coals bumer elongated tube."

43. The fourth element of claim 1 reads: "the secondary coals bumer elongated tube including
a plurality of gas discharge ports." Blount again presented oral testimony of Mr. Blount that the
secondary coals burner elongated tube of Peterson’s manufactured products include a plurality of gas
discharge ports. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 45-50). Further, this Court’s close observation of Peterson’s
manufactured product’® established that Peterson’s secondary coals burner elongated tube includes
a plurality of gas discharge ports. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 28). Peterson also admuited to the presence of a
plurality of gas discharge ports or jets, (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 174), and mentions this claimed element in
its installation instructions. (Defendant’s Ex. No. D-34). Further, Peterson never presented any
evidence that its manufactured products did not contain the aforementioned claimed clement that
successfully rebuts Blount’s evidence on this point. Thus, Peterson’s manufactured products meet
the fourth limitation of claim 1, which reads: "the secondary coals bumner elongated tube including
a plurality of gas discharge ports.” _

44, The fifth element of claim 1 reads: “the elongated primary bumner tube and the secondary
coals burner clongated tube communicating through tubular connection means wherein the gas flow
to the secondary clongated coals burner tube is fed through the primary bumer tube and the tubular

connection means." Blount presented the oral testimony of Mr. Blount that Peterson’s manufactured

3 See Finding of Fact No. 38, discussed above.
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products include the tubular connection means and that the gas flow to the secondary elongated coals
bumer tube is fed through the primary bumer tube and tubular connection means. (Tr., vol. 1, pg.
45-50). Additionally, this Court physically observed this claimed element in Peterson’s
manufactured product®, (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 28), and again notes that the illustration in Defendant’s
Exhibit No. D-34 shows this tubular connection means. Moreover, Peterson never presented any
evidence that its manufactured products did not contain the aforementioned claimed element. Thus,
Peterson’s manufactured products meet the fifth limitation of claim 1, which reads: "the elongated
primary burner tube and the secondary coals burner elongated tube communicating through tubular
connection means wherein the gas flow to the secondary elongated coals burner tube is fed through
the primary burner tube and the tubular connection means."

45. The sixth element of claim 1 reads: "a valve for adjusting gas flow to the sccoﬁdary coals
bumer elongated tube positioned in the tubular gas connection means.” The evidence as established
by Mr. Blount’s testimony, Peterson’s general instructions (Defendant’s Ex. No. D-34), and this
Court’s own inspection of Plaintiff’s Exhibit No. 4A, confirms the presence of the valve. (Tr., vol.
1, pg. 45-50 and vol. 2, pg. 28). Peterson even admitted and stipulated to the presence of this
element in its device. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 173; Joint Pretrial Order--Stipulations, pg. 6). Further,
Peterson never presented any evidence that its manufactured products did not contain the
aforementioned claimed element. Thus, Peterson’s manufactured products meet the sixth limitation
of claim 1, which reads: "a valve for adjusting gas flow to the secondary coals burner elongated tube
positioned in the tubular gas connection means."

46. The seventh element of claim 1 reads: "the primary burner tube being in communication with
a gas source with a gas flow control means therein for controlling gas flow into said primary burner
tube." Blount again presented the oral testimony of Mr. Blount that the primary bumer tube of
Peterson’s manufactured products would ultimately be coupled to a gas source with a gas flow
control means therein for controlling gas flow into the primary burner tube. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 45-50).
Furthermore, the parties stipulatéd prior to the commencement of the trial that “Robert H. Peterson
Co.’s ember burner is intended to be attached to its G-4 series bumer system or G-5 serics bumer

system and the combined unit comprises a primary burner pipe, an ember pan that supports the

¢ Sce Finding of Fact No. 38, discussed above.
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primary bumer pipe, a secondary burner tube and a valve that controls a flow of gas between the
primary bumer pipe and the secondary burner tube, and that an end user would connect the primary
burner pipe to a gas source having a valve associated therewith." (Joint Pretrial Order--Stipulations,
pg. 6). Thus, Peterson’s manufactured products would ultimately meet the seventh limitation of

claim 1, which reads: “the primary bumer tube being in communication with a gas source with a gas

_ flow control means therein for controlling gas flow into said primary burner tube."

47. This Court finds that the above evidence is substantial and it clearly establishes that
Peterson’s accused device contains each and every element of claim 1 of the ‘159 patent.

48. The evidence presented at trial establishes that Peterson provided its customers with two sets
of installation instructions. One set was a general sct of instructions, (Defendant’s Ex. No, D-34 at
pg. 3), which instructs the person assembling the device to tighten the Ember Flame Booster (ember
burner) so that the valve faces forward and flush with the burner pan. According to the testimony
of Mr. Bortz, the normal configuration is to have the valve resting on the fireplace floor because it
serves as a support for the ember burner. (Leslic Bortz Deposition, vol. 1, pg. 70-71). At trial, and
as observed by this Court, when the valve is resting on the table flush with the pan, the top of the
primary burner is above the top of the ember burner. The other set of instructions, (Defendant’s Ex.
No. D-30), was very specific in the way in which the ember burner was to be oriented with respect
to the primary bummer. When the device is installed pursuant to these instructions, Defendant’s
Exhibit No. D-30 clearly shows that the top of the primary bumer is above the top of the ember
burner. Thus, both of these instructions consistently show that when the G-4 or the G-5 and the
ember bumer of Peterson’s accused device are installed pursuant {o these instructions, it would result
in an infringing configuration,

49. Although Peterson did not make this argument at any time during trial, Peterson asserts on
remand that Blount has not established direct infringement by it or its customers because Blount
never directly proved how the devices were actually assembled. Peterson, instead relied on its case-
in-chief that it did not infringe because of its urged claim construction and that the ‘159 patent was
invalid, both of which this Court and the Federal Circuit rejected. Moreover, Peterson’s position is
against the weight of the evidence, both direct and circumstantial, in this case. This Court finds that

-the evidence clearly supports a case of direct infringement, not only by Peterson, but by its customers

as well. Case law holds that when instructions are provided with an infringing device, it can be
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circumstantially inferred that the customer follows those instructions with respect to the accused
device. Thus, it is reasonable for this Court to conclude that both Peterson an& its customers would
have assembled the devices in the way set forth in both sets of Peterson’s assembly instructions.
Peterson’s direct infringement of claim 1 is established by the testimony of Messrs. Bortz and
Corrin, both corporate officers of Peterson, who testified that Peterson assembled and operated the
-infringing device for distributors so they had the opportunity to see how the item worked. (Tr., vol.
2, pg. 65-66 and 199). In addition, Peterson itself assembled and sold at least 10 G-5 devices with
a preassembled ember burner, which are the same as the G-4 except for being preassembled to
comply with ANSI regulations. Mr. Bortz testified that he was sure that the ember burmer was used
with the G-5 because Peterson preassembled it and put it together, presumably in accordance with
its own instructions. (Leslie Bortz Deposition, vol. 1, pg. 36). There has been no reasons given to
this Court why Peterson didn’t assemble these devices in accordance with its own instructions.
Thus, the record establishes direct infringement on the part of Peterson itself.

50. Direct infringement by the uitimate purchasers of claim 1 is established by the evidence that
proves that Peterson supplied all the required elements of claims 1, 15 and 17 of the *159 patent, as
wel! as installation instructions, (Defendant’s Ex. Nos. D-34 & D-30; Tr. vol. 2, pg. 177, 183), to
its ultimate purchasers. It is reasonable to conclude that these instructions were used by Peterson’s
ultimate customers to assemble the ember burner, its associated components, and connect itto a gas
source as stipulated by the parties. (Tr., vol. I, pg. 45-50). These facts provide this Court with both
direct and circumstantial evidence to find that direct infringement of claim 1 did indeed occur by
Peterson’s ultimate consumers.

51, Therefore, Blount has clearly established direct infringement on the part of Peterson and the
ultimate purchaser of claim 1 of the *159 patent.

52. Dependent claim 15 includes all of the elements of independent claim 1 plus the element that
"the open frame pan and primary elongated bumer tube is positioned under an artificial logs and
grate support means.” Literal infiingement of dependent claim 15 is particularly important because
claim 15 includes the artificial logs and the grate support means. As set forth above, Peterson also
manufactures and sells logs and other accessory items that can be sold with its G-4 or G-5 and the
ember burner, and in fact uses the ember burner to entice customers to come back and buy new logs.

(Tr., vol. 2, pg 178).
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53. Sufficient evidence exists in the record to establish that Peterson’s burner will ultimately be
positioned under an artificial logs and gratc support means. Therefore, Blount has clearly established
direct infringement on the part of Peterson and the ultimate purchaser of claim 15 of the ‘159 patent.

54. This Court further concludes that in addition to directly infringing independent claims 1 &
15 of the ‘159 patent, Peterson and the ultimate purchasers directly infringe independent claim 17
of the ‘159 patent. '

55. With the exception of a few additional elements inciuded in independent claim 17 not
included n independent claim 1, and a few elements included within independent claim 1 that are
not included within independent claim 17, claims 1 and 17 are substantially similar.

56. Independent claim 17 does not include the claim limitation of independent claim 1 that the
primary burner is in communication with a gas flow control means. Thus, this element need not be
found in Peterson’s manufactured products to find direct infringement by Peterson of independent
claim 17.

57. The first element of independent claim 17 recites: "a secondary coals burning elongated
tube," and is stmilar to the fourth element of independent claim 1. Accordingly, the discussion above
with respect to the fourth clement of independent claim I may be applied to the first element of
independent claim 17. Thus, Peterson’s manufactured products will ultimately meet the first
limitation of claim 17, which reads: “a secondary coals burning clongated tube."

58. The second element of independent claim 17 recites: "a connector means for connecting said
terminal end in communication with the secondary burner tube, the secondary burner tube positioned
substantially parallel, forward and below the primary bumer tube, the connector means having
interposed between the primary and secondary burner tubes a gas flow adjustment valve, the primary
and secondary burner tubes having a plurality of gas discharge ports, the secondary burner tube being
in gas flow communication with the primary burner tube being the connection means, gas

distribution ports of the secondary bumner tube directed away from the fireplace opening.”

59. Thus, independent claim 17 requires that the gas distribution ports of the secondary burner

‘tube be directed away from the fireplace opening.  As specifically construcd and affirmed by the

Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit, this Court previously construed the teom "directed away
from" to mean that the gas ports of the secondary bumer tube may be positioned in any direction that

does not include a horizontal component pointed toward the vertical plane of the fireplace opening.
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Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H. Peterson Co., 365 F.3d 1054, 1059-60 (Fed. Cir. 2004). Blount
presented oral testimony of Mr. Blount that the gas ports of Peterson’s manufactured products are
positioned directly doﬁm, which according to the above-referenced interpretation, are away from the
fireplace opening. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 45-50). In addition to this testimony, ﬁs Court closely observed
an assembled version of Peterson’s manufactured product’, wherein it observed the manufactured
product having the gas ports directed away from the fireplace opening. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 28). Because
Peterson believed the term "directed away from" would ultimately be construed to mean that the
ports must be directed at least partially toward the back of the fireplace, Peterson went so far as to
require the ports of its secondary bumner tube to be positioned directly downward. Given the claim
construction as construed and affirmed by the Federal Circuit, this required configuration results in
a device that meets the "directed away from" limitation of claim 17. '

60. As the other claimed elements of the second limitation of independent claim 17 have been
found in Peterson’s manufactured products, as established above with respect to paragraphs 40 thru
46, this Court finds that the evidence establishes direct infringement by Peterson and by the ultimate
purchasers of Peterson’s products of claim 17. Moreover, the evidence establishes that Peterson
itself directly infringed claim 17 when Peterson assembled the G-5 series burner systems and then
sold them to customers.

61. Therefore, this Court finds that Peterson and the ultimate purchaser directly infringed at least
claims 1, 15 and 17, as construed under paragraphs 120 thru 123 below, of the “159 patent.

LITERAL INFRINGEMENT -CONTRIBUTORY

62. Blount established at trial, through stipulation, that Robert H. Peterson Co.’s ember bumer
is intended to be attached to its G-4 series burner system or G-5 series burner system and the
combined unit comprises a primary bumer pipe, an ember pan that supports the primary burner pipe,
a secondary burner tube and a valve that controls a flow of gas between the primary bumner pipe and
the secondary bumer tube, and that an end user would connect the primary burner pipe to a gas

source having a valve associated therewith. (Joint Pretrial Order--Stipulations, pg. 6).

7 See Finding of Fact No. 38, discussed above.
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63. Peterson was made aware of the 159 patent as early as December 16, 1999, by the letter from
Mr. Tucker, which is referenced above. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 10). Given these facts, it is clear that
Peterson was aware that the combination for which its components were especially made was
patented and infringing, as required by 35 U.S.C. § 271(c).

64. Blount further established through the testimony of Mr. Bortz that Peterson’s ember bumer
ts especially adapted for use in an infringement ofthe ‘159 patent, had no substantial non-infringing
uses, and that it was intended to be used with both the G-4 and G-5 burner pans. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 67;
Leslie Bortz Deposition, vol. 1, pg. 36). Thus, the Court also finds that the testimony of Mr. Bortz -
and Mr, Cormin, as well as Mr, Blount, supports the fact that the ember burner was not a staple article
of commerce, '

65. As discussed above, this Court finds that direct infringement existed. For those units
covered by stipulation for hookup, they were normally hooked up by professional installers or
persons from the dealer. With their experience and relation to Peterson and with all of Peterson’s
literature (including Defendant’s Ex. Nos. D-34 & D-30) one can count on proper installations
pursuant to Peterson’s installation instructions as discussed above. Thus, eachinstallationultimately
results in a direct infringement. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 189). Blount has clearly proven contributory

infringement on the part of Peterson of claims 1, 15 and 17 for those units.

LITERAL INFRINGEMENT -INDUCEMENT

06. The record establishes that Peterson sold the ember burner. In addition, the record also
establishes that Peterson sold the G-4, which includes the primary burner and support pan, and sold
the G-5, ten at least of which, had the ember burner attached. Further, given the stipulation that the

ultimate assembly would be connected to a gas source, there is sufficient basis to conclude that
Peterson knew or should have known that this ultimate configuration would infringe independent
claims 1 and 17. (Joint Pretrial Order--Stipulations, pg. 6).

67. Peterson was made aware of the ‘159 patent as early as December 16, 1999, by the letter of
December 10, 1999, from Mr. Tucker, which is referenced above. (Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 10). Given
these facts, 1t is clear that Peterson was aware that the combination for which its components were

especially made was patented and infringing.
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68. The record is also clear that Peterson provided literature and assembly instructions to
consumers, as discussed above, detailing how to install the components in a preferred configuration,
which induced its customers to install the components in an infringing manner. (Tr,, vol. 2, pg. 173-
174, 177, 183; Defendant’s Ex. Nos. D-34 & D-30). Also, Péterson fully assembled and hooked up
in a fireplace an accused structure and demonstrated it and its use to independent distributors, which
this Court finds to be a substantial inducement.

69. Because Peterson provided the consumers with detailed instructions, (Defendant’s Ex. Nos.
D-34 & D-30), how to assemble the patts in an infringing manner, and given the fact that Peterson
had knowledge of the ‘159 patent by way of the notice letter of December £6, 1999, Peterson knew
or should have known that such actions would induce direct infringement. Thus, there is little doubt
and almost a certainty that the installation was in fact done in accordance with Peterson’s published
installation instructions. The demonstrations of a properly connected device to distributors further
shows inducement because this information was passed on to dealers and ultimately to assemblers
and customers. Invariably, infringement occurred. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 189).

70. As found by this Court in paragraphs 40 thru 61 above, there was direct infringement by
Peterson or its ultimate purchasers of claims 1, 15 and 17 of the *159 patent.

71. Accordingly, this Court finds that in those instances where direct infringement by Peterson
was not conclusively established on a unit by unit basis, Blount has clearly proven induced
infringement on the part of Peterson of claims 1, 15 and 17 for those units.

72. Because Peterson’s manufactured products literally infringe claims 1, 15 and 17 of the “159
patent, they infringe the patent. Thus, comparison of Peterson’s product to the remaining claims
depending from independent claim 1, whether itbe in determining direct infringement, contributory

infringement or induced infringement, is generally unnecessary and is therefore not addressed herein.

INFRINGEMENT -DOCTRINE OF EQUIVALENTS

73. Blount offered unrebutted testimony at trial that every element of Peterson’s manufactured
products perform substantially the same function in substantially the same way to obtain the same
result as the claimed elements of the ‘159 patent. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 59-60).

74. Blount further offered unrebutted testimony by Mr. Blount at trial that any difference between

Peterson’s manufactured products and the claim elements were insubstantial at best. Mr. Blount
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actually testified that they were an exact copy. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 30, 37, 46, 48, 56 and 60). In
addition, through this Court’s own observance of the accused product 4A, this Court finds that there
was a substantial equivalent of each and every element of at least claims 1, 15 and 17 in Peterson’s
accused products.

75. Based on the evidence presented to it, this Court finds that there is no prosecution history
estoppel that limits the range of equivalents regarding the claimed elements.

76. Thus, this Court finds that in those instances where literal infringement might not exist, there
is infringement of the claims of the ‘159 patent under the doctrine of equivalence.

77. In summation, this Court concludes that Blount established literal infringement (e.g., directly,
by inducement, or contributorily) or infringement under the doctrine of equivalents, each of claims

1, 15 and 17 of the ‘159 patent, by Peterson by at least a preponderance of the evidence.

DAMAGES

78. Damages have been determined using the Panduit factors. Mr. Blount testified for Blount
at trial as to the demand that existed for the product during the period in question. (Tr., vol. 1, pg.
61). Thus, Biouﬁt has conclusively established the first reqﬁired element of Panduit.®

79. In addition to establishing a demand for the patented product during the period in question,
Blount established an absence, during the period of infringement, of acceptable non-infringing
substitutes. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 63-65).

80. Peterson argued that other acceptable non-infringing substitutes exist.

81. Here the patented product offers quite unique and novel results. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 28-30). The .
so called "acceptable non-infringing substitutes” Peterson has introduced are either not acceptable,
or they too infringe, although no third party infringing device was offered by cither side.

82. Blount established at trial that Peterson’s front flame director was not an acceptable
substitute. (Tr., vol. 2, pgs. 184, 195). Peterson’s own Vice President, Mr. Corrin, testified that the
front flame director lacked the valve for adjusting the height of the front flame. Even more telling,
Mr. Corrin testified that the front flame director was not as good as their ember burner. (T, vol. 2,

pgs. 184, 195).

¥ Sec the Conclusions of Law section, paragraph 151, where the Panduit factors are set forth,
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83. As the valve to adjust the height of the front flame is one of the particular features available
only from the patented product, under the law set forth in Standard Havens, the front flame director,
lacking that valve or any adjustment means, is not an acceptable non-infringing substitute.

84, Peterson further argues that Blount admitted at trial that at least five products on the market
perform roughly the same function as Blount's patented device. (Tr., vol. 1, pg.-63)'. The record is
clear that those five products were infringing substitutes and not acceptable non-infringing
substitutes. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 63). In fact, the record indicates that Blount sent the manufactures of
those five products the identical notice of infringement letter at the same time it sent Peterson its
letter. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 63). No evidence exists in the record that the aforementioned five instances
of infringement continued after the notice of infringement letters were received. In fact, Mr.
Blount’s testimony indicates that while the other companies were moving in and were interested in
the outcome of this trial, none were still infringing after receipt of their notice of infringement letter.

(Tr., vol. L, pg. 62-64).
85. Therefore, this Court finds that Blount provided sufficient evidence to support the finding

that there were no acceptable non-infringing substitutes that could have decreased the market share
Blount and Peterson together held. Thus, Blount has conclusively established the second required
element of Panduit.

86. Blount also offered sufficient evidence through Mr. Blount’s testimony that Blount had more
than enough manufacturing and marketing capability to promote the device, thus entitling Blount to
actual damages. (Tr., vol. 1, pgs. 62, 66). Thus, Blount has conclusively established the third
required element of Panduit. -

87. Because the Panduit factors have been established, it is reasonable for this Court to infer
that the lost profits claimed were in fact caused by Peterson’s infringing sales. This Court now only
needs to determine a detailed computation of the amount of profit Blount would have made, to meet
the final required-element of Panduit.

88. In addition, however, the Court also finds that the facts of the present case establish a two-
supplier market. Blount offered evidence through the testimony of Mr. Blount that Blount and
Peterson together held approximately 95 percent or more of the market associated with ember

burners similar to that covered by the ‘159 patent. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 64). While Peterson attempted
7 to impeach Mr. Blount’s testimony on this point, this Court finds that Peterson failed to do so.
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Therefore, this Court finds that Mr. Blount'’s testimony is sufficient to establish a two supplier
market. The supposed 5 percent of the market that Blount and Peterson might not have held is
deminimus, and therefore, for damage calculations a two-supplier market has been found to exist in
this case. Therefore, causation may be inferred, that is, "but for" Peterson’s infringing activities,
Blourit would have made the sales it normally would have made.

89. To determine the actual damage amount in a lost profit case, the Court can multiply Blount’s
per unit profit times the number of infringing devices that Peterson sold.

90. To do this, however, the Court must determine the device upon which lost profits are to be
calculated.

91. Usiﬁg two different approaches, Blount has established that the device for calculating lost
profits includes the entire burner assembly (including the secondary burner and valve), thf.; grate, and
a full set of artificial logs. This Court finds that Blount ultimately lost the sale of the entire bumer
assembly (including the secondary bumner and valve), the grate, and a full set of artificial logs.

92. Dependent claim [ 5, which was established as literally infringed above, recites that the gas-
fired artificial logs and coals-burner of claim 1 are positioned under artificial logs and a grate support
means. Because the artificial logs and the grate support means are positively claimed in dependent
claim 15, the artificial logs and the grate support means should be included in the device upon which
damages for direct infringement as well as lost profits are to be calculated.

93. Accordingly, the device for calculating lost profits includes the entire burner assembly
(including the secondary bumer and valve), the grate and a full set of artificial logs, which must be
the case here, because apart from the artificial logs and grate, the coals burner unit has no purpose
or function.

94. Given the circumstances, the entire market value rule is appropriate here as an altemative,
second approach. Evidence was offered at trial by Peterson’s own officer, Mr. Corrin, that Peterson
used the ember bumer to entice customers to come back to the store to purchase newer log sets, and
at the same time, purchase Peterson’s ember burner, which improved the overall appearance of the

fireplace. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 177-79). These facts are sufficient to establish that the ember bumer is

- the basis for the customer’s demand, as set forth by TWAL, see infra.
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95. Blount also offered evidence that the glowing embers from the ember bumer are what draws
a customer’s attention to a particular log and burner set, and what ultiﬁatcly makes the sale. (Tt
vol. 1, pg. 157-63).

96. Blount also offered testimony at trial that the clcménts of independent claims 1 and 17
constitute a functional unit with the artificial logs and the grate support.

97. Blount presented a third-party witness retailer, Mr. Charlie Hanft of Atlanta, with extensive
sales experience with gas fireplaces and ember bumer and gas log sets. He testified that 97 %2
percent of the time that he sells an ember burner, he also sells an entire burner assembly and log set
with it. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 160). Peterson did not successfully rebut Blount’s evidence on this point
because Peterson presented no testimony to quantify even in a general way when the two would not
ultimately be sold together.

98. Peterson failed to rebut Blount’s evidence because it did not offer any numerical evidence
regarding how often it sells one of its Ember burners with the entirc burner and log set.

99. In surnmation of this point, Blount introduced testimony as to the standard practice in the
industry for selling tﬁc ember burner, and Peterson failed to introduce its own testimony to rebut

. Blount’s testimony.

100. Because the evidence establishes that 97 ¥ percent of the sales of the ember burner would
also encompass the sale of the entire burner assembly and log set, the record supports a proration of
the damage amount based upon this percentage.

101. Based on the record, of the 3,723 EMB’s sold by Peterson, 2 % percent (i.c., 94 EMB’s)

were sold without an associated burner assembly and log set, and the remaining 97 %2 percent (i.c.,.

3,629) were sold with an associated burner assembly and log set.

102. Blount established at trial that its profit on the ember burner alone is $14.09 per unit and
its profit on the ember bumer, entire burner assembly and full set of logs is $117.92 per unit.
(Plaintiff’s Ex. No. 18). ‘

103. This Court finds, based on the percentages and profits established in the paragraphs above,
1h;'1t the total actual damages amount to $429,256.
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. WILLFULNESS / EXCEPTIONAL CASE

104. Having carefully reviewed the record herein, the Court concludes that Peterson’s minimal
atiempt to attain a competent opinion is permeated by a lack of due care and was willful, which leads
this Court to find that the case is exceptional. Blount has established by clear and convincing
evidence that Peterson’s supposed oral opinion was an incompetent, conclusory opinion to be used
only as an illusory shield against a later charge of willfu! infringement, rather than in a good faith
attempt to avoid infringing another’s patent.

105. Throughout the 2% years from the time the first notice letter was sent, Peterson simply never
obtained a single written opinion suggesting that their commercial cmbodiment avoided
infringement. Also, the denial that the first letter refated to notice of infringement 1s shown unlikely
by Mr. Corrin’s own characterization of it as an "“infringement letter" in his correspondenée with his
patent counsel. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 192). Also, this Court finds it disingenuous for Pcterson to argue
at trial that the interrogatories answered well after suit was filed and during discovery, form the
written opinion upon which they relied.

106. The first time Peterson spoke to Mr. McLaughlin was on or about December 30, 1999,
however, Mr. McLaughlin did not have the accused infringing device at this time. (Tr., vol. 1, pg.
181). The record establishes that Mr. McLaughlin, at this time, only had a picture of the accused
infringing device. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 181). Neither did Mr. McLaughlin have the prosecution history
of the “159 patent at this time, which is an important element of any competent opinion. (Tr., vol.
1, pgs. 183, 202-03). '

107. This non-substantive conversation cannot be construed to be an opinion upon which
Peterson could reasonably rely because it was based solely on a supposition. This supposition
amounted to a representation on the part of Mr. Bortz that the invention had been around 20 to 30
years. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 55-56). Mr. McLaughlin, with only the evidence listed above, said that "if
we could prove that the invention had been around for 20 to 30 years then it would be a strong
argument of invalidity." (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 55-56, emphasis added). This "if this, then that" statement
plainly does not amount to an opinion upon which a prudent person could reasonably rely.

108. Importantly, this Court has found that Pcterson made no further efforts to determine whether
it was truly infringing or not, until after suit was filed, almost a year and two months after receiving
the first notice letter. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 202-03).
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109. Peterson argues that it did nothing further because it was awaiting "additional information
or further explanation from Blount’s attomey." This Court finds this argument lacking merit. Blount
did not, after sending multiple notice of infringement letters to Peterson under the law, owe Peterson
any obligation with regard to advising Peterson how they actually were infringing.

110. Nevertheless, Blount’s failure to respond to Peterson’s additional information request did
not relieve Peterson of its obligation to determine if it was willfully infringing the ‘159 patent.’ To
the contrary, Peterson continued its infringing activities even after May 16, 2000, and actually even
through the trial proceedings. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 181 and Peterson Company’s Objection to Golden
Blount’s Motion for Updated Damages filed on September 18-, 2002). Thisreflects an egregious and
willful disregard for the ‘159 patent. |

111. It was not until after the lawsuit was filed in January 2001 that Peterson finally became
concemned, not with the damages associated with the infringing activity, but apparently with the
attorney’s fecs that Peterson might be required to pay as a willful infriﬂgcr. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 60-62).
By Mr. Bortz® own admission, he told Mr. McLaughlin that this was not a very meaningful case
"dollar wise" but that he heard a person might have to pay attomeys” fees ifhe loses a patent lawsuit,
and he asked Mr. McLaughlin what he should do. (Tr., vol. 2, pg. 60-62 & Dec. 19, 2001, deposition
of Mr. Leslie Bortz, pg. 60). Mr. McLaughlin told him that one way that attorney’s fees could be
avoided was by obtaining an opinion. (Id). This set of facts underscores Peterson’s true intentions
with respect to its willful disregard of the 159 patent, that it was concerned more with having to pay
attorneys’ fees than it was with its own infringement. The Court finds that this constitutes an
intentional disregard for the ‘159 patent on the part of Peterson.

112. At no time when Mr. McLaughlin gave Mr. Bortz advice did Mr. McLaughlin ever see the
actual accused structure. (Tr., vol. L, pg. 181). While some advertisements of Peterson’s structure
were shown, detailed drawings were never provided at this time to Mr. McLaughlin, including the
installation instructions that were apparently sold with the device. Thus, Mr. McLaughtin never had
a full understanding of the accused structure, (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 200), and Mr. McLaughlin should have

known that his opinion would not be reasonable without such an understanding.

® See also, Finding of Fact No. 30.
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113. While Peterson argues that three oral consultations occurred, this Court finds that only one
oral opinion of counsel, if it can even be called that, was rendered. This oral opinion was rendered
by Mr. McLaughlin on or about May 1, 2001, about 4 months after suit had been filed and 2% years
after Peterson was first noticed of its infringing activity. (Tr., vol. 1, pg. 179-83).

114. This Court believes that Peterson did get what it asked for, a statement that there was no
infringement. Peterson’s primary desire, however, was to avoid paying attorneys’ fees or increased
damages, and this appcars to have been the sole reason for consultation with counsel, and these
actions show a willful and egregious disregard for the <159 patent.

115. In summary, this Court finds that Peterson had three consultations with its Attommey. All
were oral. Only the last oral consultation approached what was needed to determine infringement
and validity issues, and even it was made with a scarch limited to the company’s own recoids and
with there having been no accused structure shown the patent attomey. This third consultation
occurted a number of months after suit had been filed and was motivated by the apprehension of
Peterson having to pay attomeys’ fees, and not for a concern of infringement of the “159 patent.

116. Pcterson'srcavalicr attempt to obtain an opinion and the non-persuasive trial testimony of
Peterson’s witnesses are classic examples of conduct that clearly and convincingly demonstrates an
exceptional case, an indication of which is gross wilfulness. ‘

- 117. This Court therefore finds that the infringement of Peterson was willful, thus the actual
damages are trebled, totaling $1,287,766.

118. Given Peterson’s conduct and its overall willful disregard for the *159 patent, such an award
is appropriate here. The Court finds that as a result of Peterson’s continued infringement, without
a reasonable basis for believing that it had a right to make, use or sell its product prior to the
expiration of the ‘159 patent, Blount has been compelled to prosecute an infringement claim at great
expense. Under these circumstances, an award of attorneys’ fecs is proper in addition to the enhanced
damage award.

119. This Court thercfore finds this to be an exceptional case under 35 U.S.C. § 285, thus

rcasonable attorneys’ fees arc awarded to Blount.

25-

JT-APP 3095



CONCLUSIONS OF LAW

CrAM CONSTRUCTION

120. The parties dispute the meaning of two terms in the claims of the patent in suit, namely the
phrase “raised level,” as recited in claim 1, and the term "below" and the phrase "away from the fire
place opening,” as recited in claim 17.

121. As affinmed by the Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit in its opinion dated April 19,
2004, this Court construes that the term “at a raised level” in claim 1 refers to the top of the two
burner tubes, and that the tops of the tubes should be used to determine whether the primary burner
tﬁbc is held at a raised level with respect to the secondary bﬁrner tube as recited in claim . This
Court also construes that the term "below" in claim 17 refers to the tops of the two burner tubes, and
that the tops of the tubes should be used to determine whether the secondary bumer tube is
positioned below the primary bumer tube as recited in claim 17. Golden Blount, Inc. v. Robert H.
Petersornt Co., 365 F.3d 1054, 1059-60 (Fed. Cir. 2004).

122. As affirmed by the Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit in its opinion dated April 19,
2004, this Court construes the term “away from the fireplace opening” to mean that the gas ports
may be positioned in any direction that does not include a horizontal component pointed toward the
vertical plane of the fireplace opening. Id.

123. All the other terms in the claims at issue are construed to have a plain and ordinary meaning,
which appear not to have becen contested at trial.

VALIDITY '

124. A validity analysis begins with the presumption of validity. An issued patent is presumed
valid. 35 U.S.C. § 282.

125. An "accused infringer who raises patent invalidity as a defense bears the burden of showing
invalidity by facts supported by clear and convincing evidence." Robotic Vision Systems, Inc. v. View
Engineering, Inc., 189 F.3d 1370, 1377 (Fed. Cir. 1999); Weatherchem Corp. v. J.L. Clark, Inc., 163
F.3d 1326, 1334-35 (Fed. Cir. 1998).

126. As affirmed and determined by the Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit on April 19,
2004, this Court concludes that Peterson has failed to prove by clear and convincing evidence that
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the ‘159 patent is invalid. This Court therefore finds the ‘159 patent not to be invalid. Golden
Blount, Inc. at 1061-62.

4

LITERAL INFRINGEMENT-DIRECT

127. The claims define the metes and bounds of the invention, and only they may be infringed.
SmithKline Diagnostics, Inc. v. Helena Labs. Corp., 859 F.2d 878, 882 (Fed. Cir. 1988); Corning
Glass Works v. Sumitomo Elec. USA, Inc., 868 F.2d 1251 (Fed. Cir. 1989).

128. The patentee’s burden is to show literal infringement by a preponderance of the evidence.
Braun v, Dynamics Corp., 975 F.2d 815 (Fed. Cir. 1992).

129. A patent claim is literally infringed if the accused product or process contains each element
of the claim. Tate Access Floors v. Maxcess Techs., 222 F.3d 958, 964 (Fed. Cir. 2000); U}ziroyal,
Inc. v. Rudkin-Wiley Corp., 837 F.2d 1044, 1054 (Fed. Cir. 1988). If each element is present, litcral
infringement exists and "that is the end of it." Graver Tank v. Linde Co., 339 U.S. 605, 607, 94 L.
Ed. 1097, 70 S. Ct. 854, 1950 Dec. Comm’r Pat. 597 (1950).

130. In determining infringement, the accused product is compared to the patent claims, not the
patentee’s product. Zenith Laboratories, Inc. v. Bristol-Myers Squibb Co., 19 F.3d 1418, 1423 (Fed
Cir. 1994); Glaxo Inc. v. TorPharm Inc., 153 F.3d 1366, 1373 (Fed. Cir. 1998).

131, Infringement of a single claim is infringement, Panduit Corp. v. Dennison Mfg. Co. Inc.,
836 F.2d 1329, 1330 n.1 (Fed. Cir. 1987); Intervet Americav. Kee-Vet Laboratories, 887 F.2d 1050,
1055 (Fed. Cir. 1989), and entitles the patentee to the full panoply of statutory remedics. Intervet,
887 F.2d at 1055. -

132. If onc is arguing that proof of inducing infringement or direct infringement requires dl:recr,
as opposed to circumstantial evidence, the Federal Circuit disagrees. It is hombook law that direct
evidence of a fact is not necessary. "Circumstantial evidence is not only sufficient, but may also be
more certain, satisfying and persuasive than direct evidence." Metabolite Laboratories, Inc. v.
Laboratory Corp. of America, 370 F.3d 1354, 1365 (Fed. Cir. 2004) (citing Moleculon Research
Corp. v. CBS, Inc., 793 F2d 1261, 1272 (Fed. Cir. 1986).

133. In determining whether a product claim is infringed, the Federal Circuit has held that an

accused device may be found to infringe if it is reasonably capable of satisfying the claim limitations,
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even though it may also be capable of non-infringing modes of operation. See, Intel Corp. v. United
States Int'l Trade Comm'n, 946 F.2d 821,832, 20 USPQ2d 1161, 1171 (Fed.Cir.1991);Key Pharms.,
Inc. v. Hercon Labs. Corp., 981 F.Supp. 299, 310 (D.DcL.1997), aff'd, 161 F.3d 709, 48 UsrQ2d
1911 (Fed.Cir.1998); Huck Mfg. Co. v. Textron, Inc., 187 USPQ 388, 408 (E.D.Mich.1975) ("The

fact that a device may be used in 2 manner so as not to infringe the patent is not a defense to a claim
of infringement against a manufacturer of the device if it is also reasonably capable of a use that
infringes the patent."); ¢f. High Tech Med. Instrumentation, Inc. v. New Image Indus., Inc., 49 F.3d

1551, 1556, 33 USPQ2d 2005, 2009 (Fed.Cir.1995).
134. Circumstantial evidence of product sales and instructions indicating how to use the product
is sufficient to prove third party direct infringement. Moleculon Research Corp. v. CBS, Inc., 793
F.2d 1261, 1272 (Fed. Cir. 1986). -

135. This Court understands that in determining infringement, the accused product is compared

to the patént claims, not the patentee’s product. However, FIG. 2 of the ‘159 patent is representative

of the claims of the *159 patent and the claims may be read on the FIG. 2 structure. For this reason

a comparison of one of Blount's devices and Peterson’s manufactured product is highly instructive

for purposes of this Court’s analysis, and is, therefore, provided.

1 ! ed Devi
BF;,E['; Z;’ :1‘1?'.'; 59 P:t‘:nct": Peterson’s Manufactured Product
: Figure 2 of Peterson's Installation Instructions
without the control knob shown
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136. The findings in the sections above make out a clear case of direct infringement on all of the

devices sold,

LITERAL INFRINGEMENT-CONTRIBUTORY

137. Contributory infringement liability arises when one "sclls within the United States .. . a
component of a patented machine . . .constituting a material part of the invention, knowing the same
to be especially made or especially adapted for use in an infringement of such patent, and not a staple
article or commodity of commerce suitable for substantially noninfringing use.” 35. U.S.C. § 271(c)
(2002).

138. Thus, Blountmust show that Peterson "knew that the combination for which its components
were especially made was both patented and infringing." Preemption Devices, Inc. v. Minn. Mz’ning
& Mfg., Co., 803 F.2d 1170, 1174 (Fed. Cir. 1986).

139. Anappropriate infringement notice letter from the patentce to the accused infringer provides
the requisite knowledge required by 35 U.S.C. § 271(c). Aro Manufacturing Co., Inc. v
Convertible Top Replacement Co., 377 U.S. 476, 490 (1964).

140. Further, Blount must show that Peterson’s components have no substantially noninfringing
uses, while meeting the other elements of the statute. Alloc, Inc. v. ITC, 342 F.3d 1361, 1374 (Fed.
Cir. 2003).

141. It is not necessary for a plaintiff to make the direct infringer a party defendant in order
recover on a claim of contributory infringement. It is enough for the plaintiff to prove, by either
circumstantial or direct evidence, that a direct infringement has occurred. Amersham International
PLC v. Corning Glass Works, 618 F. Supp. 507 (D. Mich., 1985).

142, The findings in the sections above make out a clear case of Contributory infringement on

all of the devices sold.

LITERAL INFRINGEMENT -INDUCEMENT

143. In order to find Peterson liable for inducing infringement under 35 U.S.C. § 271 (b), Blount
must show that Peterson took actions that actually induced infringement. Met-Coil Sys. Corp. v.
Korners Unlimited, Inc., 803 F.2d 684, 687 (Fed. Cir. 1986) (“There can be no inducement of

- infringement without direct infringement by some party.")
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144. Further, Blount must show that Peterson knew or should have known that such actions
would induce direct infringement. Micro Chem. Inc. v. Great Plains Chem. Co., 194 F.3d 1250
(Fed. Cir. 1999). ‘ '

145. Dissemination of instructions along with sale of the product to an ultimate consumer is
sufficient to prove infringement by an inducement. Moleculon Research Corp. v. CBS, Inc., 793
F.2d 1261, 1272 (Fed. Cir. 1986). Thus, Blount has met its burden of showing infringement under
section 35 U.S.C. 271(b).

146. The findings in the sections above make out a clear case of induced infringement on all of

‘the devices sold.

INFRINGEMENT -DOCTRINE OF EQUIVALENTS

147. Infringement under the doctrine of equivalents occurs when a claimed limitation and the
accused product perform substantially the same function in substantially the same way to obtain the
same result. See Warner-Jenkinson Co. v. Hilton-Davis Chem. Co., 520 U.S. 17, 39-40, 137 L. Ed.
2d 146, 117 S. Ct. 1040 (1997).

148. Infringement under the doctrine of equivalents also requires that-any difference between the
‘claim elements at issue and the corresponding elements of the accused product be insubstantial. Id.

149. This Court finds alternatively (or cumulatively) that there was infringement under the

doctrine of equivalents.

DAMAGES
150. To recover lost profit damages, the patentee need only show causation and the factual basis
for causation between the infringement and the lost profits. Lam, Inc. v. Johns-Manville Corp., 718
F.2d 1056, 1065, 219 U.S.P.Q. 670 (Fed. Cir. 1983). A
151. To do this, Panduit established that the patent own& need only demonstrate:
D a demand for the product during the period in question;
2) an absence, during that period, of acceptable non-infringing substitutes,
3) its own manufacturing and marketing capability to meet or exploit that demand; and
4) a detailed computation of the amount of the profit it would have made.
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Panduit Corp. v. Stahlin Bros. Fibre Works, Inc., 575 F.2d 1152, 1156, 197 U.S.P.Q. 726 (6th
Cir. Mich. 1978); Radio Steel & Mfg. Co. v. MTD Prods., Inc., 788 F.2d 1554, 1555, 229 U.S.P.Q.
431 (Fed. Cir. 1986). '

152. In a two-supplier market it is reasonable to assume, provided the patent owner has the
manufacturing capabilities, that the patent owner would have made the infringer’s sales but for the
infringement. State Indus. v. Mor-Flo Indus., 883 F.2d 1573, 1578, 12 U.S.P.Q.2d 1026 (Fed. Cir.
1989).

153. The "[m]ere existence of a competing device does not make that device an acceptable
substitute.” TWM Mfg. Co., Inc. v. Dura Corp., 789 F.2d 895, 901, 229 U.S.P.Q. 525 (Fed. Cir.
1986), cert. denied. A product on the market that lacks the advantages of the patented product can
hardly be termed a substitute acceptable to the customer who wants those advantages. Standard
Havens Products, Inc. v. Gencor Industries, Inc., 953 F.2d 1360, 1373, 21 U.S.P.Q.2d 1321 (Fed.

Cir. 1991), cert. denied. ¥f purchasers are motivated to purchase because of particular features

- available only from the patented product, products without such features would most certainly not

be acceptable non-infringing substitutes. /d.

154. Also, courts have generally held that an infringer’s acceptable substitute argument is of
“limited influence" when it (the infringer] ignores those substitutes while selling the patented
invention. (Emphasis added). TWAM, 789 F.2d at 902. This is exactly what Peterson did.

155. In an alternative approach, however, the "entirc market value rule" may be used to
determine the device for calculating lost profits. In Beatrice Foods, the Court stated that the law
does not bar the inclusion of convoyed sales in an award of lost profits damages. Beatrice Foods
Co. v. New England Printing & Lithographic Co., 899 F.2d 1171, 1175, 14 U.S.P.Q.2d 1020 (Fed.
Cir. 1991).

156. The "entire market value rule” allows for the recovery of damages based on the valuc of an
entire apparatus containing several features, even though only one feature is patented. Paper
Converting Machine Co., v. Magna-Graphics, Corp., 745 F.2d 11, 33, 223 U.S.P.Q. 59t (Fed. Cir.
1984).

157. The "entire market value rule" further permits recovery of damages based on the value of
the entire apparatus containing several features, when the patent-related feature is the basis for

customer demand. See THM, 789 F.2d at 901.
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158. The “entire market value rule" is appropriate where both the patented and unpatented
components together are analogous to components of a single assembly, paits of a complete
machine, or constitute a functional unit. Sce Rite-Hite v. Kelly Co., 56 F.3d 1538, 1550, 35
U.S.P.Q.2d 1065 (Fed. Cir. 1995). ‘

WILLFULNESS / EXCEPTIONAL CASE

159. In addition to requiring "damages adequate to compensate for the infringement," Section
284 of the Patent Act authorizes a district court to "increase damages up to three times the amount
found or assessed." 35 U.S.C. § 284.

160. The Federal Circuit has interpreted this provision of Section 284 as requining.a two-step
process: "First the fact-finder must determine whether an izliﬁnger is guilty of conduct upoi: which
increased damages may be based.” Jurgens v. CBK, Ltd., 80 F.3d 1566, 1570, 38 U.S.P.Q.2d 1397
(Fed. Cir. 1996). "If so, the Court then determines, exercising its sound discretion, whether, and to
what extent, to increase the damage award given the totality of the circumstances.” /d.

161. "An act of willful infringement satisfies this culpability requirement, and is, without doubt,
sufficient to meet the first requirement to increase a compensatory damages award." /d. Thus, once
a proper willfulness finding is made, the first step in determining whether damages should be
enhanced is complete. Id. At that point, the Court need consider only whether, and to what extent,
the compensatory damages awarded by the fact finder should be increased, in light of “the
egregiousncss of the Defendant’s conduct based on all the facts and circumstances of the case." Id.

162. " A potential infringer having actual notice of another’s patent rights has an affirmative duty
of care." Spindelfabrick Suessen-Schurr, Stahlecker & Grill GmbH v. Schubert & Salzer
Maschinenfabrik Aktiengessellschaft, 829 F.2d 1075, 1084 (Fed. Cir. 1987). An act of infringement
is thus deemed willful when the infringer is aware of another’s patent and fails to exercise due care

“to avoid infringemenﬁ Electro Medical Sys., S.A. v. Cooper Life Sciences, Inc., 34 F.3d 1048, 1056
(Fed. Cir. 1994); Rolls-Royce Ltd. v. GTE Valeron Corp.,800F.2d 1101, 1109 (Fed. Cir. 1986). This
standard of care typically requires an opinion from competent patent counsel prior to engaging in any

potentially infringing activities. Underwater Devices, Inc. v. Morrison-Knudsen Co., 717F.2d 1380,

1389-90 (Fed. Cir. 1983). To establish willfulness, Blount must demonstrate by clear and convincing -
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evidence, considering the "totality of the circumstances," that Peterson willfully infringed its patent.
Electro Medical, 34 F.2d at 1056. '

163. The prosecution history of a patent in question is an important element of any competent
opinion. Underwater Devices, 717 F.2d at 1389-90.

164. A holding of willful infringement is usually sufficient to make a casc exceptional and
cﬁtit]es the opposing party to its attorney’s fees. 35 U.S.C. § 285 (2002); Avia Group Intl. Inc. v.
L.A. Gear California, Inc., 853 F.2d 1557, 1567 (Fed. Cir. 1988).

CONCLUSION

For the reasons set forth above, the Court concludes that Peterson’s manufactured products
infringe the claims of the *159 patent. Blount is entitled to actual damages from Peterson in the
amount of $429,256. The infringement of Peterson was willful, thus the actual damages are trebled,
totaling $1,287,768. Blount is also awarded prejudgment interest, which shall be calculated on a
simple rather than compound basis, on the actual damages of $429,256 at the rate of 5.0% for the
period from December 16, 1999, to August 9, 2002. This is an exceptional case under 35 U.S.C. §
285, thus reasonable attorneys’ fecs are awarded to Blount. Blount is further awarded post judgment
interest, calculated pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §1961, on the sum of the trebled damages and attorney’s
fees at the highest rate allowed by the law from the date of August 9, 2002, to April 19, 2004, and
resuming from the date of the signing of the final judgment. Based upon the fact that infringement

causes irreparable harm, an injunction is granted against Peterson.

It is so ORDERED
SIGNED: <A day of September, 2004.

JU@ %‘l;k\’ BUCHMEYER
ATES DISTRICT COURT

NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
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pFUCT O R ILTORTONAS
IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT ¥ WED
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION SEP I 7T 204
» A
[ C:.ERK, US, CTCOJ5 T
- Lx ———
GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC. § ol
§ [~
Plaintiff, §
§ Civil Action No. 3-01CVO0127-R
v. §
§ (JURY TRIAL DEMANDED)
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO. §
§
Defendant. §

DEFENDANT ROBERT H. PETERSON CO0.’S
OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFF’S APPLICATIONS FOR
ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND COSTS
INTRODUCTION

This Court lacks jurisdiction to entertain or grant either plaintif®s Application for
Attorneys’ Fees (filed September 8, 2004) or its Application for Costs (filed September 9, 2004)
because both are untimely under Rules 52(b) and 54(d), Fed.R.Civ.P.

Judgment for the plaintiff was originally entered in this case on August 9, 2002. On
April 19, 2004, that judgment was vacated by the United States Court of Appeals for the Federal
Circuit and the cause was remanded for entry of specific findings of fact and conclusions of law.
On May 11, 2004, this Court ordered both partics to simultaneously file proposed findings and
conclusions on June 10, 2004. Both parties did so. (A copy of plaintiff’s June 10 Proposed
Findings and Conclusions, hereinafter the “June 10 Findings,” is included in our Appendix as
Exhibit A).

On June 22, 2004, this Court adopted and entered defendant’s proposed findings and

conclusions. On July 6, 2004, plaintiff filed its Motion to Amend Findings and Conclusions and
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its Motion for Reconsideration or, in the Alternative, for a New Trial. The parties briefed these
motions and argued them on August 18, 2004, At the conclusion of the August 18 hearing, this
Court ordered that defendants’ findings be stricken and that plaintiffs June 10 Findings be
adopted. This verbal ruling was confirmed by a minutcrorder entered in the Court’s civil docket
on August 18, 2004 (collectively, the “August 18 Order,” a copy of which is included in our
Appendix as Exhibit B).

The Court’s August 18 Order expressly adopting plaintiff’s June 10 Findings which
completely and finally resolved all issues between ther parties within the mandate on remand,
including awarding specific treble damages ($1,287,766), attorneys’ fees ($332,349) and costs
($10,031.04). See Appendix A, p. 30. At the end of the August 18 hearing, no merits issue
remained to be decided. As such, the August 18 Order constitutes a “final judgment” within the
meaning of Rule 54(a), F.R.Civ.P. |

Because the August 18 Order resolved pending motions under Rules 52 and 59, no
separate document was required for it to become effective as a final judgment for time limitation
purposes. Rule 58(a)(1}D) (Under Rule 58, as amended effective December 1, 2002, no
separate document is required for an order disposing of a motion made under Rules 52 or 59 to
become cffective as a final judgment). Thus, the August 18 Order bécame effective as a
judgment when it was docketed on August 18, 2004. The time for appeal and for further post
trial motions ran from August 18, 2004, even if the Court contemplated the ministerial act of
later signing a written order expressly adopting the findings.

Because the plaintiff’s June 10 Findings specifically adopted on August 18 included an
award of attorneys’ fees, any subsequent motion by plaintiff to amend and increase that award

must be brought as a Rule 52(b) motion to amend existing findings within 10 days of August 18,

2 JT-APP 3105



o |
2004, This time limit, which is jurisdictional, expired on September 1, 2004. Plaintiff’s
Application for Attorneys’ Fees filed on September 8, 2004 is thus untimely.

Alternatively, if plaintiff is considered to be apblying for additional fees within the 14
day period specified by Rule 54(d)(2)(B), that period also expired on September 1, 2004. Sée
Rule 6(a), FR.Civ.P. (14 day period includes weckends; intervening Saturdays, Sundays and
holidays only excluded from time computation if the original time period is “less than Il days”).
Both plaintiff’s Application for Attorneys’ Fees and- Application for Costs are, thus, also
untimely under Rule 54(d).

On August 31, 2004, plaintiff submitted a new version of its Proposéci Findings and
Conclusions (the “August 31 Version,” a copy of which is included in our Appendix as Exhibit
C). The August 31 Version contains significant additional findings and conclusions which alter
and amend those set forth in the June 10 Findings adopted by the August 18 Order. The Court
expressly entered the August 31 Version on September 2, 2004.

It is not clear whether, in entering its September 2 order, the Court was aware that
plaintiff’s August 31 Version of the findings was materially different from plaintiff’s June 10
Findings that the Court adopted on August 18 when it made its substantive rulings. Assuming
that the Court intended on September 2, 2004, to formally enter the June 10 Findings adopted at
the August 18 hearing in the form of a separate order, the Court’s September 2 order is
insufficient to extend or restart the time limits under Rules 52, 54 and 59 because no separate
document requirement prevented the August 18 Order from becoming cffective as a final
judgment when it was initially docketed on August 18.

Had plaintiff filed a timely Rule 52(b) motion to further amend the June 10 Findings

adopted on August 18 to include the changes set forth in the August 31 Version, the Court could
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have decided such a motion after appropriate briefing and argument. The entry of such an
amended judgment would have permitted another 10 days for either party to file additional Rule
52(b) motions seeking further amendments. Absent a proper and timely Rule 52(b) motion,
however, the Court lacked jurisdiction after September 1 to supplement, amend or modify the
June 10 Findings expressly adopted on August 18.

Between August 18 and September 1, plaintiff filed no Rule 52(b) motion. The only
filing reflected on the Court’s docket sheet is the August 31 Version of the findings. This
document, however, cannot constitute a proper Rule 52(b) motion. It was not styled as a
motion. The writing did not “state with particularity the grounds” for modify;ing the June 10
Findings expressly adopted by the Court on August 18. Rule 7(b)(1), F.R.Civ.P. Moreover, the
Court did not treat this filing as a motion as to which defendant would be provided with an
opportunity to brief and argue. As such, the Court’s September 2 order cannot be regarded as an
order amending the Findings entered on August 18 and cannot have restarted the time period for
seeking further amendment.

ARGUMENT -

I THE AUGUST 18 ORDER Is A FINAL JUDGMENT FOR PURPOSES OF THE APPEAL AND
POST-TRIAL MOTION TIME PERIODS.

The federal rules define “Judgment” broadly:

“Judgment,” as used in these rules, includes a decree and any order from which an
appeal lies.

Rule 54(a), F.R.Civ.P. The Court’s oral ruling at the end of the August 18 hearing and the
August 18 Order satisfy this definition.

Finality. The key to Rule 54(a)’s definition of a judgment is appealability. Literally, any
appealable order qualifies as a judgment. The key to appealability is finality. 28 U.S.C,, §§

11291, 1295 (final decisions are appealable); Nystrom v. Trex Co., 339 F.3d 1347, 1350 (Fed.Cir.

4
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2003) (final judgment rule of 28 U.S.C. § 1291 is fully applicable to patent cases). An order is
final when it “ends litigation on the merits and leaves nothing for the court to do but execute the
judgment.” Catlin v. United States, 324 U.S. 229, 233 (1945). Accord, Moreau v. Harris
County, 158 F.3d 241, 244 (5“‘ Cir. 1998) (language calculated to conclude all claims before the
court qualifies as final); Aluminum Co. of America v. Beazer East, Inc., 124 F.3d 551, 559-62
(3™ Cir. 1997) (an order leaving nothing further to be decided by the court is final). See also
Coopers & Lybrand v. Livesay, 437 U.S. 463, 467 (1978) (ruling that makes further litigation
improbable is final).

Rule 52 leaves the Court broad discretion concerning the form of 1ts findings and
conclusions. A memorandum opinion has been held to satisfy Rule 52 when the basis for the
decision is clear. Wynn Qil Co. v. Purolator Chem. Corp., 536 F.2d 84, 85-86 (5™ Cir. 1976).
The court may also announce findings and conclusions orally from the bench. Chandler v. City
of Dallas, 958 F.2d 85, 89 (5™ Cir. 1992) (“nothing in the rule precludes verbal announcement of
findings and conclusions of law™). Rule 52 also does not prohibit a district court from adopting
one party’s proposed findings and conclusions verbatim. United States v. El Paso Natural Gas
Co., 376 U.S. 651, 656 (1964} (verbatim adoption must not be “rejected out-of-hand’). h

A final judgment must resolve all outstanding issues. Wikoff v. Vanderveld, 897 F.2d
232, 237 (7" Cir. 1990) (Minute order granting Rule 59 motion constituted final judgment: “In
our opinion, the district court intended the minute order amending the judgment to represent the
final decision in this case.””) A final judgment must specify who prevailed and what relief was
granted. Stamatakis v. J. Walter Thompson, U.S.A., Inc., 944 F.2d 382, 383 (7" Cir. 1991) (order

which “does not specify the relief to which the prevailing side is entitled” is not a final

judgment).
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By these tests, the Court’s August 18 in-court ruling and the August 18 Order
memorializing that ruling were final and appealable whgn made. The Federal Circuit’s mandate
required this Court to “find facts specially and state separately its conclusions of law.” Mandate,
Slip Opin. at 10. The August 18 Order and ruling adopting the June 10 Findings fully complied
with this directive. Rule 52 permits the Court to have adopted these Findings verbatim without
restating them in any particular form. The J ﬁnc 10 Findings resolve every issue. They provide
who is to prevail and they award specific damages, fees and costs. Appendix, Exhibit A., p. 30.
After the Court’s adopiion of these Findings, nothing remained to be decided. These are the
hallmarks of a final decision.

The “Separate Document” Requirement. Prior to the 1963 amendments to Rule 58, an
opinion or ruling by the Court containing provisions completely disposing of all claims could
constitute a final judgment. 12 MOORE’S FED. PRAC., § 58.05[1]; Republic Natural Gas Co. v.
State of Oklahoma, 334 U.S. 62, 68 (1948) (final order held immediately appealable without
waiting for a “ministerial act ... such as the entry of judgment”). The separate document
requirement added to Rule 58 in 1963 was intended to .precludc the times for appeal and post-
trial motions from running until a document scparate from the memorandum or opinion was
entered.

Since 1963, however, many courts have refused to use a mechanical application of the
separate document rule to extend these critical time limits. Bankers Trust Co. v. Mallis, 435 U.S.
381 (1978) (order granting dismissal became final when entered and time periods commenced
desp{te lack of separate document); Fright v. Preferred Research, 937 F.2d 1556, 1560-61 (11"
Cir. 1991) (no separate document required where district court amends a judgment under Rule

59); Interfirst Bank Dallas v. Federal Deposit Ins. Cor-p., 808 F.2d 1105, 1108 (5™ Cir. 1987)
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(order combining opinion and ruling on Rule 59 motion held a final judgment despite no separate
document); Kanematsu-Gosho, Ltd. v. Massiniaki Aigli, 805 F.2d 47, 49 (2™ Cir. 1986) (“a
document denominated an order can be a judgment that satisfies the separate document
requirement”). Too frequently, clerks have ignored the separate document requirement,
particularly with regard to rulings on post-trial motions. This has resulted in confusion
concerning critical time limits for further amendment or appeal after the court had entered a
dispositive order or opinion.

As a result, Rule 58 was again amended effective December 1, 2002 to prevent the
separate document requirement from delaying the running of the critical post-'lrial'motion and
appeal time periods after a ruling on a Rule 52 or Rule 59 motion. Amended rulc 58 specifically
cxempts from the separate document requirement any “order disposing of a motion ... to amend
or make additional findings of fact under Rule 52(b) ... [or] for a new trial, or to alter or amend
the judgment, under Rule 59 ...” Rule 58(a)(1), F.R.Civ.P. Plaintiff’s July 6, 2004 motions
were clearly brought under Rules 52 and 59 and thus fall squarely within the ambit of Rule
58(a)(1).!

Under Rﬁle 58(b)(1), the August 18 Order completely and finally disposing of plaintiff’s
Rule 52 and 59 motions is deemed effective as a judgment and for purposes of starting the time
clocks running when it was docketed on August 18. Rule 58(b)(1) (“judgment is entered” when
an order excused from the separate document requirement by Rule 58(a)(1) is docketed).
Because of this change in the law, the time periods for secking to amend the June 10 Findings or

to petition for further attomeys fees and costs started running (and, in this case, expired) before

! One of plaintiff's motiops specifically cited Rule 52(b). The other sought “reconsideration.” Because federal
practice recognizes no motion for reconsideration, however, plaintiff's second motion was necessarily governed by
Rule 59(c), F.R.Civ.P. St. Paul Mercury Ins. Co. v. Fair Ground Corp., 123 F.3d 336, 339 (5® Cir. 1997).
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this Court entered its order of September 2, 2004, If the September 2, 2004 order was intended
merely to be a separate document formally setting forth the Court’s ruling of August 18,
amended Rule 58(b) operates to prevent that order from extending or restarting the time periods
for secking further amendment of the Findings or from appealing them.

1I. THE COURT’S SEPTEMBER 2, 2004 ORDER Is NOT EFFECTIVE TO AMEND OR TO MAKE
ADDITIONAL FINDINGS.

To the extent that the September 2 order was intended to modify the 'June [0 Findings
expressly adopted on August 18 by entering additional findings and conclusions set forth in the
August 31 Version submitted by plaintiff, that order was ineffective to do so. Once a Court
makes findings, neither party may seek any additional or amended findings, except by a proper

Rule 52(b) motion:

On a party's motion filed no later than 10 days after entry of judgment, the court

may amend its findings—or make additional findings—and may amend the

judgment accordingly.

Rule 52(b), F.R.Civ.P. (Emphasis added).

To seek any such medification, plaintiff would héve had to have filed a proper Rule 52(b)
motion on or prior to the running of the 10 day time period on September 1, 2004. Glass v.
Seaboard Coast Line Railroad Co., 714 F.2d 1107, 1109 (11" Cir. 1983) (the 10 day time
periods for post-trial motions to amend are “jurisdictional™); Gribble v. Harris, 625 F.2d 1173,
1174 (5™ Cir. 1980) (10 day time period “cannot be extended in the discretion of the trial court™).
Here, plaintiff filed no such motion.

Rule 52(b) motions must be in writing and must “state with particularity the grounds
therefore.” Rule 7(b)(1), E.R.Civ.P.; Riley v. Northwestern Bell Telephone Co., 1 F.3d 725, 726-

27 (8™ Cir. 1993) (conclusory Rule 52(b) motion violated Rule 7(b); memorandum in support

setting forth particular arguments filed after 10 day time limit barred as untimely). The August
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'

does not itself constitute a proper Rule 52(b) motion because it fails to state in writing any
accepted reason why its modified findings should be adopted. See Fontenot v. Mesa Petroleum
Co., 791 F.2d 1207, 1219-20 (5™ Cir. 1986) (The sole purpose of a motion to amend findings “is
to correct manifest errors of law or fact or, in some limited situations, to present newly
discovered evidence”).

Plamtiff claims that the “Court requested Golden Blount to submit updated Findings of
Fact and Conclusions of Law, which were submitted on August 31, 2004.” Mem. Supp. Atty.
Fees, § 6. This Court, however, could not have properly invited plaintiff té submit either
amended or additional findings without doing so by motion as to which defendant would
necessarily have had to been permitted notice and an opportunity to be heard that plaintiff had
not satisfied the controlling standard for amending the then existing findings.

fHad the September 2, 2004, order been a decision on a proper and timely Rule 52(b)
motion to further amend the plaintiff’s findings adopted on August 18, an additional 10 days
would then have been available running from September 2 for all parties to seek further
amendment under Rule 52(b). Because no proper Rule 52(b) motion was filed before September
1, however, the court lacked jurisdiction on September 2 to further amend or to supplement the
findings adopted on August 18.

The relief which plaintiff now secks is clearly an amendment of the existing finding
awarding it aftorneys’ fees to increase that award. Because there was no proper Rule 52(b)
motion filed on or before September 1, however, that amendment is now untimely. Absent a
proper and timely Rule 52(b) motion, the Court’s September 2 order cannot have extended the

time period for making such amendments. Gribble, supra, 625 F.2d at 1174.
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CONCLUSION
For the above stated reasons, plaintiff’s Application for Attorneys’ Fees (filed September

8, 2004) and its Application for Costs (filed September 9, 2004) must both be denied as

untimely.

Dated: September 17, 2004 Respectfully submitted,

s elmg;iooszso |
JEN S&GILCH:RIST APcC. ‘PH?%’?;

1445 Ross Avenue, Suite 3200
Dallas, Texas 75202
214/855-4776 (Telephone)

214/855-4300 (Facsimile)

OF COUNSEL:

Leland W. Hutchinson, Jr.
Jennifer L. Fitzgerald

David S. Becker

FREEBORN & PETERS, LLP
311 S. Wacker Dr., Suite 3000
Chicago, Illinois 60606
312/360-6000 (Telephone)
312/360-6572 (Facsimile)
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

This certifies that a copy of the foregoing document was served by first-class mail,
postage prepaid, to counsel for Plaintiff, William D, Harris, Jr., Schultz & Associates, P.C., 5400
LBJ Freeway, One Lincoln Center, Suite 525, Dallas, Texas 75240. and Charles Gaines, Hitt
Gaines, P.C., 2435 North Central Plaza, Suite 1300, Richardson, Texas 75080, this 17th day of

September, 2004.
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\6 FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

09\ DALLAS DIVISION %

GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC., CLERY, U5 DISTRICT COURT

Deputy

Plaintiff,
Civil Action No.
V.
3-01CV0127-R
ROBERT H. PETERSON CO,,

Defendant.
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PLAINTIFF, GOLDEN BLOUNT, INC.'S
REPLY TO DEFENDANT’S OPPOSITION TO
PLAINTIFE’S APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND COSTS AND
OBJECTION TO DEFENDANT’S UNTIMELY FILING OF NOTICE OF APPEAL

Introduction

Robert H. Peterson Co., Defendant, has challenged Golden Blount, Inc.’s, Plaintiffs,
Application for Attorneys’ Fee and its Application for Costs by arguing that they were untimely filed
and that this Court lacks jurisdicti/on to change any of its findings. Contrary to Defendant’s
assertions, as explained herein, the Court does have junisdiction to enfertain and grant Plaintiff’s
application for its attorneys’ fees and costs because both were timely filed under Federal Rule of
Civil Procedure 54(d). Moreover, because there are matters remaining for the Court to rule on, and
there is no final judgement presently entered in this case, the Defendant’s Notice of Appeal is
untimely, and therefore improper. For the record, the Plaintiff objects to Defendant’s Notice of
Appeal on those grounds. In view of Defendant’s untimely Notice of Appeal, Plaintiff respectfully
requests that, upon U.S. Magistrate Judge Stickney’s determination of Plaintiff’'s pending
Application for Attomeys’ Fees and Application for Costs, that a Final Judgment be entered

pursuant to Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 58, as expeditiously as possible.
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1. The August 18 Order Is Not a Final Judgment for Purposes Of Appeal

Defendant’s position is based on the mistaken presumption that this Court entered a judgment
from which an appeal could be taken on August 18, 2004, by way of a Minute Order dated August
18, 2004. Defendant’s position is incorrect and not suppo&cd byrelevant case law. There is no final
judgement presently in this case that is sufficient to serve as a basis for an appeal.

Defendant relies on Seventh Circuit faw as support for its argument!, but since, the Northern
District of Texas is within the district of the United State Court of Appeals for the Fifth Circuit, the
law of the Fifth Circuit governs al! matters related to procedure. Accordingly, with respect to the
question of whether a Minute Order or entry can serve as a separate document for purposes of
Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 58, which is needed to comply with Federal Rule of Appeliate

' Procedure 4(a)(7), the answer lies within the purview of the Fifth Circuit. The Fifth Circuit has
specifically, and recently, addressed this point and has held that a Minute Entry (Order) on the
district court’s docket cannot constitute a separate document for the purposes of meeting the Rule
58 requirement, regardless of whether that judgment was otherwise appealable as a final order or as
aninterlocutory order. Freudensprungv. Offshore Technical Services, Inc., etal.,379F.3d 327, 336
(5th Cir. 2004). In addition, the Fifth Circuit, in Freudensprung, stated that the December 1, 2002,

amendments were made to both the Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 58 and the Federal Rule of

Appellate Procedure 4(a)(7) to resolve uncertainties concerning how Rule 4(a)(7)’s definition of

when a judgment or order is decmed “entered” interacts with the requirement in Rule 58 that to be
"effective," a judgment must be set forth on a separate document. Jd. At 334. Thus, the Fifth
Circuit, in Freudensprung, strongly affirmed that Rule 58 requires a separate document, unless it
falls into one of the specified exceptions listed in Rule 58 and that a Minute Order cannot serve as

a separate document for the purposes of Rule 58. Thus, under the law of the Fifth Circuit as it

D
"T'he Fifth Circuit’s law differs from that of the Seventh Circuit’s, which is the law on which Defendant relies
upon to support its position that the Minute Order satisfies the separate document requirement as required by Rule 58.
See, page 5 of Defendant Robert H. Peterson Co.’s Opposition to Plaintiff’s Applications For Attorneys® Fees and
Costs, citing Wikoff v. Vanderveld, 897 F.2d 232, 237 (7th Cir. 1990).

-2-
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concerns this case, there is no separate document, and there is no order that can be construed to fall
within the exceptions listed in Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 58(&)(1)(A through E).

Moreover, the Court’s actions during and following August 18, 2004, clearly reflect the
Courts intent that no final judgment had been rendered. At the conclusion of the Oral Hearing on
August 18, 2004, Judge Buchmeyer from the bench order Plaintiff "to present [the Court] with the
necessary findings and necessary final judgment...." Inasmuch as the Judge was asking that the
Plaintiff submit a final judgment, this, unquestionably, reflects the fact that the Court did not render
a final judgment on August 18, 2004. Additionally, in accordance with the Court’s bench order,
Plaintiff submitted Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law, which the Court signed on September
2. Concurrently, the Court entered an order vacating Defendant's Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law previously adopted on 6/22/04, and adopted Plaintiff's Findings of Fact and Conclusions of
Law submitted 8/31/04 (Findings), which is after Defendant’s argued final judgment date of August
18, 2004. Then, on September 16, 2004, the Court entered an Order of Reference directing matters
relating to the Plaintiff’s Application for Attorncys™ Fees and Costs to U.S. Magistrate Judge
Stickney. If the Court had truly intended that all matters before it were determined, it would not
have issued the specific bench order it did or entered Plaintiff’s Findings that it submitted to the
Court on August 31, 2004, and it would not have, sua sponte, referred matters relating to the
Plaintiff’s Application for Attorneys’ Fees and Costs to U.S. Magistrate Judge Stickney. These
actions plainly demonstrate that the Court did not intend the August 18, 2004, Minute Order to be
a final judgment.

Therefore, since there is no final judgment or order from which an appeal can be taken, the
Plaintiff’s submission of its Application of Attorneys’ Fees and its Application of Costs to the Court
on September 8 and 9, 2004, respectively, which was within ten days of the Court’s entry of the
Findings on September 2, 2004, was timely.

2. The Court’s September 2, 2004, Order is Effective

Defendant further argues that the Court’s September 2, 2004, order is not effective to amend
or make additional findings, because on August 18, 2004, the Court expressly adopted Plaintiff’s
Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law dated June 10, 2004, thus making the judgment final. As

-
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such, Defendant asserts the Court lacks jurisdiction to modify those findings on its own, and that any
modification to those findings must have been done by Plaintiff using a motion pursuant to Federal
Rule of Civil Procedure 52(b).

Defendant’s argument fails in at least two respects. First, as discussed above, under Fifth
Circuit iaw, a Minute Order is not sufficient to meet the separate document rule required by Rule
58(a). Moreover, given the Court’s actions at the end of and subsequent to the August 18, 2004,
Oral Hearing, it did not intend the August 18, 2004, Minute Order to be a final judgment. Thus,
there is no final judgment and the Court’s jurisdiction remains intact. Accordingly, the Court has
the authority and jurisdiction to change its decision in any way it chooses.

Second, Plaintiff was not obliged to file the Findings under Rule 52(b) as a motion, because
the Plaintiff submitted those Findings pursuant to an order that the Court issued frdr'n the bench on
August 18, 2004, instructing the Plaintiff, among other things, to "present [the Court] with the
necessary findings and the necessary final judgment...." The Plaintiff did nothing less than comply
with the Court’s bench order. This procedure tracks exactly what both parties did when they filed
their respective findings and conclusions on June 10, 2004, pursuant to an order of the Court and
without motion. Moreover, the Defendant had every opportunity to challenge the Court’s September
2, 2004, Findings if it wanted, but it chose not to do this. Obviously, the Court did intend the
Plaintiff to make the requested submission because Judge Buchmeyer signed those Findings on
September 2, 2004, and the Court adopted them by its order also dated September 2, 2004, Since
there is no final order or judgment in the present case, as explained above, the Court has jurisdiction

to change its findings in any way it deems proper.

Conclusion

For the reasons set forth above, Plaintiff’s Application of Attorneys’ Fees and Plaintiff’s
Application for Costs should be granted. In view of Defendant’s untimely appeal in this case, the
Plaintiff respectfully requests that U.S. Magistrate Judge Stickney consider and rule upon these

motions without delay and that a Final Judgment be entered pursuant to Federal Rule of Civil

Procedure 58, as expeditiously as possible.
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Respectfully submitted,

For Plaintiff Golden Blount, Inc.

Nl Ve

Charles W. Gaines

State Bar No. 07570580
Greg H. Parker

State Bar No. 24011301
Hitr GAINES, P.C.

2435 North Central Plaza
Suite 1300

Richardson, Texas 75080
972/480-8800 (Telephone)
972/480-8865 (Facsimile)

William D. Harris, Jr.

State Bar No. 09109000
SCHULTZ & ASSOCIATES, P.C.
5400 LBJ Freeway

One Lincoln Center, Suite 525
Dallas, Texas 75240
214/210-5940 (Telephone)
214/210-5941 (Facsimile)
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that a true copy of the enclosed Plaintiff, Golden Blount, Inc.'s Reply To
Defendant’s Opposition to Plaintiff’s Application For Attbmeys’ Fees and Costs and Objection to
Defendant’s Untimely Filing of Notice of Appeal was served on the following counsel of record on
September 23, 2004, by first class mail:

Jerry R. Selinger

Jenkens & Gilchrist _
1445 Ross Avenue, Suite 3200
Dallas, Texas 75202
214/855-4500 (Telephone)
214/855-4300 (Facsimile)

()

Charles W. Gaines
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ARGUMENT/Mr. Galine.

PROCEEDTINGS

THE COURT: Have a seat, please.

This is Civil Action 3-01-127, Golden Blount versus
Robert Peterson. We have a hearing on the Motion to Amend
Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law.

Ready to proceed with argument?

MR. GAINES: Yes, Your Honor, we are.

Your Honor, do you have any of the hearing sets
for Mr. Harrig? He 1s wondering if yvou had some of those,

THE COURT: Yes, we do. |

MR. HARRIS: How are you, judge?

THE COURT: Good. Good to see you.

MR. HARRIS: A minor thing.

MR. GAINES: May it please the court, Your Honor.

THE COURT: Yes.

MR. GAINES: First we wish to express our
appreciaticn for this court taking its time to hear these
oral arguments regarding this case. We do believe that due
to the disparate findings that exist in this case it is
imperative that the court hear and thoroughly consider these
oral arguments before entering final judgment.

Please note that I'll be happen to answer any
questions that Your Honor might have during oral arguments.

I think that it would be helpful tc just briefly

go -- since 1t has been about two and a half years, to go

JOE BELTON, C.S.R. 214-749-0431
JT-APP 3123
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ARGUMENT/Mr. Gaine.

over some background of the previous case. About two years
ago and after a two and a half day trial, we believe this
court rightfully found the defendant Robert H. Peterson
willfully infringed the '159 patent, found the case to be
exceptional and awarded damages and attorney's fees to
plaintiff in amount of about 1.7 minimum decllars. The
defendant appealed. The Federal Circuit found that the
Findings of Fact lacked detail in order to make a through
review and remanded it back to the court.

We think it's highly significant for the court to
note that in its remand the Federal Circuit affirmed this
court's claim construction, found the patent not to be
invalid and found that defendant had waived its inequitable
conduct claim. Moreover, the Federal Circuit never said that
this court's findings were wrong in any respect and it only
instructed this court to make specific factual findings.

Now by its adoption of Defendant's Findings of Fact
and Conclusions of Law, exactly the same set of facts and
based on exactly the same set of facts and evidence, this
court has now found that the defendant has not infringed the
'159 patent and awarded attorney's fees to defendant in the
amount of about half a million dollars.

Your Honor, these findings are a complete reversal
of the original judgment of this court, and the only reason

for this reversal the plaintiffs can think of at this time is

JT-
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ARGUMENT /Mr. Gaine.,

that the court has been misled by defendant's erroneous
findings and that's what we would like to present to you this
morning.

We know that a lot of time has passed and we
thought that refreshing the court's recollection on some of
the pertinent facts of the case would be very heipful and
instructive to the court in making its final judgment. But
before we get into the facts of the case, the first thing
that we want to address is defendant's attorney's fees, Your
Honor.

As plaintiff has set forth in its request for
reconsideration and subsequent reply, there are numerous
reversible errors in defendant's findings which we will
present later to this court. One of the most those notable
errors, however, and we do believe it to be reversible error
in every sense, Your Honor, is the finding that defendant is
entitled to its attorneys' fees because supposedly, plaintiff
brought a vexatious and unjustified case against defendant.
Its position is based on nothing more than the bald
conclusory finding that it should have been obvious to
plaintiff that it didn't have a case. That's the only thing
that the defendant ever argued in any of its pleadings and
that is the only finding that there is on record. There is
no evidence of any kind that has been proven or shown by

defendant.

JOE BELTON, C.S.R. 214-749-0431 JT-APP 3125
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ARGUMENT/Mr. Gainecy'

This is simply not sufficient under the law. The
case law is very clear that for an exceptional case to be
found the one that is moving for exceptional casée must prove
that case by clear and convincing evidence. And, Your Honor,
there's just simply nothing on the record that shows that the
plaintiff, Golden Blount, was vexatious or willful in any way
during these court proceedings. Defendant hasn't proven
anything along those lines. In fact, the defendant has not
pointed to any evidence to support this other than its own
conclusory statement and there's not one shred of evidence
that plaintiff acted in bad faith or was vexatious in any
respect in bringing this lawsuit.

To the contrary, we believe that plaintiff’'s
prosecution of its case was not vexatious or unjustified.
Plaintiff has never engaged in any type of unreasonable
conduct in prosecuting its case which might support an award
of attorneys' fees to defendant, and plaintiff at all times
during these proceedings, Your Honor, has been reasonable and
justified in prosecuting its case and has pressed 1its case in
the best of faith.

This is not a complicated case, Your Honor. The
accused device, as you see over here, is virtually a copy of
a commercial embodiment, both of which are covered by the
claims of patent. Just one look at it and you can tell that

there is something going on here. The defendant totally
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ARGUMENT/Mr. Gaine. '

ignored the notice letters presented to it early on and
continued its infringing activities even up through to the
time of trial.

Moreover, the c¢laim interpretation that raised the
level, and that was the issue that turned at trial, Your
Honor, whose claim construction was going to win. There were
two claim constructions that were being proffered at that
time, Your Honor, and, of course, the court held its reserve
the claim construction until the end of trial, and so the
defendant was promoting a bottoms test and we were promoting
or urging the court to adopt a tops test. Well, the Federal
Circuit found that the tops test was the test that -- that
determined whether something was raised with respect to
something else.

I'd 1like to turn the court's attention to Exhibit
D-30 which was an exhibit that was admitted into evidence by
defendant and it's further proof that plaintiff was not.
unreasonable, vexatious or unjustified in bringing and
prosecuting its case of infringement against the defendant.
This was a claim interpretation that plaintiff asserted
during trial and used as its basis for pressing its
infringement case and it continues to press that case, Your
Honor. We still believe that -- that the defendant's device
infringes the claims of the '159 patent.

And finally, this court's previous judgment was

JOE BELTON, C.S.R. 214-749-0431 JT-APP 3127
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/ ARGUMENT/Mr. Gaine.'

entirely in plaintiff's favor and that judgment was affirmed
by the Federal Circuit in part and only remanded back for
more specific findings. The fact that this court found for
Plaintiff at the end of trial i;‘clear proof that reasonable
minds could differ about whether defendant infringed. since
the court, at least at the end of trial, was thoroughly
convinced that defendant not only infringed but willfully
did so. There 'is no way that this judicial history should be
ignored in now determining whether plaintiff's casg

was vexatious or unjustified. 1In giving its history there
can only be one conclusion, Your Honor, it just simply
wasn't.

Given these facts, how could they form the basis of
an unjustified or vexatious lawsuit? There is simply no
evidence at all currently on the record that supports the
finding that defendant is entitled to its attorney's fees
and there is no other justifiable basis on which to award the
defendant its attorney’'s fees in this case. In effect, and
based on the totality of the record, the plaintiff is being
punished because it brought a justified lawsuit and defendant
is essentially being awarded for willful infringing on a
valid U.S. patent. Accordingly, Your Honor, we believe that
this finding is grossly erronecus because defendant has not
presented clear and convincing evidence, as required by law,

and a finding is not supported by the facts in this case in

JOE BELTON, C.S.R. 214-749-0431 JT-APP 3128




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

ARGUMENT/Mr. Gaine.-

any respect. They have simply produced no evidence.

Your Honor, there is one case that I would like to
just quickly point out to the court regarding what it takes
te have or what the threshold, I guess, is of a vexatious
lawsuit. And it's an unpublished opinion. It's Centex, and
we do have a copy for the court if the court is so obliged to
receive one from us. As soon as I can find it here. Sorry,
Your Honor, for the delay. As you can see I've brought one
Coo many cases up here, Your Honor.

Let me just briefly say what it was. There were
several things that the defendant was urging, said that the
plaintiff was vexatious, that they did several things wrong,
they took inconsistent claim positions. They didn't allow an
opinion to be made known to the other side. They said that
they should have given that opinion up, that they shouldn't
have taken those inconsistent claims positions. They also
argue, Your Honor, that there was inequitable conduct before
the patent office. None of those things we have here. And
yel, the Federal Circuit overruled the district court's
finding that the -- that there was an exceptional case.

Now, again, this is an unpublished opinion so I
know precedent is somewhat questionable, but I do think it is
certainly indicative of the standards that the Federal
Circuit looks at in finding an exceptional case. There has

to be something on the record, Your Honor, and there just
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ARGUMENT/Mr. Gainei,’

10

simply isn't. The